

24FQ1
PAINT AND SUPPLIES

FACT SHEET

A. **Overview:** This recommendation is to establish a contract for the purchase of paint and related supply items for the Maintenance Department.

1. **Bid Participation:**

26 bids downloaded

5 companies submitted a bid

2. **Bids were received from:**

Cultured Supply LLC (Detroit, MI)

McCormick Paints (Rockville, MD)

PPG Architectural Finishes, Inc. dba: PPG Paints (Cranberry Township, PA)

Smitty Dog Enterprises Inc. dba: Regal Paint Centers (Silver Spring, MD)

The Sherwin Williams Company (Cleveland, OH)

3. **Other Facts:**

- The initial contract period will be effective from date of award through December 31, 2025, with two additional one-year renewal options available.
- Approximately \$16,284 was spent for paint and related supplies in FY23, and approximately \$15,497 has been spent, to date, in FY24.
- This contract will be administered by Randy Connatser, Manager of Building Maintenance, Maintenance Department.

2. **Source of funding:** FY24 Approved Operating Budget and Contingent upon Board Approval of FY25 Operating Budget.

B. **Recommendation:** Staff recommends that 24FQ1, Paint and Supplies be awarded to various vendors per the attached Bid Tabulation.

C. **Action taken by the Purchasing Department of FCPS**

Approved Denied Deferred Other RM/sg

01.25.24 Date _____ Date _____ Date _____ Date

PRIMARY = YELLOW																												
SECONDARY = BLUE																												
Cultured Supply, LLC																												
McCormick Paints																												
PPG Architectural Finishes, Inc																												
Smitty Dog Enterprises, Inc dba: Regal Paint Centers																												
The Sherwin Williams Company																												
GRP	SPEC NO	ITEM DESCRIPTION	BRAND PRODUCT NAME	1 GAL/ UNIT	1 GAL PRICE	5 GAL/ UNIT	5 GAL PRICE	BRAND PRODUCT NAME	1 GAL/ UNIT	1 GAL PRICE	5 GAL/ UNIT	5 GAL PRICE	BRAND PRODUCT NAME	1 GAL/ UNIT	1 GAL PRICE	5 GAL/ UNIT	5 GAL PRICE	BRAND PRODUCT NAME	1 GAL/ UNIT	1 GAL PRICE	5 GAL/ UNIT	5 GAL PRICE	BRAND PRODUCT NAME	1 GAL/ UNIT	1 GAL PRICE	5 GAL/ UNIT	5 GAL PRICE	
INTERIOR EXTERIOR FINISHES	A	1	Vinyl Acrylic Latex Flat	OLE7100.1W	1 Gal	\$27.03	5 Gal	\$120.11	McCormick Paints 14 Series	1 Gal	\$12.99	5 Gal	\$58.25	Speedhide HT1/HT5	1 Gal	\$12.35	5 Gal	\$53.85	Benjamin Moore Ultra Spec 500 Flat	1 Gal	\$20.00	5 Gal	\$90.00	Super Paint Int Flat A86W01151	1 Gal	\$16.38	5 Gal	\$81.90
	A	2	Vinyl Acrylic Latex Semi Gloss	OLE7300.1W	1 Gal	\$31.99	5 Gal	\$151.30	McCormick Paints 11 Series	1 Gal	\$15.99	5 Gal	\$69.90	Speedhide HQ1/HQ5	1 Gal	\$15.95	5 Gal	\$71.60	Benjamin Moore Ultra Spec 500 Semi Gloss	1 Gal	\$34.67	5 Gal	\$152.07	Super Paint Int Semi-Gloss A88W01251	1 Gal	\$18.38	5 Gal	\$91.90
	A	3	Vinyl Acrylic Latex Flat Zero VOC	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	McCormick 08 Series	1 Gal	\$13.42	5 Gal	\$64.08	Speedhide HT1/HQ5	1 Gal	\$12.35	5 Gal	\$53.85	Benjamin Moore Ultra Spec 500 Flat	1 Gal	\$20.00	5 Gal	\$90.00	PRO Mar 200 0 VOC Flat B30W12651	1 Gal	\$12.56	5 Gal	\$62.80
	A	4	Vinyl Acrylic Latex Semi Gloss Zero VOC	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	McCormick 10 Series	1 Gal	\$16.45	5 Gal	\$77.99	Speedhide HQ1/HQ5	1 Gal	\$15.95	5 Gal	\$71.60	Benjamin Moore Ultra Spec 500 Semi Gloss	1 Gal	\$34.67	5 Gal	\$152.07	PRO Mar 200 0 VOC Semi-Gloss B31W02651	1 Gal	\$14.56	5 Gal	\$72.80
	A	5	Latex Paint + Primer in One Flat	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	McCormick 15 Series	1 Gal	\$17.11	5 Gal	\$76.89	Pure Performance PY1/PY5	1 Gal	\$16.95	5 Gal	\$76.80	Coronado Tough Walls Flat	1 Gal	\$27.79	5 Gal	\$133.40	Super Paint Int Flat A86W01151	1 Gal	\$16.38	5 Gal	\$81.90
	A	6	Latex Paint + Primer in One Semi-Gloss	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	McCormick 17 Series	1 Gal	\$18.65	5 Gal	\$87.89	Pure Performance OAI/OAS	1 Gal	\$18.55	5 Gal	\$84.90	Coronado Tough Walls Semi-Gloss	1 Gal	\$31.55	5 Gal	\$142.97	Super Paint Int Semi-Gloss A88W01251	1 Gal	\$18.38	5 Gal	\$91.90
	A	7	Odorless Latex Flat	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	McCormick 08 Series	1 Gal	\$13.42	5 Gal	\$64.08	Speedhide HT1/HT5	1 Gal	\$12.35	5 Gal	\$53.85	Benjamin Moore Eco Spec Flat	1 Gal	\$31.00	5 Gal	\$136.00	Superpaint Air Purifying A86W00061	1 Gal	\$17.38	5 Gal	\$86.90
	A	8	Odorless Latex Semi Gloss	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	McCormick 10 series	1 Gal	\$16.45	5 Gal	\$77.99	Speedhide HQ1/HQ5	1 Gal	\$15.95	5 Gal	\$71.60	Benjamin Moore Eco Spec Semi Gloss	1 Gal	\$43.29	5 Gal	\$191.67	Superpaint Air Purifying A88W00061	1 Gal	\$19.38	5 Gal	\$96.90
	A	9	Acrylic Semi Gloss Enamel	OLE1853.1W	1 Gal	\$45.10	5 Gal	\$222.28	McCormick 11 Series	1 Gal	\$15.99	5 Gal	\$69.90	Speedhide HQ1/HQ5	1 Gal	\$15.95	5 Gal	\$71.60	Coronado Multiply Acrylic Semi Gloss Enamel	1 Gal	\$38.00	5 Gal	No Bid	Pro Industrial Acrylic B66W00651	1 Gal	\$17.75	5 Gal	\$88.75
	A	10	Acrylic Latex House Paint-Flat	OLE5550.1W	1 Gal	\$54.57	5 Gal	\$250.24	McCormick 19 Series	1 Gal	\$18.96	5 Gal	\$87.45	Speedhide NG1/NG5	1 Gal	\$18.95	5 Gal	\$94.75	Benjamin Moore Ultra Spec Ext Flat	1 Gal	\$22.00	5 Gal	\$98.00	A-100 100% acrylic House Paint Flat A06W00151	1 Gal	\$14.16	5 Gal	\$70.80
	A	11	Acrylic Latex House Paint-Semi-Gloss	OLE5552.1W	1 Gal	\$57.66	5 Gal	\$264.01	McCormick 27 Series	1 Gal	\$19.99	5 Gal	\$93.79	Speedhide NN1/NN5	1 Gal	\$20.00	5 Gal	\$99.95	Benjamin Moore Ultra Spec Ext Gloss	1 Gal	\$41.88	5 Gal	\$194.79	A-100 100% acrylic House Paint Semi-Gloss A08W00116	1 Gal	\$16.16	5 Gal	\$80.80
	A	12	Direct To Metal - Latex - Gloss - to Include Safety Colors	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$304.81	N/A	1 Gal	\$35.98	5 Gal	No Bid	Pitt Tech PTPG1	1 Gal	\$56.15	5 Gal	No Bid	Corotech Acrylic DTM Gloss - Safety Colors	1 Gal	\$52.00	5 Gal	No Bid	DTM Acrylic B66R11038	1 Gal	\$26.75	5 Gal	\$133.75
	A	13	Direct To Metal - Latex - Gloss - to exclude Safety Colors	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	McCormick 42 Series	1 Gal	\$30.98	5 Gal	\$142.45	Pitt Tech PTPG1	1 Gal	\$56.15	5 Gal	No Bid	Corotech Acrylic DTM Gloss - Non-safety Colors	1 Gal	\$45.00	5 Gal	\$218.00	DTM Acrylic B66W01051	1 Gal	\$16.75	5 Gal	\$83.75
	A	14	Waterbased Acrylic Urethane DTM Gloss	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	McCormick 42 Series	1 Gal	\$30.98	5 Gal	\$142.45	Pitt Tech PTPG1/PTPG5	1 Gal	\$40.00	5 Gal	\$195.00	Corotech Command WB Gloss	1 Gal	\$57.39	5 Gal	No Bid	PI WB ALK UR GL EW B53W02051	1 Gal	\$18.91	5 Gal	\$94.55
	A	15	Waterbased Acrylic Urethane DTM Semi Gloss	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	McCormick 45 Series	1 Gal	\$30.98	5 Gal	\$142.45	Pitt Tech PTPG1/PTPG5	1 Gal	\$40.00	5 Gal	\$195.00	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	PI WB ALK UR SG EW B53W03151	1 Gal	\$18.91	5 Gal	\$94.55
	A	16	Waterborne Acrylic Dryfall Flat	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$112.63	McCormick 01219	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$55.29	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$56.00	Benjamin Moore Latex Dryfall Flat	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$66.00	PI WB DF B42W01181	1 Gal	\$11.38	5 Gal	\$56.90	
	A	17	Waterborne Acrylic Dry Fall Semi-Gloss	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$135.49	McCormick 01310	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$67.05	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$63.50	Benjamin Moore Latex Dryfall Semi-Gloss	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$92.00	Pro Industrial Waterborne Acrylic Dryfall B42W00083	1 Gal	\$12.38	5 Gal	\$61.90	
PRIMERS	B	1	Drywall Primer Vinyl Latex Sealer	OLE4190	1 Gal	\$25.60	5 Gal	\$105.83	McCormick 06431	1 Gal	\$11.25	5 Gal	\$48.18	Speedhide 6-2/01, 6-2/05	1 Gal	\$9.40	5 Gal	\$41.15	BM Drywall Primer	1 Gal	\$18.00	5 Gal	\$80.00	PVA Primer B28W08030	1 Gal	\$8.56	5 Gal	\$62.80
	B	2	Acrylic Enamel Undercoater	OLE50	1 Gal	\$41.68	5 Gal	\$199.50	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	Seal Grip 17-951/01, 17-951/05	1 Gal	\$19.00	5 Gal	\$97.00	BM Fast Sand Primer 0507	1 Gal	\$28.73	5 Gal	\$126.93	Premium Wall and Wood Primer B28W08111	1 Gal	\$14.56	5 Gal	\$72.80
	B	3	Vinyl Primer Sealer	OLE4190	1 Gal	\$25.60	5 Gal	\$105.83	McCormick 06431	1 Gal	\$11.25	5 Gal	\$48.18	Speedhide 6-2/01, 6-2/05	1 Gal	\$9.40	5 Gal	\$41.15	Coronado PVA Primer 100.11	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$56.37	PM 200 0 VOC B28W02600	1 Gal	\$12.56	5 Gal	\$62.80
	B	4	Stain Killer	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	Zinsser 6103550	1 Gal	\$33.00	5 Gal	\$167.27	Seal Grip Int/Ext Acrylic Sealer 17-921	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	BM Fresh Start Alkyd All Purpose Primer C085	1 Gal	\$50.44	5 Gal	\$242.57	Extreme Block Primer B51W00100	1 Gal	\$14.56	5 Gal	\$62.80
	B	5	Water-based Primer-Sealer/Stain Killer Interior/Exterior Acrylic Latex Multi-Purpose Primer	OLE50	1 Gal	\$41.68	5 Gal	\$199.50	McCormick 06460	1 Gal	\$20.39	5 Gal	\$95.92	Seal Grip UV1/UV5	1 Gal	\$17.50	5 Gal	\$79.50	BM Fresh Start High Hiding All Purpose Primer 046	1 Gal	\$33.21	5 Gal	\$159.69	QD Stain Blocking Primer Sealer B51W08670	1 Gal	\$12.56	5 Gal	\$72.80
	B	6	Universal Acrylic Metal Primer	OLE50	1 Gal	\$41.56	5 Gal	\$199.50	McCormick 06460	1 Gal	\$20.39	5 Gal	\$95.92	Seal Grip UV1/UV5	1 Gal	\$17.50	5 Gal	\$79.50	BM Multi-Purpose Primer 067	1 Gal	\$23.45	5 Gal	\$103.72	Problock Latex Primer B51W00620	1 Gal	\$14.56	5 Gal	\$72.80
	B	7	Universal Acrylic Metal Primer	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	McCormick 06449	1 Gal	\$29.21	5 Gal	\$115.89	DevFlex G40201/G40205	1 Gal	\$36.00	5 Gal	\$175.00	Corotech Acrylic Metal Primer V110	1 Gal	\$45.00	5 Gal	\$220.00	Procryl Primer B66W01310	1 Gal	\$18.56	5 Gal	\$92.80
COMMERCIAL COATINGS	C	1	Interior Penetrating Oil Wood Stain Clear Tint	N/A	1 Qt	No Bid	1 Gal	No Bid	N/A	1 Qt	\$10.29	1 Gal	No Bid	N/A	1 Qt	No Bid	1 Gal	No Bid	Old Masters Wiping Stain Natural/Tint Bs	1 Qt	\$24.30	1 Gal	No Bid	Minwax Oil 745000000	1 Qt	\$8.98	1 Gal	\$35.92
	C	2	Water-Based Wood Stain Clear Tint Base	N/A	1 Qt	No Bid	1 Gal	No Bid	N/A	1 Qt	\$18.70	1 Gal	No Bid	N/A	1 Qt	No Bid	1 Gal	No Bid	N/A	1 Qt	No Bid	1 Gal	No Bid	Minwax Latex 117200000	1 Qt	\$8.98	1 Gal	\$35.92
	C	3	Interior Waterborne Latex Polyurethane - Satin	OLE9612.99	1 Qt	\$28.54	1 Gal	\$69.68	N/A	1 Qt	\$11.98	1 Gal	No Bid	Varathane	1 Qt	No Bid	1 Gal	\$64.15	All Pro WB Poly-Satin	1 Qt	\$24.00	1 Gal	\$87.20	Minwax WB Poly 063333444	1 Qt	\$8.98	1 Gal	\$35.92
	C	4	Interior Waterborne Latex Polyurethane - Gloss	N/A	1 Qt	No Bid	1 Gal	No Bid	N/A	1 Qt	\$11.98	1 Gal	No Bid	Varathane	1 Qt	No Bid	1 Gal	\$64.15	All Pro WB Poly-Gloss	1 Qt	\$25.50	1 Gal	\$76.50	Minwax WB Poly 065554444	1 Qt	\$8.98	1 Gal	\$35.92

PRIMARY = YELLOW																													
SECONDARY = BLUE																													
				Cultured Supply, LLC				McCormick Paints				PPG Architectural Finishes, Inc				Smitty Dog Enterprises, Inc dba: Regal Paint Centers				The Sherwin Williams Company									
SPECIALTY / COMMERCIAL COATINGS	C	5	Wood and Concrete Textured Resurfacer Deck Coating	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	Flood Resurfacer FLD922/01, FLD922/05	1 Gal	\$18.50	5 Gal	\$92.50	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	Superdeck Deck and Dock SD9W00151	1 Gal	\$21.95	5 Gal	\$109.75	
	C	6	Latex Traffic Paint with Titanium Dioxide and High Solids - White	OLE6601	1 Gal	\$36.07	5 Gal	\$180.37	McCormick 01705	1 Gal	\$12.96	5 Gal	\$58.40	11-53/01, 11-53/05	1 Gal	\$19.25	5 Gal	\$96.25	INSL-X Zone Marking Paint	1 Gal	\$19.50	5 Gal	\$96.00	Propark B97WD2434	1 Gal	\$15.23	5 Gal	\$76.15	
	C	7	Latex Traffic Paint with Titanium Dioxide and High Solids - Yellow	OLE6656	1 Gal	\$37.08	5 Gal	\$185.39	N/A	1 Gal	\$19.33	5 Gal	\$90.35	11-54/01, 11-54/05	1 Gal	\$19.25	5 Gal	\$96.25	INSL-X Zone Marking Paint	1 Gal	\$19.50	5 Gal	No Bid	Propark B97YD2467	1 Gal	\$15.23	5 Gal	\$76.15	
	C	8	Latex Traffic Paint with Titanium Dioxide and High Solids - Blue	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	11-55/01, 11-55/05	1 Gal	\$23.95	5 Gal	\$119.25	INSL-X Zone Marking Paint	1 Gal	\$19.50	5 Gal	No Bid	Propark B97LD2022	1 Gal	\$15.23	5 Gal	\$76.15	
	C	9	Latex Traffic Paint with Titanium Dioxide and High Solids - Grey	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	Propark B97WD2434	1 Gal	\$15.23	5 Gal	\$76.15	
	C	10	Latex Traffic Paint with Titanium Dioxide and High Solids - Black	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	ENNX0008/01, ENNX0008/05	1 Gal	\$19.25	5 Gal	\$96.25	INSL-X Zone Marking Paint	1 Gal	\$19.50	5 Gal	\$96.00	Propark B97BD2021	1 Gal	\$15.23	5 Gal	\$76.15	
	C	11	Epoxy Wall Paint - Latex - Gloss	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	98E-1/1U, 98E-1/5U	1 Gal	\$65.50	5 Gal	\$327.50	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	PI WB Cat Epoxy B73W00311	1 Gal	\$31.95	5 Gal	\$159.75	
	C	12	Epoxy Modified Enamel	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	98E1G/1U, 98E1G/5U	1 Gal	\$65.50	5 Gal	\$327.50	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	Pre-Catalyzed Waterbased Urethane B65W01121	1 Gal	\$21.95	5 Gal	\$109.75	
	C	13	Pre-catalyzed waterborne acrylic epoxy	OLE3543.1W	1 Gal	\$66.78	5 Gal	\$325.13	N/A	1 Gal	\$29.85	5 Gal	\$129.00	Pitt Glaze RBA1/RBA5	1 Gal	\$32.00	5 Gal	\$158.00	Corotech Pre-Cat WB Epoxy	1 Gal	\$45.00	5 Gal	\$222.00	PI Precat WB Epoxy K45W01151	1 Gal	\$18.95	5 Gal	\$83.30	
	C	14	Anti-slip Epoxy Floor Paint - with Multiple Color Choices	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	Seal Krete Floor Trex	1 Gal	\$38.00	5 Gal	\$187.50	Amerlock 2-600 w/ anti-slip	1 Gal	\$88.50	5 Gal	\$342.50	Insl-x Garage Guard	1 Gal	\$123.83	5 Gal	No Bid	AS-150 08729519	1 Gal	\$64.95	5 Gal	\$324.75	
	C	15	Interior/Exterior Latex Block Filler	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$91.46	McCormick 01015	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$49.04	Speedhide 6-7	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$36.00	Ultra Spec HB Masonry Block Filler	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$70.50	Preprite Block Filler B25W00025	1 Gal	\$6.36	5 Gal	\$31.80	
	C	16	Interior/Exterior Acrylic Masonry Primer/Sealer	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$181.56	McCormick 06451	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$82.78	Permacrete WA1/WA5	1 Gal	\$26.05	5 Gal	\$125.00	Ultra Spec Masonry Sealer 100% Acrylic	1 Gal	\$19.44	5 Gal	\$83.52	Loxon Masonry Primer LX02W0050	1 Gal	\$14.56	5 Gal	\$72.80	
	C	17	Interior/Exterior ACRYLIC Block Coat	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	McCormick 01015	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$49.04	Speedhide 6-15X/05	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	\$40.00	N/A	1 Gal	No Bid	5 Gal	No Bid	Promar Filler & Finish B25W00035	1 Gal	\$8.36	5 Gal	\$41.80	
	AEROSOLS	D	1	Rust Preventative spray enamel	N/A	1 Can	No Bid	Case	No Bid	N/A	1 Can	No Bid	Case	No Bid	Rustoleum 55 Series	1 Can	\$5.10	Case	\$30.60	INSL-X Rust Preventative Gloss	1 Can	\$6.30	Case	\$37.80	Krylon Professional Enamel 000049226	1 Can	\$3.87	Case	\$23.22
		D	2	All Surface protective enamels	N/A	1 Can	No Bid	Case	No Bid	Rustoleum 591877	1 Can	\$4.99	Case	\$27.00	Rustoleum 55 Series	1 Can	\$5.10	Case	\$30.60	INSL-X Aerosol Gloss	1 Can	\$5.75	Case	\$34.50	Krylon All Surface 000049226	1 Can	\$3.87	Case	\$23.22
		D	3	Multi-Purpose Latex Primer Aerosol	N/A	1 Can	No Bid	Case	No Bid	Zinsser 1-2-3	1 Can	\$5.98	Case	\$34.50	Rustoleum 55-670/54, 55-671/54	1 Can	\$5.10	Case	\$30.60	N/A	1 Can	No Bid	Case	No Bid	C46000007	1 Can	\$3.87	Case	\$23.22
		D	4	Multi-Purpose Oil-based Spray Primer, Sealer and Stain-Blocker	N/A	1 Can	No Bid	Case	No Bid	Kilz 5910004	1 Can	\$5.41	Case	\$31.50	Rustoleum 55-31S/54	1 Can	\$5.10	Case	\$30.60	Cover Stain Spray Primer	1 Can	\$10.85	Case	No Bid	Multipurpose Oil Based Primer C45000000	1 Can	\$4.87	Case	\$29.22
D		5	Stain Sealer - Vertical Spray Can	N/A	1 Can	No Bid	Case	No Bid	Zinsser BIN 5901008	1 Can	\$11.78	Case	\$67.50	Rustoleum 55-31S/54	1 Can	\$5.10	Case	\$30.60	Covers Up Ceiling Spray	1 Can	\$12.15	Case	No Bid	C45000011	1 Can	\$4.87	Case	\$29.22	
D		6	Stripping Paint 18oz white	N/A	1 Can	No Bid	Case	No Bid	Rustoleum 5925938	1 Can	\$7.96	Case	\$87.00	PPG Group code 919	1 Can	\$9.05	Case	\$54.30	Seymour Inverted Tip White	1 Can	\$6.95	Case	No Bid	Sherliner Traffic Marking Paint White C22030007	1 Can	\$6.04	Case	\$72.48	
D		7	Stripping Paint 18oz yellow	N/A	1 Can	No Bid	Case	No Bid	Rustoleum 5925488	1 Can	\$7.96	Case	\$87.00	PPG Group Code 919	1 Can	\$9.05	Case	\$54.30	Seymour Traffic Paint Yellow	1 Can	\$4.95	Case	No Bid	Sherliner Traffic Marking Paint Yellow C22031007	1 Can	\$6.04	Case	\$72.48	
DISCOUNT OFF RETAIL						0%	0%			68%	68%					60%	60%					30%	30%			75%	75%		

24FQ1, PAINT AND SUPPLIES - GROUP E
SUMMARY OF AWARD

PRIMARY = YELLOW																		
SECONDARY = BLUE																		
GRP	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	Cultured Supply, LLC			McCormick			PPG Architectural Finishes, Inc			Smitty Dog Enterprises, Inc dba: Regal Paint Centers			The Sherwin Williams Company		
				BRAND	UNIT PRICE	MISC	BRAND	UNIT PRICE	MISC	BRAND	UNIT PRICE	MISC	BRAND	UNIT PRICE	MISC	BRAND	UNIT	MISC
E	1	Deep Trays - 7" - Metal	1	N/A	No Bid		Arroworthy	\$3.66		N/A	No Bid		N/A	No Bid		SW 4QT	\$8.03	173-5380
E	2	Deep Trays - 9" Metal	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$9.89		Wooster	\$7.30		Bestt Liebco	\$12.00		SW 4 QT	\$8.03	173-5380
E	3	Tray Liners for Metal 9" Tray, 50/Box	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$60.38	\$1.21 Each	Wooster	\$38.40	.80 Each	Bestt Liebco	\$2.00	Per Liner	5pk	\$1.44	6511-13714
E	4	Roller Frames - 4"	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$1.18		Wooster	\$3.05		Dynamic	\$1.85		SW	\$3.23	180-1505
E	5	Roller Frames - 7"	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$4.47		Wooster	\$4.60		Dynamic	\$2.55		SW	\$7.49	180-6470
E	6	Roller Frames - 9"	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$4.54		Wooster	\$4.70		Allpro	\$4.60		SW	\$3.35	180-1497
E	7	Roller Covers - 4" - 3/8" NAP	1	N/A	No Bid		Arroworthy	\$1.50		Wooster	\$3.80	2 PK	Wooster Pro Doo-Z FTP	\$2.55		SW	\$3.35	6509-70825
E	8	Roller Covers - 4" - 1/4" NAP	1	N/A	No Bid		Arroworthy	\$1.41		Wooster	\$3.35	2 PK	N/A	No Bid		SW	\$3.59	6509-21737
E	9	Roller Covers - 4" - 1/2" NAP	1	N/A	No Bid		Arroworthy	\$1.37		Wooster	\$4.05		Wooster Super Fab	\$2.75		SW	\$3.41	6509-70833
E	10	Roller Covers - 4" - 3/4" NAP	1	N/A	No Bid		Arroworthy	\$1.43		Wooster	\$3.45	2 PK	Wooster Super Fab	\$2.90		SW	\$3.65	6509-70841
E	11	Roller Covers - 7" - 3/8" NAP	1	N/A	No Bid		Arroworthy	\$2.44		Wooster	\$2.80		Wooster Super Fab	\$3.35		SW	\$3.65	6509-70858
E	12	Roller Covers - 7" - 1/4" NAP	1	N/A	No Bid		Arroworthy	\$2.19		N/A	No Bid		N/A			SW	\$3.89	6509-21760
E	13	Roller Covers - 7" - 1/2" NAP	1	N/A	No Bid		Arroworthy	\$2.14		Wooster	\$3.10		Wooster Super Fab	\$3.70		SW	\$3.89	6509-70866
E	14	Roller Covers - 7" - 3/4" NAP	1	N/A	No Bid		Arroworthy	\$3.74		Wooster	\$3.45		Wooster Super Fab	\$4.15		SW	\$4.09	6509-70874
E	15	Roller Covers - 9" - 3/8" NAP	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$2.29		Wooster	\$3.20	2 PK	Wooster Pro Doo-Z FTP	\$4.60		SW	\$4.19	6509-70882
E	16	Roller Covers - 9" - 1/4" NAP	1	N/A	No Bid		Arroworthy	\$2.29		Wooster	\$3.20	2 PK	Wooster Candy Stripe Mohair	\$5.20		SW	\$5.19	6509-21828
E	17	Roller Covers - 9" - 1/2" NAP	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$2.45		Wooster	\$3.30		Wooster Pro Doo-Z FTP	\$4.90		SW	\$4.49	6509-70890
E	18	Roller Covers - 9" - 3/4" NAP	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$2.40		Wooster	\$3.70		Wooster Super Fab	\$4.80		SW	\$5.69	6509-70916
E	19	Roller Covers - 4" - 1/2" NAP, Professional Grade	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$2.71		N/A	No Bid		N/A	No Bid		SW	\$3.41	6509-70833
E	20	Roller Covers - 4" - 3/4" NAP, Professional Grade	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$2.38		N/A	No Bid		N/A	No Bid		SW	\$3.65	6509-70841
E	21	Roller Covers - 7" - 1/2" NAP, Professional Grade	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$2.96		Wooster	\$3.25		N/A	No Bid		SW	\$3.89	6509-70866
E	22	Roller Covers - 7" - 3/4" NAP, Professional Grade	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$3.25		N/A	No Bid		Wooster Super Fab	\$4.50		SW	\$4.09	6509-70874
E	23	Roller Covers - 9" - 1/2" NAP, Professional Grade	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$2.70		Wooster	\$3.65		Wooster Super Fab	\$4.25		SW	\$4.49	6509-70890
E	24	Roller Covers - 9" - 3/8" NAP, Professional Grade	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$2.62		Wooster	\$3.40		Wooster Super Fab	\$4.10		SW	\$4.19	6509-70822
E	25	Roller Covers - 9" - 3/4" NAP, Professional Grade	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$2.98		Wooster	\$4.20		Wooster Super Fab	\$4.80		SW	\$5.69	6509-70916
E	26	Roller Covers - 9" - 1 1/4" NAP, Professional Grade	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$4.73		Wooster	\$4.60		Wooster Super Fab	\$6.15		SW	\$6.79	6509-70973
E	27	Roller Frame - 7" - Quick Clip Locking Handle (Wooster Sherlock or Approved Equal)	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$6.41		Wooster	\$6.65		Wooster Sherlock	\$5.85		SW	\$7.43	180-6470
E	28	Roller Frame - 9" - Quick Clip Locking Handle (Wooster Sherlock or Approved Equal)	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$5.68		Wooster	\$5.95		Wooster Sherlock	\$6.00		Purdy	\$11.21	6508-50589
E	29	Brushes/Oil-Straight Type-2"-Bristle-Lwst Cntrctr Grd.	1	N/A	No Bid		Arroworthy	\$3.60		PPG	\$2.70		Merit Pro China/Poly	\$4.15		SW	\$6.83	182-0570
E	30	Brushes-Latex-Straight Type-3"-Synthetic-Lwst Cntrctr Grd	1	N/A	No Bid		Merit	\$2.77		Wooster	\$13.50		Wooster Silver Tip	\$9.60		SW	\$3.17	182-0588
E	31	Brushes-Latex-Straight Type-2 1/2"-Synthetic-Lwst Cntrctr Grd	1	N/A	No Bid		Merit	\$2.38		Wooster	\$11.15		Wooster Silver Tip	\$7.65		SW	\$6.39	1022-42575
E	32	Brushes-Latex-Straight Type 2" -Synthetic-Lwst. Cntrctr Grd	1	N/A	No Bid		Merit	\$1.89		Wooster	\$9.15		Wooster Silver Tip	\$6.65		SW	\$5.39	1022-28285
E	33	Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - Straight Type - 2" Mid-grade	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$5.58		PPG	\$1.80		Wooster Silver Tip	\$6.65		SW	\$8.57	6509-21315
E	34	Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - Straight Type - 2 1/2 " Mid-grade	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$6.67		PPG	\$2.40		Wooster Silver Tip	\$7.60		SW	\$10.13	6509-21349

24FQ1, PAINT AND SUPPLIES - GROUP E
SUMMARY OF AWARD

PRIMARY = YELLOW																			
SECONDARY = BLUE																			
GRP	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	Cultured Supply, LLC			McCormick			PPG Architectural Finishes, Inc			Smitty Dog Enterprises, Inc dba: Regal Paint Centers			The Sherwin Williams Company			
				BRAND	UNIT PRICE	MISC	BRAND	UNIT PRICE	MISC	BRAND	UNIT PRICE	MISC	BRAND	UNIT PRICE	MISC	BRAND	UNIT	MISC	
E	35	Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - Straight Type - 3" Mid-grade	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$7.51		PPG	\$3.55		Wooster Silver Tip	\$9.60		SW	\$12.47	6509-21653	
E	36	Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - Angle Type - 2" Mid-grade	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$4.59		PPG	\$1.80		Nour Perfect Finish	\$6.55		SW	\$8.57	6509-21620	
E	37	Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - Angle Type - 2 1/2" Mid-grade	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$5.39		PPG	\$2.35		Nour Perfect Finish	\$8.80		SW	\$10.13	6509-21638	
E	38	Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - Angle Type - 3" Mid-grade	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$6.82		N/A	No Bid		N/A	No Bid		SW	\$12.47	6509-21646	
E	39	Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - Straight Type - 2"-Prof grade (Purdy XLGlide or equal)	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$8.08		PPG	\$6.10		Corona Tacoma	\$14.15		Purdy	\$10.25	243-3100	
E	40	Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - Straight Type - 2 1/2"-Prof grade (Purdy XLGlide or equal)	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$9.14		PPG	\$7.15		Corona Tacoma	\$18.00		Purdy	\$11.21	243-3118	
E	41	Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - Straight Type - 3"-Prof grade (Purdy XLGlide or equal)	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$11.56		PPG	\$10.85		Corona Tacoma	\$22.00		Purdy	\$13.61	243-3126	
E	42	Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle-Angel 2" Prof grade (Purdy, XLGlide, or equal)	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$8.41		PPG	\$6.00		Corona Cortez	\$16.60		Purdy	\$9.71	813-0312	
E	43	Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle-Angel 2 1/2" Prof grade (Purdy, XLGlide, or equal)	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$9.90		PPG	\$7.70		Corona Cortez	\$20.60		Purdy	\$10.97	813-6863	
E	44	Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle-Angel 3" Prof grade (Purdy, XLGlide, or equal)	1	N/A	No Bid		Wooster	\$13.02		PPG	\$11.50		Corona Cortez	\$25.60		Purdy	\$12.83	813-0320	
E	45	Rags-Painters Grade - 5 lb / box	1	N/A	No Bid		A&B Wipers	\$10.29		PPG	\$10.84		Allpro Rags	\$17.90		SW	\$10.79	594-4731	
E	46	Drop Cloths - 9' X 12' - Plastic 2 Mil	1	N/A	No Bid		Merit Pro	\$4.56		PRM	\$2.00		N/A	No Bid		Husky	\$2.69	145-2424	
E	47	Drop Cloths - 4' X 15' - Canvas 10 oz.	1	N/A	No Bid		Merit Pro	\$15.81		PPG	\$9.55		Allpro Canvas Drop Cloth	\$13.45		SW	\$15.29	998-5920	
E	48	Drop Cloths - 9' X 12' - Canvas 10 oz.	1	N/A	No Bid		Trimaco	\$17.37		PPG	\$16.60		Allpro Canvas Drop Cloth	\$22.50		SW	\$23.99	998-5912	
E	49	Drop Cloths -12' X 15' - Canvas 10 oz.	1	N/A	No Bid		Trimaco	\$29.88		PPG	\$28.15		Allpro Canvas Drop Cloth	\$37.55		SW	\$37.79	998-5938	
E	50	Drop Cloths - 4' X 15' - Butyl Rubber Backed Leak Proof	1	N/A	No Bid		Trimaco	\$13.01		PPG	\$12.75		Allpro Butyl Drop Cloth	\$18.10		SW	\$16.19	117-8888	
E	51	Drop Cloths - 9' X 12' - Butyl Rubber Backed Leak Proof	1	N/A	No Bid		Trimaco	\$22.16		PPG	\$21.95		Allpro Butyl Drop Cloth	\$31.30		SW	\$23.39	117-9019	
E	52	5 in 1 Heavy Duty Putty Knife (Purdy or Approved Equal)	1	N/A	No Bid		All pro	\$4.58		PPG	\$1.65	6 In 1 Painter Tool		Hyde Paint Tool	\$9.70		Purdy	\$7.01	6509-48359
E	53	Sealant - 100 % Silicone Rubber	1	N/A	No Bid		Dupont	\$4.43		PPG	\$5.95		Allpro Silicone	\$8.55		SW	\$5.45	909-7608	
E	54	Interior/Exterior Latex Speed Dry Caulk (Dupont or Approved Equal)	1	N/A	No Bid		Tower	\$2.08		PPG	\$2.00		Allpro Quick2Coat Caulk	\$3.60		SW	\$2.33	6508-65041	
E	55	Interior/Exterior Acrylic Elastomeric Caulk, Paint Grade	1	N/A	No Bid		Tower	\$2.29		PPG	\$2.60		Allpro Pro Stretch Caulk	\$4.85		SW	\$2.75	101-0586	
E	56	lightweight Setting-Type Joint Compound - Easy Sand 5 18LB	1	N/A	No Bid		USG	\$12.25		USG	\$11.99		USG	\$13.00		USG	\$11.93	162-3040	
E	57	lightweight Setting-Type Joint Compound - Easy Sand 20 18LB	1	N/A	No Bid		USG	\$12.25		USG	\$11.99		USG	\$13.00		USG	\$11.93	154-5052	
E	58	lightweight Setting-Type Joint Compound - Easy Sand 45 18LB	1	N/A	No Bid		USG	\$12.25		USG	\$11.99		USG	\$13.00		USG	\$11.93	154-5060	
E	59	lightweight Setting-Type Joint Compound - Easy Sand 90 18LB	1	N/A	No Bid		USG	\$12.25		USG	\$11.99		USG	\$13.00		USG	\$11.93	154-4329	
E	60	Lightweight Ready Mixed All Purpose Joint Compound - Plus 3™ 4 1/2 Gal	1	N/A	No Bid		USG	\$19.42		USG	\$22.35		USG	\$7.35		USG	\$17.87	123-0044	
E	61	Midweight Ready Mixed Joint Compound - Ready Mixed 4 1/2 Gal	1	N/A	No Bid		USG	\$23.17		USG	\$22.85		N/A	No Bid		USG	\$17.87	451-5698	
E	62	Plastic pail high density polythylene with steel handle and plastic grip 1 Gal	1	N/A	No Bid		Leaktite	\$2.96		PPG	\$5.319		Encore 1 Gallon Plastic Bucket	\$5.15		SW	\$3.15	105-5490	

24FQ1, PAINT AND SUPPLIES - GROUP E
SUMMARY OF AWARD

PRIMARY = YELLOW																		
SECONDARY = BLUE																		
				Cultured Supply, LLC			McCormick			PPG Architectural Finishes, Inc			Smitty Dog Enterprises, Inc dba: Regal Paint Centers			The Sherwin Williams Company		
GRP	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	BRAND	UNIT PRICE	MISC	BRAND	UNIT PRICE	MISC	BRAND	UNIT PRICE	MISC	BRAND	UNIT PRICE	MISC	BRAND	UNIT	MISC
E	63	Plastic pail high density polythylene with steel handle and plastic grip 2 Gal	1	N/A	No Bid		Leaktite	\$2.20		PPG	\$3.50		N/A			SW	\$4.50	160-8769
E	64	Painters Tape - Blue - 36mm x 60 yard" (Blue Shur or Approved equal)	1	N/A	No Bid		Shur Tape	\$5.27		MMM	\$5.30		3M 2090 Blue Tape	\$3.50		3M	\$6.17	965-8337
DISCOUNT OFF RETAIL:								64%			25%			30%			40%	