BID 24M2

UNIT PRICE CONTRACT FOR EXCAVATION AND EARTHWORKS/STORM WATER MAINTENANCE

FACT SHEET

A. Overview: This recommendation is to establish a contract for the excavation and backfill repair of site work at
various locations within Frederick County Public Schools. Bids were opened on September 27, 2023.

1. Bid participation:

40 bids downloaded
8 companies submitted a bid

2. Bids were received from:

Greenridge Contractors, Inc. (Hagerstown, MD)
Highland Turf, Inc. dba: HTI Contractors (Finksburg, MD)
Poole & Sons Excavating, Inc. (Middletown, MD)
Stormwater Maintenance, LLC dba: SMC (Sparks, MD)
Stratified, Inc. (Washington, DC)

Triangle Contracting, LLC (Frederick, MD)

Wagner’s Construction (Frederick, MD)

Walker Willis Corporation (Sandy Spring, MD)

3. Other facts:

The contract term will be effective from the date of award through November 30, 2025, with two
additional two-year renewal options available.

Walker Willis Corporation used the incorrect Form of Proposal and was excluded from evaluation.
All pricing will remain firm throughout the contract term.
Approximately $115,208 was spent in FY22 and approximately $189,193 was spent in FY23.

This contract will be administered by Tony Ray, Project Manager lll, Capital Programs Department.

4. Source of funding: FY24 Approved Operating Budget and contingent upon Board approval of FY25 and
FY26 Operating Budgets.

B. Recommendation: Staff recommends that Bid 24M2, Unit Price Contract for Excavation and Earth
Works/Storm Water Maintenance, be awarded to Wagner’s Construction, per the attached bid tabulation.

C. Action taken by the Board (Purchasing use only):

__X_Approved Denied Deferred Other DG/sg

10.25.23 Date Date Date Date BOE Mtg.: 10.25.23



BID 24M2, UNIT PRICE CONTRACT FOR EXCAVATION AND

EARTHWORKS/STORMWATER MAINTENANCE

BID TABULATION

Greenridge Contractors, Inc. Highland Turf Inc. dba: HTI Contractors Poole & Sons Excavating Inc Stormwater Maintenance, LLC dba: SMC Stratified, Inc Triangle Contracting, LLC Wagner's Construction
# Services/Materials Specified aty unit | ServiceMaterials |\, it pice Total ServicelMaterials | it price Total ServicelMaterlals | iy price Total ServicelMaterials | iy price Total ServicelMaterials | it price Total ServicelMaterials | oyt price Total ServicelMaterials | it price Total
Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed
1_|Excavator, track mounted, Caterpillar 235 or equal 30 hour Case 245 s 120005 360000 assvecfied | $ 15000 § 450000 | assoeciied | S 12500 |5 375000 | assvechied |S 31470 | 5 9.441.00 as svecified | § 375.00 | § 11.25000 assoecfied |§ 13500 ]S 4.050.00 Cat 320 $  10500]$  3.15000
Hoepack (compactoriroller) track mounted, Caterpillar
2235 or eaual 2 hour Case 245 s 125005 312500 assvecified | $ 14000/ § 350000 | assvecified |5 11500 |5 287500 | assoechied | 35270 | 8 8.817.50 as svecified | § 450.00 | § 11.250.00 assoecfied |§ 14000 ]S 3.500.00 $  11000]S 275000
3_|Backhoe. rubber tire. John Deere 410 or equal 2 hour asspecified [ $ 11000 [$ 275000 asspecified | §  125.00{ § 312500 | assoacified |$ 7500 $ 167500 | asseciied | 334258 8.356.25 as specified | § 90008 225000 as specified | § 90008 225000 as specified | § 7000 |$ 175000
Skid Loader with attachments: loader bucket, york rake,
street broom, rockhound, Case #1854C with
4_|attach listed 10 hour as specified | § 9750 |8 97500 assvecfied | $ 11000 § 110000 | assoecified |S 75005 75000 | assvechied | 159.05 | 8 1.690.50 as svecified | § 7500 ]S 750.00 as soecified | § 8500|S 85000 Bobcatt300 | § 6000|S  600.00
5_[Vibratory roller. 10 ton. smooth drum 10 hour as speciied [ § 6750 |8 67500 asspecified | §  100.00] 100000 assoacified |8 7500 [s 75000 | asspecied |$ 9555 955.50 as specified | § 12500 8 1.250.00 as soecified | § 80008 80000 as specified | § 6000[S 60000
6 815 Caterpillar compactor 2 hour Bomaa 213D | '§ 7250 |8 174000 assvecified | $ 12500/ §  300000| assoecified |S 95005 228000 | assoechied | 24070 | 8 5.776.80 as svecified | § 500.00 | $ 12.000.00 assoecfied |§ 10000 ]S  2.400.00 asspeciied | § 900]S 216000
7_[Dump truck. tandem 40 hour asspecified  [$ 10900 [$  4.360.00 asspecified | S 90.00] 8 360000 assoacified |8 7500 [s 300000 | asspechied |$ 106.55 [ 8 4.262.00 s soecified | § 8000 [$  4.000.00 assoecfied [$ 10000 |$  4.000.00 as specified | § 6000 [S 240000
Trucking Cost for equipment mobilization (1 hr. max per
7A_|move) 10 hour asspecified | $ 80000 |$  8.000.00 asspecified | § 45000/ § 450000 | assoecified | $ 15000 |$  1.50000 | assecified | 698.10 | § 6.981.00 as specified | § 35000 | $  3.500.00 assoecfied |$ 11500 |$  1.150.00 as specified | § 7500 |$ 75000
8 _|Loader, Track Mounted. Caterpillar #953 or equal 30 hour as specified |8 145001 $ 435000 as specified | $ 125000 8 375000 ] __assoacified |8 950018 2.850.00] _asspecied S 2232518 6.697.50 as soecified | $ 150.00 | 8 4.500.00 s soecified ] $ 105008 3.150.00 as specified | § 8500 |S 255000
9 |Rock. ip rap.
9.1 [Class I ip rap - delivered to site in place 20 ton asspeciied | § 3400 ]S 680.00 asspecified | S 4000/ 8 800.00 | assoacified |$ 4250 |5 85000 | asseciied |$ 50758 1.015.00 as specified | § 8000 |  1.600.00 as soecified | § 5000 |8 1.000.00 as specified | § 3300[s 66000
9.2 [Class Il rip rap - delivered to site in place 80 ton as specified | § 37.00 s 296000 assvecfied |8  5000] 5 400000] assoeciied |S 6000 |5 480000 | assoechied |s 5665 |8 4532.00 as svecified | § 9000]$ 7.200.00 as soecified | § 6000 |S  4.800.00 assoeciied | § 3000|§ 312000
10_|Maryland #7 clean stone - delivered to site in place. 20 ton asspecified | 2325 |S 46500 asspecified | S 2750/ 8 55000 | assoecified |$ 2000 58000 | assecied | 36908 738.00 as specified | § 6000 |$  1.200.00 as soecified | § 3250 |8 65000 as specified | § 250018 50000
11_|Stone #2 - delivered to site 60 ton as specified | § 2125 |s 127500 assvecfied | $ 2500 5 150000| assoecified |S 20005 174000 | assvecied | 36908 2214.00 as svecified | § 6000 | S 3.600.00 as soecified | § 35008 210000 asspeciied | § 2300|S 138000
12_|Stone. CRS - delivered to site. 40 ton asspecified [ § 1400 [$  560.00 asspecified | S 2200[ 8 880.00 | assoacified |$ 2500 [S  1.00000 | asspecfied |§ 27358 1.094.00 as specified | § 4000 |§ 1.600.00 as soecified | § 3500 |8 1.400.00 as specified | § 1920 (8 768.00
132500 1b. Concrete @ 28 davs - delivered to site 32 vard asspecified | § 15400 |5 524800 assvecfied | $ 21600 § 691200 | as soecified NOBID | NOBID as svecified | § 26890 | § 8.604.80 as svecified | § 25000 | §  8.000.00 assoecfied |§ 32600 ]S  10.400.00 assoecified |$ 15050 | $  4.816.00
Filter fabric - TYPAR Nonwoven Geotexiles 3601 or
143801 diles EX 180 or EX 226 30 5q.yd. asspecified | 115 |8 3450 as specified s 200] s 6000 | assoecified | § 130 | 8 3900 | asspeciied | 150 |8 45.00 as specified | § 125]8  37.50 as soecified | § 100 |8 30.00 as specified | § 1308 39.00
Lease of temporary panels, chain link fence 12 ft. long x
15 |61t hiah 18 month asspecified | § 2500 |S 45000 asspecified | S 8850] §  1503.00 | as soecified NOBID | NOBID as specified | § 45000 | § 8.100.00 as specified | § 100.00 | $  1.800.00 as soecified | § 7500 |8 1.350.00 as specified | § 8000 |S 144000
Grass seed, 5 t0 8 Ibs. Per 1000 sq. ft., Tall Fescue
16_| (Maryland Certfied Seed) 200 5q.yd. asspecified | 085S 17000 as specified s 1.00]|$ 20000 | assoecfied |$ 1008 20000| assoeciied | 0158 30.00 as specified | § 5008 1.00000 as soecified | § 325|$  650.00 as specified | § 080|$ 16000
17_|Straw Mulch at 2 tons per anchor crimp to top soil 200 s.vd. as specified | § 0855 17000 as svecified | § 1.00| 8 20000 | assoecfied |s 1008 20000| assoeciied [ 02 s 50.00 as svecified | § 500 S 1.00000 assoecified | § 07518 150.00 asspeciied | § 080]S 16000
18_|Screened top soil 3% cu.vd. as specified | § 4000 |s  1.440.00 assvecfied | $ 3000/ 5 108000| assoecified |S 60005 216000 | assoechied | 5425 1.953.00 as svecified | § 10000 | §  3.60000 assoecified | § 5500 1S 1.980.00 assoeciied | § 2800|S  1.00800
19 | Additional labor 120 man hours s 4000 | $_4.800.00 s 45001 S 540000 s 500008 6000.00 s 681515 8.178.00 s 65.00 | S 7.800.00 s 50001 S 6.000.00 s 6800 |S 816000
20_|Disposal of debris. excavated rack or excess soil
20.1 |Rate per ton 20 ton s 117.00|S 234000 S 1000]S 20000 S 10000 ]S 220000 NO BID. NOBID. s 20000 | $  4.000.00 $ 15500 |8  3.100.00 S 11000]$ 220000
20.2 | Contractor disposable per vard 48 cu. vd. asspecified | 2500 |$  1.200.00 asspecified | S 2000/ 8 960.00| assoecified |$ 2000 96000 | assecified | 50758 2.436.00 s specified | § 20000 | $  9.600.00 as soecified | § 80008  3.840.00 as specified | § 19008 91200
21_[import Structural fil 105 Ib. per cu. ft. (iess than 500) less than 500 cu.vd. as specified | § 1250 | 8 12.50 assvecied |$  3000] § 3000 assvecified |s 25008 2500 | assvecied | 4485 4485 as svecified | § 750018 7500 as soecified | § 45008 45.00 assoecified | § 11.00 | § 11.00
21_|Import Structural fil 105 Ib. per cu. ft. (Over 500) over 500 cu.vd. asspecified | § 1250 | 12.50 asspecified | S 30.00] 8 3000) assoecfied |$ 24008 2400 | asspecified | 44858 4485 as soecified | § 70008 7000 as soecified | § 45008 45.00 as specified | § 11.00 | 8 11.00
22_|Silt Fence per ft. - installed (Less than 150) less than 150 . asspecified | § 345]s 345 as specified s 300] s 300 | assoecied | $ 4258 425| assoecified | $ 505]8 505 as specified | § 4508 450 as specified | § 5008 500 as specified | § 33518 335
22 |Sit Fence per ft. - installed (Over 150) over 150 3 as specified | § 320]s 320 assvecified | § 300] s 300 ] assoeciied |S 420]s 420  assvecified |s 505]s 505 as svecified | § 350 |8 3.50 as soecified | § 500]8 5.00 assoeciied | § 320]8 320
22.1 | Super Silt Fence per ft. - installed (Less than 150) less than 150 . asspeciied | § 1050 |§ 10.50 asspecified | $  15.00] § 1500 | assecied |$ 1500 |8 1500 | assoeciied [ $ 1520 | 8 15.20 as specified | § 9008 9.00 as soecified | § 16.00 | 8 16.00 as specified | § 1000 [ 8 10.00
22.1 | Super Silt Fence per ft. - installed (Over 150) over 150 3 as specified | § 1050 | 5 10.50 assvecied |$  1500] § 1500 | assoecfied |S  1475]s 1475 | assoeciied | s 1520 | 8 15.20 as svecified | § 800§ 8.00 as soecified | § 16.00 | $ 16,00 assoeciied | § 1000 | $ 10,00
22.2 |Inca Matting (Less than 150) less than 150 sa.ft. asspecified | § 125 [ 8 125 as specified s 300] s 300 | assoecied | $ 175 |8 1.75] assoeciied |$ 0758 075 as specified | § 2008 200 as soecified | § 2008 200 as specified | § 120 |8 1.20
222 [Inca Mattina (Over 150 over 150 sa.ft. as specified | § 1258 125 as sveciied | § 3.00] s 300] assveciied |$ 170 170 | assoeciied [s 075 s 075 as svecified | § 190 [ s 1.90 assoecified | § 2008 200 asspeciied | § 1.05]8 1.05
223 | Curlex_Type 2(Less than 150) less than 150 sa.ft. asspeciied | § 025]8§ 025 as specified s 300] s 300 | assoecied | $ 0658 065| assoecified | $ 0158 015 as specified | § 1.00]8 1.00 as soecified | § 0758 075 as specified | § 085]8 085
223 | Curlex Tvpe 2(Over 1501 over 150 sa.ft as specified | s 02515 025 as soecified | § 2505 250 | _as soecified | § 05515 055 | _as soecified | § 01515 015 as soecified | § 07515 075 as soecified 1§ 07515 0.75 assoecified | § 08018 080
“Class 54 Ductile Iron Pipe is the only acceptable class for use in Frederick County. The.
unit price offered is for this class of pipe only."
23_|4" Ductile Iron Pipe - installed & restrained less than 100 . asspecified | § 79728 79.72 asspecified | S 6650] § 6650 | assoecfied |$  7500|$ 7500 | asspeciied | $ 85658 8565 as specified | § 15000 |8 15000 assoecfied | $ 10500 |§ 105.00 as specified | § 70008 70.00
23.1 | 4" Ductile Iron Pipe - installed & restrained over 100 [ as specified | § 7972 |8 79.72 assvecied |$  6650] § 6650 | assoecified |S  7400|s 7400 | assveciied | 8565 |5 8565 as svecified | § 10000 [$ 10000 assoecified | § 95008 95.00 assoeciied | § 69008 69.00
232 |4" Ductile Iron Bend - installed & restrained 2 cach asspecified | $ 26200 |8 524.00 asspecified | §  477.00/ 8 95400 | assoacified | $ 85000 | 170000 | assecfied | 15645 | 8 31290 assoecfied | $ 320000 | S 6.400.00 assoecfied | $ 65000 |$  1.300.00 asspecified  |$ 76000 [ 8 1.520.00
233 | 4" Ductile Iron Valve installed & restrained 1 each asspecified | § 172000 |8 1.720.00 assvecfied | § 1583.50| 5 158350 | assvecified | S 2750005 275000 | assoecied |S 1027758 1.027.75 assoecfied | 350000 [ S 3.50000 assoecfied |$ 150000 ]S  1.500.00 assoecified |§ 200000 [$  2.000.00
24_|6" Ductile Iron Pipe - installed & restrained less than 150 . asspeciied | § 7400 | 74.00 asspecified | S 65.00] 8 5500 | assoecfied [$ 75008 7500 | asspeciied | 7920 |8 79.20 as specified | § 20000 |8 200.00 assoecfied |$ 11000 ]§ 110.00 as specified | § 70008 70.00
24.1 |6" Ductile Iron Pipe - installed & restrained over 150 3 as specified | § 7400 |5 74.00 assvecified |$  5500] § 5500 ) assvecified |S  7200|$ 7200 | assvecied | 7920 |8 79.20 as svecified | § 17500 |8 17500 assoecfied |§  10500]§ 105.00 assoeciied | § 6900 69.00
242 |6" Ductile Iron Bend installed & restrained 2 cach asspecified | $ 36600 |$ 73200 asspecified | §  547.00| §  1.094.00| assoecified | $ 85000 |5 170000 | assecied | 229308 458.60 assoecfied |$ 400000 |$ 800000 assoecfied | $ 89500 |8 1.790.00 asspecified |$  800.00 [ 8 1.600.00
24.3 6" Ductile Iron Valve installed & restrained 1 each asspecified |8 214300 |8 2.143.00 assvecfied | §  1884.00| 5 188400 | assvecied | S 250000 |5 250000 | assoecied | S 130985 |8 1.300.85 assoecfied |§ 450000 [S  4.600.00 assoecfied [§ 225000 |§  2.250.00 assoecified | 230800 |5 2.308.00
24.4 |6" Ductile Iron Fire Hvdrant installed witee & restrained 1 each asspecified | § 687300 |5 6.873.00 assvecfied | $ 5780.00| 5 578000 | assveciied | S 6200005 620000 assoecied |S 536375 |8 5.363.75 assoecfied | 0.00000 | S 9.00000 assoecfied | §  9.00000|S  9.000.00 assoecified | $ 550000 [ S 5500.00
24.5 |6" wet tappina sleave installed 1 cach asspecified | $ 585000 | $ 585000 asspecified | § 238500 § 238500 | assoecied | S 6000005 6.00000| assoecied |$ 328440 |8 3.284.40 assoecfied | $  11.000.00 | $ 11.000.00 assoecfied | $ 550000 |$ 550000 as specified 390000 | S 3.900.00
8" Ductie Iron Pipe - installed & restrained (Less than
25 [150) less than 150 . asspecified | $ 10300 |$  103.00 asspecified | S 7675] 8 7675 ) assoecfied |$  7500|$ 7500 | asspecified | S 104.35 | 8 104.35 as specified | § 30000 |8 300.00 assoecfied | $ 18500 S 185.00 as specified | § 70008 70.00
25.1 |8 Ductile Iron Pipe - installed & restrained (Over 150) over 150 . asspecified | $ 10300 |$  103.00 asspecified | S 7675] 8 7675) assoecfied |$  7400|$ 7400 | asspecified | S 104.35 | 104.35 as specified | § 27500 |8 27500 assoecfied | $ 18000 S 180.00 as specified | § 6900 S 69.00
252 |8" Ductile Iron Bend installed & restrained 2 cach asspecified | $ 51500 |$  1.030.00 asspecified | § 65650 §  1313.00 | assoacified | $ 950008  1.90000 | asspecied | 32420 |8 648.40 assoecfied | $ 600000 | $ 12.000.00 assoecfied | $ 120000 | 2.400.00 asspecified |$  900.00 [ 1.800.00
253 |8 Ductile Iron Valve - installed & restrained 1 cach asspecified | $ 324800 | $ 324800 asspecified | § 271200 8 271200| assoecied | $ 372000 s 372000| assoecied |$ 206535 |8 2.065.35 assoecfied | $  7.00000 |  7.000.00 assoecfied | $ 300000 |$  3.000.00 asspecified | $ 300000 [$  3.000.00
25.4 | 8'x6"x8" wet tappina sleave installed 1 each asspecified | § 641200 |5 641200 assvecified | $ 323200] § 323200| assvecified | S 150000 |5 150000 | assoecied |S 3618058 3.618.05 assoecfied | 15.00000 | $ 15.000.00 assoecfied | § 450000 ]S 4.500.00 assoecified | 220000 [ S 2.200.00
10" Ductile Iron Pipe - installed & restrained (Less than
26 [150) less than 150 3 asspecified | § 13400 |5 13400 assvecied |$  9675] s 9675 ) assoecified |S  8400|S 8400 | assvecied | 127.90 | 8 127.90 as svecified | § 40000 | 400.00 assoecfied | § 40000 ]S 400.00 asseciied | § 8500]§ 85.00
26.1 | 10" Ductile Iron Pibe - installed & restrained (Over 150) over 150 3 asspecified | § 13400 S 13400 assvecied |$  9675] § 9675 assvecified |S  8300|s 8300 | assvecied | 127.90 | 8 127.90 as svecified | § 47500 | 475.00 assoecfied |§  30000]S 30000 asseciied | § 8400|§ 84.00
262 | 10" Ductile Iron Bend installed & restrained 2 each asspecified | § 75800 | S 151600 assvecfied | $ 96000/ § 192000 | assoeciied | S 110000 | § 220000 | assoechied | 49630 | § 99260 assoecfied | 7.500.00 | $ 15.000.00 assoecfied | § 160000 ]S 3.200.00 assoecified | $ 100000 [ S 2.000.00
263 | 10" Ductile Iron Valve - installed & restrained 1 each asspecified | § 491400 |5 491400 assvecfied | $ 420300 5 420300| assveciied | S 6000005 600000 assoechied |S 3205458 3.205.45 assoecfied | 850000 | S 850000 assoecfied | §  4.00000|S  4.000.00 assoecified | 358000 |  3.560.00
26.4 | 10°X6"x10" wet tapping sleave installed 1 cach asspecified | $ 856000 | $  8.560.00 asspecified | §  5567.00| § 5567.00 | assvecified | $ 18.000.00 | S  18.000.00 | assoecied |$ 537310 | § 5373.10 assoecfied | 1500000 | $ 15.000.00 assoecfied | $  7.50000 |§  7.500.00 asspecified  |$ 500000 [ 8 500000
12" Ductile Iron Pipe - installed & restrained (Less than
27_|150) less than 150 3 asspecified | §  169.00 | S  169.00 assvecfied | $ 11900/ 8 11900 | assvecied |5 9500 9500 | assvecied | 15830 | 8 158.30 as svecified | § 50000 |8 50000 assoecfied |§  30000]S 30000 assoeciied | § 93008 93.00
27.1 | 12" Ductile Iron Pibe - installed & restrained (Over 150) over 150 3 asspecified | §  169.00 | S  169.00 assvecfied | $ 11900/ 8 11900 | assvecied |5  9400]s 9400 | assoecied | 15830 | 8 158.30 as svecified | § 57500 | S 675.00 assoecfied |§  20500]S 20500 assoeciied | § 9150 § 9150
27.2 | 12" Ductie Iron Bend installed & restrained 2 cach asspecified | $ 104400 | $  2.088.00 asspecified | § 118250 § 236500 | assoacified | $ 120000 |$ 240000 | asseciied | 66725 | § 1.334.50 assoecfied | 10.000.00 | $ 20.000.00 assoecfied | $  1.80000 | §  3.600.00 asspecified | $ 120000 [ 8 2.400.00
273 12" Ductile Iron Valve - installed & restrained 1 each asspecified | § 619000 | §  6.190.00 assvecified | $ 5069.00| 5 506900 | assveciied | S 7.00000|S 7.00000| assoechied |S 406815 | S 4.068.15 assoecfied | 12.00000 | $ 12.00000 assoecfied | § 650000 ]S  6.500.00 assoecified | 389000 [  3.890.00
27.4 | 12°X6"x12" wet tappina sleave installed 1 each asspecified | § 867500 |5 867500 assvecfied | $ 5567.00| § 5567.00 | assveciied | $ 23.00000 |5 2300000 | assoecied |S 537310 | 5373.10 assoecfied | 15.00000 | $ 15.000.00 assoecfied | § 800000 ]S  8.000.00 assoecified | $ 600000 [ S 6.000.00
28 _|12" Galvalum Pipe - installed 60 . HDPE AIICMP_| § 1400 | $ 84000 asspecified | § 15000/ § 054000 | assoecified |$ 3500 210000 | asspecied | 5150 | 3.090.00 as specified | NO BID NO BID. as soecified | § 6500 |$  3.900.00 as specified | § 2800 |S 168000
29|18 Galvalum Pibe - installed 60 3 HDPE AIWCMP_| 5 2300 |S  1.380.00 assvecified | $ 23100/ § 1386000 | assoeciied | 40005 240000 | assoecied | 6820 |5 4.092.00 as svecified | NO BID NOBID. as svecified | § 8500 ]S 510000 assoeciied | § 2630 |S 157800
30_|24" Galvalum Pipe - installed 60 3 HDPE AIWCMP_| 5 37.00 | s 222000 assvecfied | $ 30350 § 1821000 | assvecified |S 45005 270000 | assoecied | 81555 4.893.00 as svecified | NO BID NO BID. assoecfied |§ 11500 ]S 6.900.00 asspeciied | § 3010 |S 180600
31_|SDR-26 Plastic Pipe 4" installed 100 . asspeciied | § 7858 78500 as specified s 650 8 65000 | assoacfied |$ 2075 207500 ] assecified | 79508 795.00 as specified | NO BID NO BID. as soecified | § 30008 3.000.00 as specified | § 1920 [ 8 1.920.00
32| SDR-26 Plastic Pipe 6" installed 150 . asspeciied | § 1612 |$ 241800 asspecified | $ 1200/ § 180000 | assoecified |$  2275|$ 341250 | assecied | 1325 |8 1.987.50 as specified | NO BID NO BID. as soecified | § 5500 |8 8.250.00 as specified | § 21158  3.47250
33| SDR-26 Plastic Pipe 8" installed 200 . asspeciied | § 2980 |$  5.960.00 asspecified | S 2200/ § 440000 | assoecified |$  2075|$ 415000 | assecified | 21058 4.210.00 as specified | NO BID NO BID. as soecified | § 67.00 | §  13.400.00 as specified | § 2330 |S 466000
35_|SDR-35 Plastic Pipe 4" installed 200 . asspeciied | § 5365 1.072.00 as specified s 7.00| $ 140000 | assoecfed |$  20.75|$ 415000 | assoeciied |$ 6758 1.350.00 as specified | NO BID NO BID. as soecified | § 25008 500000 as specified | § 1750 [ 8 3.500.00
36| SDR-35 Plastic Pipe 6" installed 200 . asspecified | § 1240 | $ 248000 asspecified | $  11.25| § 225000 | assoecified |$  2275|$ 455000 | assecified | 1085 |8 2.170.00 as specified | NO BID NO BID. as specified | § 4500 |8 9.000.00 as specified | § 1965 |8 3.930.00
37_| SDR-35 Plastic Pipe 8" installed 200 it as specified | § 2285 |§ 457000 asspecied [ S 1750] s 350000 | asspecfied [S 2575 |5 515000 | asspecified [ 16.80 | $ 3,360.00 as specified | NO BID NO BID. as specified | § 4900 |§  9,800.00 asspeciied | § 2140 | 428000
ADDITIONAL MATERIALS: Cost plus __% (Actual cost
38_[plus___percent mark-up) 15% 15% 12.50% 12.50% 20% 20% 15% 15%) NONE. NONE_ 30% 30% NONE. NONE

BOE Mtg: 10.25.23
DG/sg
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