BID 18T8
VEHICLE PARTS AND SUPPLIES

(RENEWAL)
FACT SHEET

A. Overview: This recommendation is to renew the contract for the purchase of vehicle parts and
supplies for use by the transportation department.

1. Other facts:

e The renewal period will be effective from June 1, 2022 through May 31, 2024, with no further
renewal options available.

e No price adjustments were requested.

e Approximately $230,065 was spent for vehicle parts and supplies during FY21 and
approximately $278,900 has been spent, to date, in FY22.

e  This contract will be administrated by Joseph lannuzzi, Fleet Maintenance Manager,
Transportation.

2. Source of funding: FY22 Approved Operating Budget and pending Board approval of the FY23 and
FY24 Operating Budget.

B. Recommendation: Staff recommends that Bid 18T8 Vehicle Parts and Supplies, be renewed to
various vendors, per the attached Summary of Renewal.

C. Action taken by the Board (Purchasing use only):
__x_ Approved Denied Deferred Other RM/sg

05.18.22 Date Date Date Date BOE Mtg.: 05.18.22



BID 18T8, VEHICLE PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SECTION Il

SUMMARY OF RENEWAL - VALVES

MANUFACTURER

REFERENCE MEG/PART# ITEM DESCRIPTION VENDOR MANUFACTURER NAME UNIT PRICE
Cummins 281693NX EGR BELTWAY dba: CENTRAL MD CUMMINS 2881693NX $ 527.15
Cummins 2881692RX EGR COOLER BELTWAY dba: CENTRAL MD CUMMINS $ 595.76
Cummins 4309416NX EGR BELTWAY dba: CENTRAL MD CUMMINS $ 574.63

Mercedes RA9061420619 EGR BELTWAY dba: CENTRAL MD NO BID $ -

Mercedes RA9261420419 EGR BELTWAY dba: CENTRAL MD NO BID $ -

Mercedes EA9061421179 COOLER BELTWAY dba: CENTRAL MD NO BID $ -
BELTWAY dba: CENTRAL MD PERCENTAGE ABOVE COST 5%
Cummins 281693NX EGR J.G. PARKS & SON CUMMINS Z881693RX $ 583.84
Cummins 2881692RX EGR COOLER J.G. PARKS & SON CUMMINS $ 680.86
Cummins 4309416NX EGR J.G. PARKS & SON CUMMINS $ 656.72
Mercedes RA9061420619 EGR J.G. PARKS & SON MERCEDES $ 722.78
Mercedes RA9261420419 EGR J.G. PARKS & SON MERCEDES $ 209.53
Mercedes EA9061421179 COOLER J.G. PARKS & SON MERCEDES $ 994.05
J.G. PARKS & SON PERCENTAGE ABOVE COST 20%

RM/sg
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BID 18T8, VEHICLE PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SECTION Il
SUMMARY OF RENEWAL - ALTERNATORS/STARTERS

MANUFACTURER ITEM NEW UNIT |REMAN UNIT
REFERENCE MEG/PART# | TYPE | MOUNT APPLICATION DESCRIPTION VENDOR MANUFACTURER NAME PRICE PRICE
Cummins 4949PA PAD CUMM ISB BB ALTERNATOR THE BEST BATTERY CO. LEECE NEVILLE $ 300.00 | $ 235.00
Leece Neville 110-775P PAD MBE900 EGR ALTERNATOR THE BEST BATTERY CO. LEECE NEVILLE $ 125.00 | $ 95.00
Leece Neville AV1160P2003 ALTERNATOR THE BEST BATTERY CO. LEECE NEVILLE $ 475.00 | $ 195.00
Delco Remy 211-9212 PAD ALTERNATOR THE BEST BATTERY CO. DELCO REMY $ 175.00 | $ 125.00
Cummins 0-124-625-068 IC BUS CUMMINS ALTERNATOR THE BEST BATTERY CO. BOSCH $ 175.00 | $ 125.00
Cummins AL9962SB IC BUS CUMMINS ALTERNATOR THE BEST BATTERY CO. BOSCH $ 175.00 | $ 125.00
Cummins 428000-5120 CUMMS ISB STARTERS THE BEST BATTERY CO. NIPPODENS0 $ 195.00 | $ 125.00
Leece Neville M105603-N IH VT365 STARTERS THE BEST BATTERY CO. LEECE NEVILLE $ 238.00 | $ 125.00
Delco Remy 19026035 38MT MBE900 STARTERS THE BEST BATTERY CO. DELCO REMY $ 283.00 | $ 125.00
Delco Remy 10461772 MBE900 STARTERS THE BEST BATTERY CO. DELCO REMY $ 155.00 | $ 85.00
Delco Remy 8200235 STARTERS THE BEST BATTERY CO. DELCO REMY $ 283.00 | $ 125.00
Helukabel 800571 STARTERS THE BEST BATTERY CO. DELCO REMY $ 222.00 | $ 165.00
Delco Remy 8201039 38MT STARTERS THE BEST BATTERY CO. DELCO REMY $ 220.00 | $ 165.00
PERCENTAGE ABOVE
COST: THE BEST BATTERY CO. 10%
Cummins 4949PA PAD CUMM ISB BB ALTERNATOR TRI-STATE BATTERY DELCO REMY $ 243.00 | $ 230.00
Leece Neville 110-775P PAD MBE900 EGR ALTERNATOR TRI-STATE BATTERY LEECE NEVILLE $ 320.00 | $ -
Leece Neville AV1160P2003 ALTERNATOR TRI-STATE BATTERY LEECE NEVILLE $ 415.00 | $ -
Delco Remy 211-9212 PAD ALTERNATOR TRI-STATE BATTERY LEECE NEVILLE $ 324.00 | $ -
Cummins 0-124-625-068 IC BUS CUMMINS ALTERNATOR TRI-STATE BATTERY BOSCH $ 283.00 | $ -
Cummins AL9962SB IC BUS CUMMINS ALTERNATOR TRI-STATE BATTERY DELCO REMY $ 128.00 | $ 100.00
Cummins 428000-5120 CUMMS ISB STARTERS TRI-STATE BATTERY DELCO REMY $ 126.00 | $ 100.00
Leece Neville M105603-N IH VT365 STARTERS TRI-STATE BATTERY LEECE NEVILLE $ 231.00 | $ -
Delco Remy 19026035 38MT MBE900 STARTERS TRI-STATE BATTERY DELCO REMY $ 188.00 | $ 155.00
Delco Remy 10461772 MBE900 STARTERS TRI-STATE BATTERY DELCO REMY $ 105.00 | $ 80.00
Delco Remy 8200235 STARTERS TRI-STATE BATTERY DELCO REMY $ 177.00 | $ 150.00
Helukabel 800571 STARTERS TRI-STATE BATTERY DELCO REMY $ 272.00 | $ 225.00
Delco Remy 8201039 38MT STARTERS TRI-STATE BATTERY DELCO REMY $ 105.00 | $ 80.00
PERCENTAGE ABOVE
COST: TRI-STATE BATTERY 0%
RM/sg
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BID 18T8, VEHICLE PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SECTION I

SUMMARY OF RENEWAL - TURBO

MANUFACTURER

REFERENCE MFEG/PART# ITEM DESCRIPTION VENDOR MANUFACTURER NAME UNIT PRICE
BELTWAY dba: CENTRAL

Cummins 4352324RX TURBO MD CUMMINS $ 2,001.26
BELTWAY dba: CENTRAL

MD PERCENTAGE ABOVE COST 5%

Mercedes RA9060964299 TURBO J.G. PARKS & SON MERCEDES $ 848.41

Cummins 4352324RX TURBO J.G. PARKS & SON CUMMINS $ 2,287.15

J.G. PARKS & SON PERCENTAGE ABOVE COST 20%

RM/sg
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BID 18T8, VEHICLE PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SECTION Il
SUMMARY OF RENEWAL - FILTERS

MANUFACTURER
REFERENCE MEG/PART# ITEM DESCRIPTION VENDOR MANUFACTURER NAME UNIT PRICE
Luber Finer LFF5632 FUEL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 8.03
Luber Finer LP2017 OIL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 8.47
Luber Finer LP8741 OIL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 6.70
Luber Finer PH59 OIL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 1.36
Luber Finer LFF5849 FUEL WATER SEPARATOR BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 13.37
Luber Finer AF7996 AIR FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 7.14
Luber Finer LFF4783 FUEL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 5.17
Luber Finer PH820 OIL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 1.51
Luber Finer LFP3970 OIL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 4.74
Luber Finer LAF4498 AIR FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 17.90
Luber Finer LAF2959 AIR FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 31.71
Luber Finer LAF8430 AIR FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 31.58
Luber Finer L4596F FUEL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 12.14
Luber Finer LFP2999 OIL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 3.88
Luber Finer PH400 OIL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 1.36
Luber Finer LAF3233 AIR FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 27.42
Luber Finer PH44 OIL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 1.30
Luber Finer PH51A OIL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 1.36
Luber Finer PH47 OIL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 1.30
Mercedes A9061800109 OIL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 6.21
Luber Finer LFF5766 FUEL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 12.09
Detroit Diesel A9061810086 OIL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 15.55
Fleetguard FS1098 FUEL FILTER BATTERY ONE NO BID $ -
Fleetguard FF63009 FUEL FILTER BATTERY ONE NO BID $ -
Luber Finer LFF1065 FUEL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 16.87
Luber Finer L8701F FUEL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 7.80
Detroit Diesel A0000902751 FUEL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 32.77
Luber Finer LFF8957 FUEL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 12.18
Allison 29539579 TRANS FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 7.19
International 2517298C1 AIR FILTER BATTERY ONE NO BID $ -
Luber Finer PH48 OIL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 1.30
Motorcraft FL500S OIL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 1.45
Hastings LF113 OIL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 1.50
Luber Finer LFF6012 FUEL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 17.87
Fleetguard CV52001 CCFILTER BATTERY ONE NO BID $ -
Luber Finer LFF1537 FUEL FILTER BATTERY ONE CHAMPION LABS/LUBERFINER $ 61.91
BATTERY ONE PERCENTAGE ABOVE COST 0%
Luber Finer LFF5632 FUEL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 8.90
Luber Finer LP2017 OIL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 9.01
Luber Finer LP8741 OIL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ RM7s41
BOE Mtg.: 5.18.22
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BID 18T8, VEHICLE PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SECTION Il

SUMMARY OF RENEWAL - FILTERS

MANUFACTURER

REFERENCE MEG/PART# ITEM DESCRIPTION VENDOR MANUFACTURER NAME UNIT PRICE
Luber Finer PH59 OIL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 2.66
Luber Finer LFF5849 FUEL WATER SEPARATOR FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 14.15
Luber Finer AF7996 AIR FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 7.22
Luber Finer LFF4783 FUEL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 5.75
Luber Finer PH820 OIL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 2.63
Luber Finer LFP3970 OIL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 5.33
Luber Finer LAF4498 AIR FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 19.05
Luber Finer LAF2959 AIR FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 27.35
Luber Finer LAF8430 AIR FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 22.94
Luber Finer L4596F FUEL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 13.54
Luber Finer LFP2999 OIL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 4.17
Luber Finer PH400 OIL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 2.80
Luber Finer LAF3233 AIR FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 29.56
Luber Finer PH44 OIL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 3.07
Luber Finer PH51A OIL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 2.27
Luber Finer PH47 OIL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 2.29
Mercedes A9061800109 OIL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 6.75
Luber Finer LFF5766 FUEL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 15.35
Detroit Diesel A9061810086 OIL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 16.75
Fleetguard FS1098 FUEL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. FLEETGUARD $ 46.90
Fleetguard FF63009 FUEL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. FLEETGUARD $ 28.45
Luber Finer LFF1065 FUEL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 17.34
Luber Finer L8701F FUEL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 8.60
Detroit Diesel A0000902751 FUEL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 24.76
Luber Finer LFF8957 FUEL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 13.53
Allison 29539579 TRANS FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 7.92
International 2517298C1 AIR FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. FLEETGUARD $ 132.25
Luber Finer PH48 OIL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 2.21
Motorcraft FL500S OIL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 2.50
Hastings LF113 OIL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 3.63
Luber Finer LFF6012 FUEL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 19.43
Fleetguard CV52001 CC FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. FLEETGUARD $ 58.46
Luber Finer LFF1537 FUEL FILTER FLEETPRIDE, INC. BALDWIN $ 39.83
FLEETPRIDE, INC. PERCENTAGE ABOVE COST 0%

RM/sg
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BID 18T8, VEHICLE PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SECTION I
SUMMARY OF RENEWAL - ROTOR PADS

MANUFACTURER
REFERENCE MEG/PART# ITEM DESCRIPTION VENDOR MANUFACTURER NAME UNIT PRICE
Performance Friction 381.181.30 ROTOR THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 215.52
Performance Friction 225.20 PADS THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 76.30
Performance Friction 0786.11 PADS THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 91.57
Performance Friction 381.081.20 ROTOR THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 137.67
Performance Friction 390.193.20 ROTOR THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 215.52
Performance Friction 390.086.20 ROTOR THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 149.65
Performance Friction 0769.10 PADS THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 92.56
Performance Friction 381.181.20 ROTOR THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 215.52
THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERCENTAGE ABOVE COST 14%
Performance Friction 381.181.30 ROTOR K. NEAL PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 231.87
Performance Friction 225.20 PADS K. NEAL PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 76.97
Performance Friction 0786.11 PADS K. NEAL PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 86.93
Performance Friction 381.081.20 ROTOR K. NEAL PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 162.07
Performance Friction 390.193.20 ROTOR K. NEAL PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 227.01
Performance Friction 390.086.20 ROTOR K. NEAL PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 155.48
Performance Friction 0769.10 PADS K. NEAL PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 82.90
Performance Friction 381.181.20 ROTOR K. NEAL PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 231.87
K. NEAL PERCENTAGE ABOVE COST 5%

RM/sg

BOE Mtg.: 5.18.22
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BID 18T8, VEHICLE PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SECTION I
SUMMARY OF RENEWAL - ROTOR PADS

MANUFACTURER
REFERENCE MEG/PART# ITEM DESCRIPTION VENDOR MANUFACTURER NAME UNIT PRICE
Performance Friction 381.181.30 ROTOR THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 215.52
Performance Friction 225.20 PADS THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 76.30
Performance Friction 0786.11 PADS THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 91.57
Performance Friction 381.081.20 ROTOR THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 137.67
Performance Friction 390.193.20 ROTOR THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 215.52
Performance Friction 390.086.20 ROTOR THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 149.65
Performance Friction 0769.10 PADS THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 92.56
Performance Friction 381.181.20 ROTOR THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 215.52
THE BALT.AUTO SUPPLY CO. PERCENTAGE ABOVE COST 14%
Performance Friction 381.181.30 ROTOR K. NEAL PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 231.87
Performance Friction 225.20 PADS K. NEAL PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 76.97
Performance Friction 0786.11 PADS K. NEAL PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 86.93
Performance Friction 381.081.20 ROTOR K. NEAL PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 162.07
Performance Friction 390.193.20 ROTOR K. NEAL PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 227.01
Performance Friction 390.086.20 ROTOR K. NEAL PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 155.48
Performance Friction 0769.10 PADS K. NEAL PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 82.90
Performance Friction 381.181.20 ROTOR K. NEAL PERFORMANCE FRICTION $ 231.87
K. NEAL PERCENTAGE ABOVE COST 5%

RM/sg

BOE Mtg.: 5.18.22
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BID 18T8, VEHICLE PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SECTION I

SUMMARY OF RENEWAL - SENSORS

MANUFACTURER
REFERENCE MEG/PART# ITEM DESCRIPTION VENDOR MANUFACTURER NAME UNIT PRICE
Cummins 2871960 SENSOR BELTWAY dba: CENTRAL MD CUMMINS $ 103.09
PERCENTAGE ABOVE COST BELTWAY dba: CENTRAL MD 5%
Cummins 2871960 SENSOR J.G. PARKS & SON CUMMINS $ 117.81
Mercedes A6805401617 PRESSURE SENSOR J.G. PARKS & SON MERCEDES $ 37.36
PERCENTAGE ABOVE COST J.G. PARKS & SON 20%
RM/sg
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BID 18T8, VEHICLE PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SECTION I
SUMMARY OF RENEWAL - WATER PUMP

MANUFACTURER
REFERENCE MEG/PART# ITEM DESCRIPTION VENDOR MANUFACTURER NAME UNIT PRICE
BELTWAY dba: CENTRAL
Cummins 2881688 WATER PUMP MD CUMMINS $ 110.19
BELTWAY dba: CENTRAL
Cummins 4955394 WATER PUMP MD CUMMINS $ 136.36
BELTWAY dba: CENTRAL
MD PERCENTAGE ABOVE COST 5%
Cummins 2881688 WATER PUMP J.G. PARKS & SON CUMMINS $ 125.92
Cummins 4955394 WATER PUMP J.G. PARKS & SON CUMMINS $ 155.84
Mercedes RA906200630180 WATER PUMP J.G. PARKS & SON MERCEDES $ 318.76
Mercedes EA9261000101 WATER PUMP J.G. PARKS & SON MERCEDES $ 235.09
J.G. PARKS & SON PERCENTAGE ABOVE COST 20%
RM/sg

BOE Mtg. 5.18.22
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