
 

BID 22CURR4 
 MATHEMATICAL SUPPLIES AND CALCULATORS  

 
FACT SHEET  

A. Overview:  This recommendation is to establish a contract for the purchase of general math supplies and calculators 
used in the elementary and secondary math education programs.  Bids were opened on March 25, 2022. 

1. Bid participation: 
 

20 bids downloaded                                                                            
  6 companies submitted a bid  
 

2. Bids were received from: 

AFP Industries, Inc. (Miami, FL)  
Eric Armin, Inc. dba: EAI Education (Oakland, NJ) 
hand2mind, Inc. dba: hand2mind (Vernon Hills, IL)  
Lakeshore Equipment Company dba:  Lakeshore Learning Materials (Carson, CA)  
School Specialty, LLC (Greenville, WI)  
Topkem Properties, LLC (Frederick, MD) 
 

3. Other facts: 

• The initial contract term shall be effective from May 1, 2022 through April 30, 2024, with one two-year 
renewal term available. 
 

• Prices for calculators have decreased an average of 2.76% since the last contract.  However, prices for math 
supplies have increased due to supply chain bottlenecks and labor shortages. 

• Approximately $56,000 was spent for these instructional materials in FY21 and approximately $21,000 has 
been spent YTD FY22. 

• This contract will be administered by Debra Myers, Curriculum Specialist (PreK-5) Elementary Math, and 
Stacey Sisler, Curriculum Specialist (6-12) Secondary Math. 

4. Reason for rejection of low bids: 

• Calculators are being awarded by aggregate. 

5. Source of funding:  FY22 Approved Operating Budget and contingent upon Board approval of FY23 and FY24 
Operating Budgets. 

 

B. Recommendation:  Staff recommends the contract for Bid 22CURR4, Mathematical Supplies and Calculators, be 
awarded as per the Bid Tabulation for Instructional Supplies.  Staff further recommends that all bidders be approved 
as discount suppliers under the Discount Summary for additional products, that may be needed.  Staff recommends 
Calculators be awarded in the aggregate to Eric Armin, Inc. dba: EAI Education (Oakland, NJ). 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
C. Action taken by the Board (Purchasing use only): 

   
  _____Approved              _____Denied                _____Deferred               _____Other       RM/kl 
 
  _____Date                      _____Date                    _____Date                     _____Date        BOE Mtg.:  05.04.22  
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BID 22CURR4, MATHEMATICAL SUPPLIES AND CALCULATORS
BID TABULATION

Item DESCRIPTION RECOMMENDED 
MAKE/MODEL OR EQUIVALENT MAKE/MODEL BID UNIT PRICE 1-5 MAKE/MODEL BID UNIT PRICE 1-5 MAKE/MODEL BID UNIT PRICE 1-5 MAKE/MODEL BID UNIT PRICE 1-5

1 ALGEBRA TILES CLASSROOM SET OF 30 WITH INSTRUCTIONAL MATERIALS INCLUDED EAI 533160 533160  $                     77.80 No Bid 87680  $                     65.23 533160  $                   122.32 

2 BASE TEN BLOCKS, PLASTIC,SINGLE COLOR, SET OF 10 SCHOOL SMART 084952 530356  $                       5.45 GG845  $                       7.43 84952  $                       4.64 84952  $                     17.63 

3 COUNTING CHIPS, 6 COLORS, TRANSLUCENT, 1", SET OF 1000 WITH TUB LAKESHORE RA806 530808X4  $                     21.96 RA806  $                     23.24 1329152                       
(1 set of 250)  $                       2.62 RA806  $                     33.98 

4 COUNTING CHIPS, DOUBLE SIDED, 2-COLOR, PLASTIC OR THICK FOAM, SET OF 200 ETA IN4060 533097  $                       4.70 RA522  $                     18.59  No Bid IN4060  $                     13.58 

5 COUNTING CUBES, 10 COLOR, INTERLOCKING, PLASTIC,  SET OF 500 ETA IN030501 531055  $                     29.80 LL879  $                     30.68 336996                               
(1 set of 1000)  $                     66.23 IN030501  $                     69.34 

6 CUBES, WOODEN, COLOR, 1" CUBES, APPROXIMATELY 100 PER JAR ETA IND9505X 531002  $                     11.30 RA838                                 
(tub of 90)  $                     23.24 1285315  $                     15.36 IND9505X  $                     35.38 

7 DICE, DECIMAL, 10-SIDED, SET OF 36 ETA IN75418  No Bid  No Bid  No BID IN75418  $                     35.34 

8 DICE, FRACTION, 40 SETS OF 6 PER SET TO EQUAL A SET OF 240 EAI 530173 X 40 SETS 530173X40  $                     53.80  No Bid 089916                            
(4 per set)  $                       1.19 530173  $                   113.69 

9 DICE, POLYHEDRA, ASSORTED, APPROXIMATELY 100 PER TUB EAI 530093 WITH STORAGE TUB 530093  $                     18.80  No Bid 264325                    
(set of 10)  $                       2.77 530093  $                     35.29 

10 EQUATION UNIFIX CUBES, NUMBERS BLACK AND OPERATIONS SYMBOLS WHITE, 100 
CUBES PER SET DIDAX  No Bid RA629                                  

(tub of 90)  $                     27.89  No Bid DIDAX  $                       5.44 

11 FRACTION BARS, STARTER SET W/ ACTIVITY MATS AND MARKERS EAI 530314  No Bid LC772 $3.24 & 
DD103 $3.71  $                     26.95  No Bid  No Bid 

12 FRACTION CIRCLES, DELUXE RAINBOW BASICS CLASSROOM KIT, SET OF 15 ETA IN42857 561381  $                     62.80 GG583  $                   119.97 085131                               
(1 set of 15)         $                       3.74 IN42857  $                   115.50 

13 FRACTION PATTERN BLOCKS, SET OF 700, IN JAR EAI 533098 533098  $                     24.80  No Bid 084980                      
(1 set of 250)  $                     14.35 533098  $                     33.93 

14 FRACTION RULERS, FOR FRACTION TOWERS, SET OF 10 ETA IN76858  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid IN76858  $                     12.77 

15 FRACTION TILES, RAINBOW, SET OF 51 PCS ETA IN4264 531081  $                       3.60 GG584  $                       7.43 84961  $                       8.14 IN4264  $                       9.50 

16 FRACTION TOWER, EQUIVALENCY CUBES, SET OF 51 ETA IN5249 530661  $                     14.80 FR774  $                     25.10 76757  $                     10.53 IN5249  $                       9.50 

17 GEOBOARD, CIRCLE, X & Y AXES, SET OF SIX WITH RUBBER BANDS SCHOOL SPECIALTY 072249 534211  $                     16.80 DA363  $                     23.24 72249  $                     13.11 72249  $                     50.27 

18 GEO-MODEL FOLDING SHAPES, JUMBO, 10CM, SOLIDS AND  FOLDING SHAPES EAI 531832 531832  $                     35.80 FG349  $                     37.19  No Bid 531832  $                     48.89 

19 PATTERN BLOCKS, PLASTIC, SIX SHAPES AND SIX COLORS, SET OF 250, IN JAR EAI 531007 531007  $                     16.80 DA910  $                     23.24 520897  $                       5.16 531007  $                     24.41 

20 PROTRACTOR, 4" CLEAR PLASTIC, SET OF 100 EAI 534771 534771  $                     29.80 LL986                                
(set of 30)  $                     27.89 084409                                  

(for 1 ea.)  $                       0.94 534771  $                     50.25 

21 RULERS, 12", TRANSLUCENT. ASSORTED COLORS, SET OF 24 ETA IN75642 532082AX24  $                     13.80  No Bid  No Bid IN75642  $                     33.98 

22 WHITEBOARD, DOUBLE-SIDED, EASEL, HINGED,  16"H X 20"W LAKESHORE TT379  No Bid TT379  $                     74.39  No Bid TT379  $                   108.78 

23 WHITEBOARD, DOUBLE-SIDED, WIPE AND WRITE, MAGNETIC, 9" X 12", BLANK ON ONE 
SIDE/ BASELINES ON BACK, SET OF 10 OR 12 LAKESHORE LL628X 108243  $                     37.80 LL628X  $                     82.76 1402897                  

(pack of 12)  $                     34.03 LL628X  $                   121.02 

24 UNIFIX CUBES, SET OF 1000 DIDAX 2-BKAW or LAKESHORE 
TY4200 EAI #531127  $                     95.80  $                   106.94  $                     78.60  $                   156.38 

EAI Educational Topkem  Properties, LLC
LAKESHORE EQUIPMENT COMPANY

 dba:  LAKESHORE LEARNING 
MATERIALS

SCHOOL SPECIALTY, INC.INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES
UNIT PRICE 1-5

BOE Meeting:  05.04.22
RM/kl
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BID 22CURR4, MATHEMATICAL SUPPLIES AND CALCULATORS
BID TABULATION

Item DESCRIPTION RECOMMENDED 
MAKE/MODEL OR EQUIVALENT MAKE/MODEL BID UNIT PRICE 6 + MAKE/MODEL BID UNIT PRICE 6 + MAKE/MODEL BID UNIT PRICE 6 + MAKE/MODEL BID UNIT PRICE 6 +

1 ALGEBRA TILES CLASSROOM SET OF 30 WITH INSTRUCTIONAL MATERIALS INCLUDED EAI 533160
533160

77.80$                      119.97$                    
87680

65.23$                      
533160

117.83$                    

2 BASE TEN BLOCKS, PLASTIC,SINGLE COLOR, SET OF 10 SCHOOL SMART 084952
530356

5.45$                        
GG845

7.43$                        
84952

4.64$                        
84952

16.99$                      

3 COUNTING CHIPS, 6 COLORS, TRANSLUCENT, 1", SET OF 1000 WITH TUB LAKESHORE RA806
530808X4

21.96$                      
RA806

23.24$                      
1329152                       

(1 set of 250) 2.62$                        
RA806

32.73$                      

4 COUNTING CHIPS, DOUBLE SIDED, 2-COLOR, PLASTIC OR THICK FOAM, SET OF 200 ETA IN4060
533097

4.70$                        
RA522

18.59$                      No Bid
IN4060

13.08$                      

5 COUNTING CUBES, 10 COLOR, INTERLOCKING, PLASTIC,  SET OF 500 ETA IN030501
531055

29.80$                      
LL879

30.68$                      
336996                               

(1 set of 1000) 66.23$                      
IN030501

66.79$                      

6 CUBES, WOODEN, COLOR, 1" CUBES, APPROXIMATELY 100 PER JAR ETA IND9505X
531002

11.30$                      
RA838                                 

(tub of 90) 23.24$                      
1285315

15.36$                      
IND9505X

34.08$                      

7 DICE, DECIMAL, 10-SIDED, SET OF 36 ETA IN75418 No Bid No Bid No Bid
IN75418

34.04$                      

8 DICE, FRACTION, 40 SETS OF 6 PER SET TO EQUAL A SET OF 240 EAI 530173 X 40 SETS
530173X40

53.80$                      No Bid
089916                            

(4 per set) 1.19$                        
530173

109.51$                    

9 DICE, POLYHEDRA, ASSORTED, APPROXIMATELY 100 PER TUB EAI 530093 WITH STORAGE TUB
530093

18.80$                      No Bid
264325                    

(set of 10) 2.77$                        
530093

33.99$                      

10
EQUATION UNIFIX CUBES, NUMBERS BLACK AND OPERATIONS SYMBOLS WHITE, 100 
CUBES PER SET DIDAX No Bid

RA629                                  
(tub of 90) 27.89$                      No Bid

DIDAX
5.24$                        

11 FRACTION BARS, STARTER SET W/ ACTIVITY MATS AND MARKERS EAI 530314 No Bid
LC772 $3.24 & 
DD103 $3.71 26.95$                      No Bid No Bid

12 FRACTION CIRCLES, DELUXE RAINBOW BASICS CLASSROOM KIT, SET OF 15 ETA IN42857
561381

62.80$                      
GG583

119.97$                    
085131                               

(1 set of 15)        3.74$                        
IN42857

111.33$                    

13 FRACTION PATTERN BLOCKS, SET OF 700, IN JAR EAI 533098
533098

24.80$                      No Bid
084980                      

(1 set of 250) 14.35$                      
533098

32.68$                      

14 FRACTION RULERS, FOR FRACTION TOWERS, SET OF 10 ETA IN76858 No Bid No Bid No Bid
IN76858

12.30$                      

15 FRACTION TILES, RAINBOW, SET OF 51 PCS ETA IN4264
531081

3.60$                        
GG584

7.43$                        
84961

8.14$                        
IN4264

9.15$                        

16 FRACTION TOWER, EQUIVALENCY CUBES, SET OF 51 ETA IN5249
530661

14.80$                      
FR774

25.10$                      
76757

10.53$                      
IN5249

9.15$                        

17 GEOBOARD, CIRCLE, X & Y AXES, SET OF SIX WITH RUBBER BANDS, SCHOOL SPECIALTY 072249
534211

16.80$                      
DA363

23.24$                      
72249

13.11$                      
72249

48.43$                      

18 GEO-MODEL FOLDING SHAPES, JUMBO, 10CM, 11 SOLIDS AND 11 NETS EAI 531832
531832

35.80$                      
FG349

37.19$                      No Bid
531832

47.09$                      

19 PATTERN BLOCKS, PLASTIC, SIX SHAPES AND SIX COLORS, SET OF 250, IN JAR EAI 531007
531007

16.80$                      
DA910

23.24$                      
520897

5.16$                        
531007

23.51$                      

20 PROTRACTOR, 4" CLEAR PLASTIC, SET OF 100 EAI 534771
534771

29.80$                      
LL986                                

(set of 30) 27.89$                      
084409                                  

(for 1 ea.) 0.94$                        
534771

48.40$                      

RULERS, 12", TRANSLUCENT. ASSORTED COLORS, SET OF 24 ETA IN75642
532082AX24

13.80$                      No Bid No Bid
IN75642

32.73$                      

22 WHITEBOARD, DOUBLE-SIDED, EASEL, HINGED,  16"H X 20"W LAKESHORE TT379 No Bid
TT379

74.39$                      No Bid
TT379

104.78$                    

23
WHITEBOARD, DOUBLE-SIDED, WIPE AND WRITE, MAGNETIC, 9" X 12", BLANK ON ONE 
SIDE/ BASELINES ON BACK, SET OF 10 LAKESHORE LL628X

108243
37.80$                      

LL628X
82.76$                      

1402897                  
(pack of 12) 34.03$                      

LL628X
116.57$                    

24 UNIFIX CUBES, SET OF 1000
DIDAX 2-BKAW or LAKESHORE 

TY4200 EAI #531127 95.80$                      106.94$                    78.60$                      150.63$                    

INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES
UNIT PRICE 6 + EAI Educational Topkem  Properties, LLC

LAKESHORE EQUIPMENT COMPANY
 dba:  LAKESHORE LEARNING 

MATERIALS
SCHOOL SPECIALTY, INC.

BOE Meeting:  05.04.22
RM/kl
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BID 22CURR4, MATHEMATICAL SUPPLIES AND CALCULATORS
BID TABULATION

ITEM # DESCRIPTION RECOMMENDED 
MAKE/MODEL OR EQUIVALENT MAKE/MODEL BID UNIT PRICE 1-4 MAKE/MODEL BID UNIT PRICE 1-4 MAKE/MODEL BID UNIT PRICE 1-4 MAKE/MODEL BID UNIT PRICE 1-4

1 CALCULATOR, ELEMENTARY 108/BK 108/BK  $                 6.38 70001  $                 4.11 069005                            
TI10BK  $               11.70 108/BK  $                  9.88 

2 CALCULATOR, ELEMENTARY, TEACHER KIT (10 
CALCULATORS WITH CARRYING CASE) 108/TKT 108/TKT  $               55.88 70003-001    108/EKT  $               41.10 069004                              

TI10TK  $             116.96 108/TKT  $                86.79 

3 CALCULATOR, GRAPHING 84/TBL/1L1 84/TBL/1L1  $             115.98 78045  $             102.25 038117 T183PLUSMP  $             110.75 84/TBL/1L1  $              187.66 

4 CONNECTIVITY KIT:  TI-GRAPH LINK SOFTWARE AND 
USB CABLE FOR WINDOWS/MAC GLINK/ENV/1L1/B GLINK/ENV/1L1/B  No Bid 70699-006  $               14.50  No Bid GLINK/ENV/1L1/B  $                68.14 

5 CALCULATOR, GRAPHING, TEACH KIT (10 EZ-SPOT 
YELLOW CALCULATORS) 84PL/TPK/1L1 84PL/TPK/1L1  $          1,058.00 70852 84P1F1PW1L1  $          1,022.50 

2002208 
T130XSMVTKYEL

 ( 1ea.)
 $             148.03 84PL/TPK/1L1  $              978.99 

6
CALCULATOR, GRAPHING (10 EZ-SPOT YELLOW
CALCULATORS AND A CHARGING STATION FOR 10
UNITS)  

84CEPY/TPK/2L1 84CEPY/TPK/2L1  $          1,318.00 68  
84CEPYRRPK12L1  $          1,276.40  No Bid 84CEPY/TPK/2L1  $           1,878.02 

7 CALCULATOR, SCIENTIFIC 15/BK 15/BK  $               24.88 70250  $               13.60 1896820 CS-209  $               10.61 15/BK  $                27.32 

9 CALCULATOR, SCIENTIFIC, CLASSROOM PACK OF 30 
WITH COVERS, STORAGE CADDIES  30XIIS/TKT 30XIIS/TKT  $             344.97 70333X3                              

(no covers)  $             333.81  No Bid 30XIIS/TKT  $              195.84 

10 CALCULATOR, SCIENTIFIC 34MV/BK 34MV/BK  $               27.98 70405  $               16.60 1362308 
T134MULTIVIEW  $               19.41 34MV/BK  $                38.06 

11
CALCULATOR, SCIENTIFIC, TEACHER KIT (10 EZ-
SPOT YELLOW CALCULATORS WITH CARRYING 
CASE)  

34MV/TKT 34MV/TKT  $             188.88 70406  $             166.00 1362309 
T134MULTVIEWTK  $             194.15 34MV/TKT  $              282.86 

ITEM # DESCRIPTION RECOMMENDED 
MAKE/MODEL OR EQUIVALENT MAKE/MODEL BID UNIT PRICE 5 + MAKE/MODEL BID UNIT PRICE 5 + MAKE/MODEL BID UNIT PRICE 5 + MAKE/MODEL BID UNIT PRICE 5 +

1 CALCULATOR, ELEMENTARY 108/BK 108/BK  $                 6.38 70001  $                 4.11 069005                            
TI10BK  $               11.70 108/BK  $                  9.50 

2 CALCULATOR, ELEMENTARY, TEACHER KIT (10 
CALCULATORS WITH CARRYING CASE) 108/TKT 108/TKT  $               48.88 70003-001

    108/EKT  $               41.10 069004                              
TI10TK  $             116.96 108/TKT  $                83.60 

3 CALCULATOR, GRAPHING 84/TBL/1L1 84/TBL/1L1  $             108.98 78045  $             102.25 038117 T183PLUSMP  $             110.75 84/TBL/1L1  $              180.76 

4 CONNECTIVITY KIT:  TI-GRAPH LINK SOFTWARE AND 
USB CABLE FOR WINDOWS/MAC GLINK/ENV/1L1/B GLINK/ENV/1L1/B  No Bid 70699-006  $               14.50  No Bid GLINK/ENV/1L1/B  $                65.63 

5 CALCULATOR, GRAPHING, TEACH KIT (10 EZ-SPOT 
YELLOW CALCULATORS) 84PL/TPK/1L1 84PL/TPK/1L1  $          1,033.58 70852 84P1F1PW1L1  $          1,022.50 

2002208 
T130XSMVTKYEL

( 1ea.)
 $             148.03 84PL/TPK/1L1  $              978.99 

6
CALCULATOR, GRAPHING (10 EZ-SPOT YELLOW
CALCULATORS AND A CHARGING STATION FOR 10
UNITS)  

84CEPY/TPK/2L1 84CEPY/TPK/2L1  $          1,292.60 68  
84CEPYRRPK12L1  $          1,276.40  $             145.29 84CEPY/TPK/2L1  $           1,878.02 

7 CALCULATOR, SCIENTIFIC 15/BK 15/BK  $               22.88 70250  $               13.60 1896820 CS-209  No Bid 15/BK  $                26.31 

8 CALCULATOR, SCIENTIFIC, TEACHER KIT (10 
CALCULATORS WITH CARRYING CASE) 15/TKT 15/TKT  $             138.00 70251  $             136.00 038431                               

TI15TK  $             157.17 15/TKT  $              208.29 

9 CALCULATOR, SCIENTIFIC, CLASSROOM PACK OF 30 
WITH COVERS, STORAGE CADDIES  30XIIS/TKT 30XIIS/TKT  $             329.97 70333X3                              

(no covers)  $             333.81  No Bid 30XIIS/TKT  $              188.64 

10 CALCULATOR, SCIENTIFIC 34MV/BK 34MV/BK  $               25.98 70405  $               16.60 1362308 
T134MULTIVIEW  $               19.41 34MV/BK  $                36.66 

11
CALCULATOR, SCIENTIFIC, TEACHER KIT (10 EZ-
SPOT YELLOW CALCULATORS WITH CARRYING 
CASE)  

34MV/TKT 34MV/TKT  $             169.88 70406  $             166.00 1362309 
T134MULTVIEWTK  $             194.15 34MV/TKT  $              272.46 

SCHOOL SPECIALTY, LLC TOPKEM INDUSTRIES, LLC

EAI EDUCATIONCALCULATORS
UNIT PRICE 1-4

CALCULATORS
UNIT PRICE 5 + AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. EAI EDUCATION

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC.

8 CALCULATOR, SCIENTIFIC, TEACHER KIT (10 
CALCULATORS WITH CARRYING CASE) 15/TKT 15/TKT  $             151.88  $             136.00 70251

TOPKEM INDUSTRIES, LLC

 $              216.24 15/TKT

SCHOOL SPECIALTY, LLC

038431                               
TI15TK  $             157.17 

BOE Meeting:  05.04.22
RM/kl
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BID 22CURR4, MATHEMATICAL SUPPLIES AND CALCULATORS
DISCOUNT SUMMARY

DISCOUNT SUMMARY AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. ERIC ARMIN , INC.
dba:  EAI EDUCATION

hand2mind, INC.
dba:  hand2mind LAKESHORE LEARNING MATERIALS, LLC SCHOOL SPECIALTY, LLC TOPKEM PROPERTIES, LLC

VENDOR ADDRESS: AFP Industries, Inc.   
Miami, FL 33280

Eric Armin, Inc.
dba:  EAI Education

118 Bauer Dr.
Oakland, NJ 07436

hand2mind, Inc
500 Greenview Ct 

Vernon Hills, IL 60061   

Lakeshore Learning Materials
2695 E. Dominguez St.

Carson, CA 90895

School Specialty, LLC
140 Marble Drive

Lancaster, PA 17601

Topkem Properties, LLC
8467 Pine Bluff Rd.

Frederick, MD 21704

ADDITIONAL REFERENCE #: (OPTIONAL) EAI Education FCPS#22CURR4 Please reference "Per Bid #22CURR4" on all 
purchase orders Bid Number Q-165692 N/A

WEBSITE ADDRESS: www.afpschoolsupply.com www/eaieducation.com http://www.hand2mind.com/catalogs www.lakeshorelearning.com www.schoolspecialty.com 

CONTACT PERSON FOR QUOTES: Vivian Castellanos Kathy Franks Fernando Winnegan Quotes Department April Curran Daniel Temitope

EMAIL ADDRESS sales@afpschoolsupply.com sales@eaieducation.com fwinnegan@hand2mind.com quotes@lakeshorelearning.com bideastnotices@schoolspecialty.com danvex20@gmail.com

PHONE NUMBER (305) 663-8300 (201) 891-9466- x7600 (443) 844-1699 800-421-5354
ext. 8501 888-388-3224 (240) 529-7269

CONTACT PERSON FOR CUSTOMER SERVICE: Vivian Castellanos Barbara Ryniak Customer Service Penny Stone Customer Service Daniel Temitope

EMAIL ADDRESS sales@afpschoolsupply.com info@eaieducation.com quotes@hand2mind.com customerservice@lakeshorelearning.com danvex20@gmail.com

PHONE NUMBER (305) 663-8300 (201) 891-9466 x7440 800-445-5985 800-428-4414 888-388-3224 (240) 529-7269

% DISCOUNT FROM CATALOG PRICE: 3% 15% with exceptions 15% off 7% 5%

EXCEPTIONS TO ACROSS-THE-BOARD DISCOUNT  
(IF NONE, STATE N/A)

Discounts do not apply to all Texas 
Instruments, ClcPal, Casio, Sharp, 

Batteries, Bloxels, Brown Dog Gadgets, 
Circuit Scribe, Cubelets, Edison 
Educational, K'NEX, Makeblock, 

MakeyMakey, Ozbot, Photon, PickettLab, 
Root, Sphero, Superflix, TeacherGeek, 
Vernier, Wonder Workshop, carpets, 

furniture, drop-shipped items and select 
KEVA, Mudwatt and sotrage containers.  
The discount cannot be combinded with 
any other coupons, sale prices, special 

offer, bids or quote pricing.

Professional Development, publisher-aligned 
and hnad2mind Custome Kits are excluded 
from catalog discount. Special promotions, 

sale items, quotes, brochures and bid prices 
(prefixed by BD) are excluded from further 

discounts.

Discount not applicable on sale items. N/A

ACKNOWLEDGE FREE SHIPPING FOR PARCEL AND 
UPS: YES X     OR     NO__ YES X     OR     NO__ YES X     OR     NO__ YES X     OR     NO__

FREIGHT CHARGES (DOCK-DELIVERY) WILL BE 
ADDED ONLY ON LARGE EQUIPMENT ITEMS AS 
FOLLOWS: 

N/A - no large equipment N/A - Free shipping on all orders with the 
contguous United States. N/A

WILL YOUR COMPANY SEND PRINTED CATALOGS 
TO INDIVIDUAL SCHOOLS?  YES __  OR    NO X YES X  OR     NO__    YES X   OR     NO __ YES  X     OR     NO__ YES  X     OR     NO__ YES  X     OR     NO__

ACKNOWLEDGE MINIMUM ORDER OF NO GREATER 
THAN $25 YES __  OR    NO__ YES  X     OR     NO__ YES X   OR    NO __  YES  X*     OR     NO__ 

 *no minimum order amount YES __    OR     NO X YES X    OR     NO __

ACKNOWLEDGE ACCEPTANCE OF CREDIT CARD 
ORDERS YES __   OR    NO  X YES  X     OR     NO__   YES  X   OR     NO __ YES  X     OR     NO__ YES  X     OR     NO__ YES  X     OR     NO__

YES X  - on orders over $99
under $99 add $9 for shipping.  ALL 
producets from Texas Instruments, 

CalcPal, Casio, Sharp, Vernier, furntiure, 
carpets, drop-shipped items and storage 
are not eligible for free shipping and do 

not apply toward the $99 minimum order.  
Standard shipping rates will apply to all 

excluded items.  Freight charges are 
determined by size and weight.  Actual 

freight charge will apply.

YES X*  OR     NO __ 
*Free ground shipping is applied to all orders 

over $99.00 (12% / $7 min).  FedEx Next 
Day, Second Day & 3 Day Select are 
excluded form free shipping terms.

Please see letter attached to bid.  All 
discounts apply to the current yeara 
catalogs which are located on the School 
Specialty website 
http://catalogs.schoolspecialty.com 
Valid from May1, 2022 through April 30, 
2024, pricing for contract period effective 
upon notication of award reference out Bid 
#Q-165692 to 
bideastnotices@schoolspecialty.com   

BOE Meeting:  05.04.22
RM/kl
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