BID 22CURR3
PHYSICAL EDUCATION SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT

FACT SHEET

A. Overview: This recommendation is to establish a contract for the purchase of general physical
education supplies and equipment used in the elementary and secondary physical education programs.
Bids were opened on March 31, 2022.

1. Bid participation:

21 bids downloaded
6 companies submitted a bid

2. Bids werereceived from:

ADA Sports and Rackets, LLC dba: ADA Inc. (Kansas City, KS)
Pyramid Paper Company dba: Pyramid School Products (Tampa, FL)
S&S Worldwide (Colchester, CT)

School Specialty, LLC (Lancaster, PA)

The Prophet Corporation dba: Gopher (Owatonna, MN)

US Games A Division of BSN Sports (Dallas, TX)

3. Other facts:
e The initial contract term shall be effective from May 1, 2022 through April 30, 2024, with one
two-year renewal term available.

e Prices for physical education supplies and equipment have increased due to supply chain
bottlenecks and labor shortages.

e Approximately $71,600 was spent for physical education supplies and equipment in FY21 and
approximately $109,700 has been spent YTD FY22.

e  This contract will be administered by Jamie Hitchner, Curriculum Specialist, Elementary
Physical Education and Health and Brian Griffith, Curriculum Specialist, Secondary Physical
Education and Health.

4. Source of funding: FY22 Approved Operating Budget and contingent upon Board approval of
FY23 and FY24 Operating Budgets.

B. Recommendation: Staff recommends that Bid 22CURR3, Physical Education Supplies and
Equipment, be awarded per the attached Bid Tabulation. Staff further recommends that all bidders be
approved as discount suppliers under the Discount Summary, for additional products that may be
needed.

C. Action taken by the Board (Purchasing use only):
Approved Denied Deferred Other RM/KI

Date Date Date Date BOE Mtg.: 05.04.22
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BID 22CURR3, PHYSICAL EDUCATION SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT

BID TABULATION

ADA SPORTS AND
RACKETS, LLC
dba: ADA SPORTS

PYRAMID PAPER
COMPANY
dba: PYRAMID
SCHOOL PRODUCTS

THE PROPHET
CORPORATION
dba: GOPHER

S&S WORLDWIDE

SCHOOL SPECIALTY,
LLC

US GAMES
A DIVISION OF BSN
SPORTS, LLC

NET UNIT PRICE

NET UNIT PRICE

NET UNIT PRICE

NET UNIT PRICE

NET UNIT PRICE

NET UNIT PRICE

I"T'ga DESCRIPTION RECOM%"SETDED INCLUDING SHIPPING | INCLUDING SHIPPING | INCLUDING SHIPPING | INCLUDING SHIPPING | INCLUDING SHIPPING | INCLUDING SHIPPING
(QTY 1) (QTY 1) (QTY 1) (QTY 1) (QTY 1) (QTY 1)
1 |BADMINTON RACQUET, 26'L, ALUMINUM FRAME, NYLON STRINGS #74 SMACK $ 13.00 | $ 10.15 [ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 |BADMINTON RACQUET, 23"L, ALUMINUM FRAME, NYLON STRINGS #73 SMACK JR. $ 11.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 |BADMINTON SHUTTLECOCKS, SYNTHETIC RUBBER TIP, EQUAL TO CARLTON T-800, YELLOW SKIRT, CAN OF 6 #95 $ 7.50 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 9.56 | No Bid
BALL CART/RACK AND EQUIPMENT CARRIER, 64 L X 32 W X 60"H, 1 1/4" COATED STEEL TUBMING, 2 ALL
TERRAIN 12" WHEELS, 2-4" SWIVEL CASTERS, STORES 2 DBL WIDE SHELVES, END HOOKS, AND 2 REMOVABLE
4 |MESH WIRE BASKETS 89-623 No Bid No Bid $ 672.87 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
s |casters T e e 1017303 /1449910 | No Bid $ 95.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 94.29 | No Bid
6 |BALL LOCKER, WITH LID, WIRE MESH, 41 X 24 X 36"H, CHROME PLATED STEEL, 4 SWIVEL CASTERS 19040 No Bid $ 199.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 327.88 | No Bid
7 |BALL, BASKETBALLS - JUNIOR SIZE - SETS OF (6) 33103 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 41.09 | No Bid
8 |BALL, BASKETBALLS - MINI SIZE - SETS OF (6) 16286 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 31.63 | No Bid
9 |BALL, BOWLING BALLS 45-946 No Bid No Bid $ 40.46 | No Bid $ 22.80 | No Bid
10 |BALL, GATOR FOAM BALLS - 7" SETS OF (6) GP02-040 $ 78.00 | $ 75.30 | No Bid No Bid $ 49.34 | No Bid
11 |BALL, FOOTBALL, OFFICIAL SIZE, COMPOSITE LEATHER, DOUBLE LOCKED LACES AND REINFORCED BACKING F-6000 No Bid $ 18.95 | No Bid No Bid $ 18.50 | No Bid
12 |BALL, FOOTBALL, YOUTH SIZE, COMPOSITE LEATHER, DOUBLE LOCKED LACES AND REINFORCED BACKING F-6007 No Bid $ 17.50 | No Bid No Bid $ 17.13 [ No Bid
13 |BALL, PLAYGROUND, 8.5" DIA, BLUE, 2 PLY HVY DUTY RUBBER 71-315 No Bid $ 3.65|$ 8.78 | No Bid $ 3.87 | No Bid
14 |BALL, PLAYGROUND, 8.5" DIA, PRISM PACK OF 6, 2 PLY HVY DUTY RUBBER 71-319 No Bid $ 21.90 | $ 44.96 | No Bid $ 26.41 | No Bid
BALL, PLAYGROUND, SQUISH BALL SET, COATED-FOAM PACK, SET OF 12 IN THREE SIZES: 6", 7" AND 8.25" DIA),
15 |WITH BAG CUSTOM $ 444.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 |BALL, SOCCER, SIZE 4, RAINBOW SET OF 6 COLORS 1599282 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 34.95 | No Bid
1378536 / ATTACK
17 |BALL, SOCCER, SIZE 5, BLACK, HAND STITCHED, BUTYL BLADDER, BRINE "ATTACK" ATKHS5 No Bid $ 10.99 [ No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 18.39
18 |BALL, SOCCER, SIZE 5, RAINBOW SET OF 6 COLORS 1599259 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 36.30 | No Bid
19 |BALLS, FLEECE, 4" DIAMETER, MEDIUM DENSITY, RAINBOW, SET OF 6 71-750 No Bid No Bid $ 44.96 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 |BALLS, SUPER SQUISH FOOTBALL JR. 8.5", SET OF 6 COLORS FB900 $ 72.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 |BALLS, ONCOURT/OFFCOURT QUICKSTART TENNIS BALLS - SETS OF (36) 1321049 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 53.30 | No Bid
22 |BALLS, VOLLEY FOAM TENNIS/ SETS OF (3) 41-718 No Bid No Bid $ 21.56 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
23 |BALLS, VOLLEYBALL TRAINERS / SETS OF (6) 61-665 No Bid No Bid $ 103.50 [ No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 |BALLS, VOLLEYBALL TRAINER XL 9-008939-500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 |BALLS, YARN BALLS - 3" DIAMETER RAINBOW / SETS OF (6) GP41-517 No Bid No Bid $ 44.96 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 |BEAN BAGS, VINYL, 4'SQUARE, SET OF 6 COLORS 20-385 No Bid $ 7.80 | $ 16.16 | No Bid $ 14.33 | No Bid
27 |CART, SCOOTER, 27'L X 24"W X 54"H, ABS PLASTIC, CAPACITY OF 48 SCOOTERS, LOCKING SWIVEL CASTERS 57-097 No Bid No Bid $ 256.50 | No Bid $ 170.67 [ No Bid
28 |CONE, GAME 18", WEIGHTED BASES, STACKABLE, PVC, ORANGE 1040838 No Bid $ 10.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 9.73
29 |CONE, 18" SLOTTED KONTROL KONES - RAINBOW SETS OF (6) 8760 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 46.58 | No Bid
30 |DICE - FOAM COATED - SETS OF (12) 22968 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 11.84 | No Bid
31 |FITNESS RACK, FOR TUBING, 7" X 25" X 32"H, BLACK METAL WITH CASTERS 92546 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
32 |FITNESS RESISTANCE TUBING, LATEX FREE RESISTANCE WITH PLASTIC HANDLES, HEAVY 67-889 No Bid $ 11.15 | No Bid No Bid $ 7.27 | No Bid
33 |FITNESS RESISTANCE TUBING, LATEX FREE RESISTANCE WITH PLASTIC HANDLES, LIGHT 67-887 No Bid $ 9.15 | $ 8.34 | No Bid $ 6.53 | No Bid
34 |FITNESS RESISTANCE TUBING, LATEX FREE RESISTANCE WITH PLASTIC HANDLES, MEDIUM 67-888 No Bid $ 9.80 | No Bid No Bid $ 6.86 | No Bid
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BID 22CURR3, PHYSICAL EDUCATION SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT

BID TABULATION

ADA SPORTS AND
RACKETS, LLC
dba: ADA SPORTS

PYRAMID PAPER
COMPANY
dba: PYRAMID
SCHOOL PRODUCTS

THE PROPHET
CORPORATION
dba: GOPHER

S&S WORLDWIDE

SCHOOL SPECIALTY,
LLC

US GAMES
A DIVISION OF BSN
SPORTS, LLC

NET UNIT PRICE

NET UNIT PRICE

NET UNIT PRICE

NET UNIT PRICE

NET UNIT PRICE

NET UNIT PRICE

I"T'ga DESCRIPTION RECOM%ASETDED INCLUDING SHIPPING | INCLUDING SHIPPING | INCLUDING SHIPPING | INCLUDING SHIPPING | INCLUDING SHIPPING | INCLUDING SHIPPING
(QTY 1) (QTY 1) (QTY 1) (QTY 1) (QTY 1) (QTY 1)
35 |FITNESS TESTING - FLEXIBILITY SIT - REACH TESTER (TEST 2) 0S-FLEX2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 83.20 | No Bid
FLAG BELT SYSTEM, HIGH SCHOOL, (26-38" AND 30-44"), 24 PLAYER SET (12 RED; 12 BLUE), TRIPLE VINYL
36 |FLAGS PER BELT, WITH REPLACEABLE ALLIGATOR CLIP BUCKLE, AND MESH BAG 66341 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FLAG BELT SYSTEM, MIDDLE SCHOOL, (20-32" AND 26-38"), 24 PLAYER SET (12 RED; 12 BLUE), TRIPLE VINYL
37 |FLAGS PER BELT, WITH REPLACEABLE ALLIGATOR CLIP BUCKLE, AND MESH BAG 66340 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FLOOR MARKING TAPE, 1" X 60 YARDS, SELECT FROM VARIOUS COLORS: BLACK, BLUE, GREEN, GOLD,
38 |ORANGE, PURPLE, RED, WHITE 2186 No Bid $ 3.50 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4.46
FLOOR MARKING TAPE, 1" X 60 YARDS, SELECT FROM VARIOUS COLORS: BLACK, BLUE, GREEN, GOLD,
39 |ORANGE, PURPLE, RED, WHITE 2164 No Bid $ 7.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 8.48
40 [FOAM FOOTBALL, JUNIOR SIZE (9 TO 9 3/4"), SET OF 6--ONE OF EACH COLOR 1243864 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 84.98
41 |FRISBEE - FOAM, RAINBOW COLORS - SETS OF (6) 20-520 No Bid $ 24.45 | $ 40.46 | No Bid $ 15.09 [ No Bid
GAME CRAFT® FLOOR HOCKEY, JR. SET, 6 BLUE AND 6 YELLOW EXTRA STRONG 36" STICKS, PLASTIC SHAFTS,
42 |PLY BLADES, 3 PUCKS MSHOCKJRY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 61.75 | $ 93.98
GAME CRAFT® FLOOR HOCKEY, SR. SET, 6 BLUE AND 6 YELLOW EXTRA STRONG 43" STICKS, PLASTIC SHAFTS,
43 |PLY BLADES, WITH 2 GOALIE STICKS, 2 PUCKS AND 2 BALLS MSHOCKSRY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 104.00 | $ 133.98
HOCKEY REPLACEMENT STICKS, SET OF 3-- 43" STICKS, POLY BLADES, FOR GAME CRAFT® FLOOR HOCKEY,
44 [sR.sET 1151015 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 39.98
45 |HOOPS, ANTI-KINK, HEAVY DUTY, 24" DIAMETER, SET OF 12--EACH OF SIX COLOR 02-150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 54.34 | $ 71.98
46 |HOOPS, ANTI-KINK, HEAVY DUTY, 30" DIAMETER, SET OF 12--EACH OF SIX COLOR 02-160 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 57.98 | $ 77.98
47 |HOOPS, ANTI-KINK, HEAVY DUTY, 36" DIAMETER, SET OF 12--EACH OF SIX COLOR 02-170 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 82.98
HOT SPOTS (R), CARDIO, EXERCISE SETS, FOR STATION ACTIVITIES EACH SET INCLUDES 12 WEAR-RESISTANT
48 [SPOTS (8.5"D X 1/8" THICK), ANTI-SLIP 1368858 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 50.99
HOT SPOTS (R), HOOP, EXERCISE SETS, FOR STATION ACTIVITIES EACH SET INCLUDES 12 WEAR-RESISTANT
49 [SPOTS (8.5"D X 1/8" THICK), ANTI-SLIP 1368857 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 50.99
HOT SPOTS (R), RESISTANCE TUBING, EXERCISE SETS, FOR STATION ACTIVITIES EACH SET INCLUDES 12
50 |WEAR-RESISTANT SPOTS (8.5"D X 1/8" THICK), ANTI-SLIP 1205626 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 50.99
INFLATOR, ELECTRIC, HEAVY DUTY: 1/4 HP QUIET INDUSTRIAL DIAPHRAGM COMPRESSOR, 8' ELECTRIC CORD,
51 |3-PRONG PLUG, 50 PSI; WITH PRESSURE GAUGE, HOSE AND NEEDLE, UL LISTED 1240672 / EP1500 | No Bid $ 77.00 [ No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 149.98
52 |INSTA-PULSE BATON, HEART RATE MONITOR, 11" L, HAND HELD BATON SHAPE, 25040 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
INTERVAL TIMER, 5" led NUMBERS, REMOTE CONTROL OPERATED, PROGRAMMABLE, 10 SECOND
COUNTDOWN, 20/10 TABATA WORKOUT MODE, CLOCK WHEN NOT IN USE AS A TIMER, HOLES FOR HANGING,
53 |BATTERIES INCLUDED, 21"L X 3'W, X 8.5"H, 5 LB. GT69-460 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54 |JUMP ROPE AND HOOP RACK, 19 X 27 X 68"H, WHEELED BASED, THREE RACK LG. CAPACITY 1188325 No Bid $ 109.00 [ No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 149.98
55 |JUMP ROPE, 6 FT SEGMENTED, PLASTIC, BLACK/WHITE , WITH HANDLES 1040142 No Bid $ 1.49 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.68
56 |JUMP ROPE, 7 FT SEGMENTED, PLASTIC, RED/WHITE, WITH HANDLES 1040159 No Bid $ 1.79 | No Bid No Bid $ 0.92|$ 1.69
JUMP SPEED ROPES, RAINBOW BALL-BEARING, 8 FT., SOLID PVC CORD, 5 1/2" HANDLE WITH THUMB GROVE,
57 |RAINBOW SET OF 6 COLORS 41-063 No Bid 11.94 | $ 58.46 | No Bid $ 11.68 [ No Bid
58 |JUMP, ROPE, 9 FT SEGMENTED SKIP, RED/WHITE/BLUE, PLASTIC, LATEX FREE 1040173 No Bid 2.10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.91
MARKER, DRY LINE, HEAVY DUTY, 50 LB. CAPACITY, WITH 18 GALLON GALVANIZED STEEL BUCKED, STEEL
59 |AXLE BUSHINGS, 4 PNEUMATIC TIRES (3.5 X 10" D), ALUMAGOAL BBHDDMS50 /8259 | No Bid $ 395.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 185.33 | $ 309.98
60 |MAT MOVING CART, , 66"L X 22"WX7"H, FOLDING HANDLE 1246155 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 160.00 | $ 179.98
61 |MAT TAPE, 3" X 84, CLEAR 20026411 No Bid $ 5.35 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 6.22
62 |MAT TAPE, 4" X 84, CLEAR 20026406 No Bid $ 7.20 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 8.37
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BID 22CURR3, PHYSICAL EDUCATION SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT

BID TABULATION

ADA SPORTS AND PY%@:}E:@;ER THE PROPHET SCHOOL SPECIALTY US GAMES
RACKETS, LLC dba: PYRAMID CORPORATION S&S WORLDWIDE LLC " | ADIVISION OF BSN
dba: ADA SPORTS SCHOOL PROBUCTS dba: GOPHER SPORTS, LLC
LINE RECOMMENDED NET UNIT PRICE NET UNIT PRICE NET UNIT PRICE NET UNIT PRICE NET UNIT PRICE NET UNIT PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION MODEL INCLUDING SHIPPING | INCLUDING SHIPPING | INCLUDING SHIPPING | INCLUDING SHIPPING | INCLUDING SHIPPING | INCLUDING SHIPPING
(QTY 1) (QTY 1) (QTY 1) (QTY 1) (QTY 1) (QTY 1)

63 |MAT, FOR EQUIPMENT, RUBBER, 36"W X 78"L X 1/2" THICK, BLACK 87-038 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

MAT, LANDING, COMPETITION, 6' X 12' X 12 CM THICK, BI-FOLD, TWO HANDLES PER SIDE, METS FIG , NCAA AND

NFSHSA SPECS, POLY ETHYLENE OVER POLYURETHANE, 18 OZ DOUBLE COATED NYLON FABRIC, DOUBLE
64 |SEAMS, BLUE 1045888 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
65 |MAT, TUMBLING, 5' x 10' x 2", BONDED FOAM, W/2' PANELS AND 2' FOLDS, 4 SIDE FASTENERS, BLUE 1044429 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 459.07 | $ 619.98
66 |[MEASURING TAPE, 165', VINYL COATED FIBERGLASS, CASE WITH HANDLE AND LOOP 3378 No Bid $ 9.40 | No Bid No Bid $ 1291 | $ 10.98
67 |MEASURING WHEEL, DIGITAL TELESCOPING ALUM HANDLE, 4' WHEEL, ENGLISH/METRIC ™ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

MEGAPHONE, 600 YARD RANGE, 6C BATTERIES, BUILT-IN MIKE, VARIABLE VOLUME CONTROL, SIGNAL ALARM,
68 |STRAP 25-407 No Bid $ 51.40 | No Bid No Bid $ 124.60 | No Bid
69 |PARACHUTE, 20 FT. DIAMETER, 16 HANDLE, DELUXE NYLON, WITH BAG 1255874 No Bid $ 54.75 | No Bid No Bid $ 95.88 | $ 84.98
70 |PEDOMETER, MULTI FUNCTION: STEPS, ACTIVITY TIME AND PHYSICAL ACTIVITY (MVPS), UPLOADABLE 76-039 / PRO No Bid No Bid $ 31.46 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
71 |PICKLE BALL, PICKLE BALL PACK - CLASS SET 56-010 No Bid No Bid $ 2,150.10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
72 |PINNIES, HVY DUTY, POLYESTER MESH, ONE SIZE ADULT, 4 COLORS/SET SET OF 4 COLORS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
73 |POLYSPOTS - RAINBOW SETS OF (6) GP0-630 No Bid $ 7.35 | No Bid No Bid $ 11.29 | No Bid
74 |POOL NOODLES - FOAM - VARIOUS COLORS & SIZES - 48" 36" 24" FOAMNOODLES.COM | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
75 |PUGG GOAL, 72"H X 42"H X 42"D 17-052 No Bid No Bid $ 31.46 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

SCOOTER, CONNECT-A-SCOOTER, 16 X 16", SAFETY HANDLES, COMPOSITE RUBBER CASTERS, HIGH IMPACT
76 |PLASTIC 1282641 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 154.61 | No Bid

SCOOTER, 16" SUPER SCOOTERS, 5" DIA JUMBO WHEELS W/ ULTRA GLIDE CASTERS
77 |(Please price for sets of 24) 15357 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 275.25 | No Bid
78 |SOCCER GOAL, POP-UP, 48"W x 30"H x 30"D, SPRING-STEEL FRAME,POLY ETHYLENE NET 62-271 No Bid No Bid $ 58.46 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
79 |STOPWATCH W/ PRINTER S-129 No Bid $ 350.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
80 |STOPWATCH - ACCUSPLIT - RAINBOW SETS OF (6) 33957 No Bid $ 46.80 | No Bid No Bid $ 44.05 | No Bid
81 |[TENNIS BALLS, PRACTICE, CASE OF 24 CANS T-1019 No Bid $ 72.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 83.24 | No Bid
82 |TENNIS RACKETS - 21" GP52-224 No Bid $ 14.85 | $ 23.36 | No Bid $ 10.13 | No Bid
83 |TENNIS RACKETS - 23" GP52-225 No Bid $ 15.00 | $ 24.26 | No Bid $ 10.28 | No Bid
84 |TENNIS RACKET, 25", I-BEAM ALUMINUM FRAME, RIBBED GRIP, 15 GAUGE NYLON STRINGS, JR. SIZE #52 JR. SIZE $ 15.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 10.28 | No Bid
85 |[VOLLEYBALL, NFHS APPROVED, COMPOSITE LEATHER SV-5WS No Bid $ 26.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 28.81 | $ 42.98
86 |WHISTLE, REFEREE, PEA STYLE, METAL 66-645 / 60 1/2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 6.48 | $ 57.21
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BID 22CURR3, PHYSICAL EDUCATION SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT

DISCOUNT SUMMARY

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

ADA SPORTS AND RACKTS, LLC

PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY

dba: ADA SPORTS dba: PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS S&S WORLDWIDE SCHOOL SPECIALTY, LLC US GAMES A DIVISION OF BSN SPORTS, LLC
i S&S Worldwide e
Pyramid School Products School Specialty, LLC US Games A Division of BSN Sports, LLC
1 |COMPANY NAME, CITY AND STATE: ADA Sports & Rackets, LLC 75 Mill St.

Kansas City, KS

6510 North 54th Street
Tampa, FL 33610

Colchester, CT 06415

140 Marble Drive
Lancaster, PA 17601

PO Box 7726
Dallas, TX 75209

2 ADDITIONAL REFERENCE #: (OPTIONAL) 2023 Bid 22CURR3% Bid Number: Q-169173 22-61662
3 WEBSITE ADDRESS: www.adasportsandrackets.com WWW.SSWwW.com www.schoolspecialty.com Www.usgames.com
4 CONTACT PERSON FOR QUOTES:
NAME - Jennifer Martin Kenneth Miller Erin Hemingway Rachele Gardner John Stafford - Bid Department
EMAIL ADDRESS - info@adasportsandrackets.com kenn ramidsp.com bids@ssww.com bideastnc 100Ispecialty.com usgamesbid@usgames.com
PHONE NUMBER - 800-234-0460 800-792-2644 x225 800-642-7354 888-388-3224 800-327-0484
5 CONTACT PERSON FOR CUSTOMER SERVICE:
NAME - Jennifer Martin Patricia Olivas Customor Care Loraine Eubank
EMAIL ADDRESS - info@adasportsandrackets.com customerservice@pyramidsp.com cservice@ssww.com customercare@schoolspecialty.com usgamesbid@usgames.com
PHONE NUMBER - 800-234-0460 800-792-2644 x248 800-642-7354 888-388-3224 800-327-0484
20% off Current List Price at time of order
placement. Not to be combinded with sale prices,
offer codes, internet specials & quantity breaks.
6 % DISCOUNT FROM CATALOG PRICE: 0-25% 20% from Champion Sports Items labeled FOB/Dropship are ineleigible for 15% off w/exceptions
free insdie delivery, liftgate, and shipping.
Installation/assembly not provided.
EXCEPTIONS TO ACROSS-THE-BOARD DISCOUNT
7 (IF NONE, STATE N/A) NIA NIA NIA
8 ACKNOWLEDGE FREE SHIPPING FOR PARCEL AND UPS: YESX ORNO __ YESX OR NO__ YESX OR NO __ YESX OR NO __ YESX OR NO __
0 FREIGHT CHARGES (DOCK-DELIVERY) WILL BE ADDED ONLY ON LARGE Fo;gro;;héplll:ﬁs |:emsAfre|ghll Wlllnbs p;e;:]ald Inside delivery for a frelgt:il truckk item is 17% of item
EQUIPMENT ITEMS AS FOLLOWS: and added to invoice. A quote can be done price.
before order placement. (Free Tailgate delivery)
YES__ OR NO X_
10  |WILL YOUR COMPANY SEND PRINTED CATALOGS TO INDIVIDUAL SCHOOLS? YESX ORNO __ YES__ OR NOX YESXOR NO__ YES__ OR NOX catalogs are online only
https://www.usgames.com/catalog-
usg/2022_USG_Spring/mobile/index.html|
11 |ACKNOWLEDGE NMINIMUM ORDER OF NO GREATER THAN $25 YES _ ORNOX_ YESX OR NO__ YESX OR NO __ YESX OR NO __ YES__ OR NO__
12 |ACKNOWLEDGE ACCEPTANCE OF CREDIT CARD ORDERS

YESX ORNO __

YES __ OR NOX

YESX OR NO__

YESX OR NO__

YES _ OR NO__
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