
BID 20M2 
PAINT AND SUPPLIES 

(RENEWAL) 

FACT SHEET 

A. Overview:  This recommendation is to renew the contract for the purchase of paint and related supply items for
the Maintenance Department.

1. Other facts:

• The contract renewal term will be effective January 1, 2022 through December 31, 2022, with one
additional one-year renewal option remaining.

• Approximately $10,900 was spent in FY21, and approximately $8100 has been spent, to date, in FY22.

• No price adjustments were requested.

• This contract will be administered by Gary Barkdoll, Manager of Maintenance Projects and Grounds,
Maintenance Department.

2. Source of funding:  FY22 Approved Operating Budget and Contingent upon Board Approval of FY23
Operating Budget.

B. Recommendation:  Staff recommends that Bid 20M2, Paint and Supplies be renewed to various vendors per
the attached Summary of Renewal.

C. Action taken by the Board (Purchasing use only):

   _____Denied       _____Deferred  _____Other     BM/sg x__Approved       

12.08.21 Date          _____Date    _____Date          _____Date      BOE Mtg.:  12.08.21



BID 20M2, PAINT AND SUPPLIES GROUPS A - D
BID TAB

GRP
SPEC 

NO ITEM DESCRIPTION
BRAND PRODUCT 

NAME
1 GAL/ 
UNIT 

  1 GAL 
PRICE   

5 GAL/ 
UNIT

 5 GAL 
PRICE  

BRAND PRODUCT 
NAME

1 GAL/ 
UNIT 

  1 GAL 
PRICE   

5 GAL/ 
UNIT

 5 GAL 
PRICE  

BRAND PRODUCT 
NAME

1 GAL/ 
UNIT 

  1 GAL 
PRICE   

5 GAL/ 
UNIT

 5 GAL 
PRICE  

A 1
Vinyl Acrylic Latex 
Flat

McCormick Total 
Advantage Flat 08 
Series 1 Gal 12.20$        5 Gal 58.25$        Hil Hide Flat 679-10 1 Gal 12.25$        5 Gal 61.25$        Super Paint Int Flat 1 Gal 14.05$        5 Gal 67.50$        

A 2
Vinyl Acrylic Latex 
Semi Gloss

McCormick 
Advantage Semi-
Gloss 25 Series 1 Gal 14.75$        5 Gal 69.90$        

Hi Hide Semi Gloss 
109-10 1 Gal 16.00$        5 Gal 80.00$        

Super Paint Int 
Semi-Gloss 1 Gal 14.56$        5 Gal 72.25$        

A 3
Vinyl Acrylic Latex 
Flat Zero VOC

McCormick Total 
Advantage Flat 08 
Series 1 Gal 12.20$        5 Gal 58.25$        

Speedhide Zero Int.
Flat 6-4110XI 
Series 1 Gal 11.45$        5 Gal 57.25$        

PRO Mar 200 0 
VOC Flat 1 Gal 9.46$          5 Gal 45.15$        

A 4

Vinyl Acrylic Latex  
Semi Gloss Zero 
VOC 

McCormick Total 
Advantage Semi-
Gloss 10 Series 1 Gal 14.95$        5 Gal 70.90$        

Speedhide Zero Int. 
Semi Gloss 6-410XI 
Series 1 Gal 13.75$        5 Gal 68.75$        

PRO Mar 200 0 
VOC Semi-Gloss 1 Gal 10.77$        5 Gal 53.50$        

A 5
Latex Paint + Primer 
in One Flat

McCormick REVO  
Paint + Primer in 
One Flat 15 Series 1 Gal 15.55$        5 Gal 69.90$        

Pure Performance 
Int. Flat 9-100XI 1 Gal 13.65$        5 Gal 68.25$        Super Paint Int Flat 1 Gal 14.05$        5 Gal 67.50$        

A 6
Latex Paint + Primer 
in OneSemi-Gloss 

McCormick REVO  
Paint + Primer in 
One Semi-Gloss 17 
Series 1 Gal 16.95$        5 Gal 79.90$        

Pure Performance 
Int. Semi Gloss 9-
500XI 1 Gal 13.95$        5 Gal 69.75$        

Super Paint Int 
Semi-Gloss 1 Gal 14.56$        5 Gal 72.25$        

A 7 Odorless  Latex Flat

McCormick Total 
Advantage Flat 08 
Series 1 Gal 12.20$        5 Gal 58.25$        

Speedhide Zero Int. 
Flat 6-4110XI 
Series 1 Gal 11.45$        5 Gal 57.25$        Harmony Flat 1 Gal 14.10$        5 Gal 69.95$        

A 8
Odorless Latex Semi 
Gloss  

McCormick Total 
Advantage Semi-
Gloss 10 Series 1 Gal 14.95$        5 Gal 70.90$        

Speedhide Zero Int. 
Semi Gloss 6-
4510XI Series 1 Gal 13.75$        5 Gal 68.75$        

Harmony Semi-
Gloss 1 Gal 14.55$        5 Gal 74.99$        

A 9
Acrylic Semi Gloss 
Enamel

McCormick 
Advantage Semi-
Gloss 25 Series 1 Gal 14.75$        5 Gal 69.90$        

Speedhide Int. 
Semi Gloss 6-500 1 Gal 13.75$        5 Gal 68.75$        

Pro Mar 400 0 VOC 
Semi-Gloss 1 Gal 13.05$        5 Gal 62.50$        

A 10
Acrylic Latex House 
Paint-Flat

McCormick State 
House Flat 19 
Series 1 Gal 16.20$        5 Gal 79.50$        

Speedhide Ext. Flat 
6-610XI 1 Gal 13.30$        5 Gal 66.50$        

A-100 100% acrylic
House Paint Flat 1 Gal 12.02$        5 Gal 57.45$        

A 11
Acrylic Latex House 
Paint-Semi-Gloss

McCormick State 
House Semi-Gloss 
27 Series 1 Gal 17.25$        5 Gal 82.20$        

Speedhide Ext. 
Semi Gloss 6-900XI 1 Gal 15.40$        5 Gal 77.00$        

A-100 100% acrylic
House Paint Semi-
Gloss 1 Gal 13.49$        5 Gal 66.10$        

A 12

Direct To Metal - 
Latex - Gloss - to 
Include Safety Colors

McCormick Interlok 
DTM Gloss 42 
Series 1 Gal 29.75$        5 Gal N/A

Pitt Tech Pius 4216 
Series 1 Gal 27.70$        5 Gal 138.50$      Pro Industrial DTM 1 Gal 22.95$        5 Gal 114.45$      

A 13

Direct To Metal - 
Latex - Gloss - to 
exclude Safety Colors

McCormick Interlok 
DTM Gloss 42 
Series 1 Gal 26.55$        5 Gal 129.50$      

Pitt Tech Pius Semi 
Gloss 4216 Series 1 Gal 20.80$        5 Gal 104.00$      Pro Industrial DTM 1 Gal 18.55$        5 Gal $92.00

A 14
Waterbased Acrylic 
Urethane DTM Gloss

McCormick Interlok 
DTM Gloss 42 
Series 1 Gal 26.55$        5 Gal 129.50$      

Pitt Tech Plus 
Gloss 90-1310 
Series 1 Gal 20.80$        5 Gal 20.80$        

Pro Industrial Water-
based Alkyd 
Urethane Enamel 
Gloss 1 Gal 24.00$        5 Gal 119.00$      

A 15

Waterbased Acrylic 
Urethane DTM Semi 
Gloss

McCormick Interlok 
DTM Semi-Gloss 
45 Series 1 Gal 26.55$        5 Gal 129.50$      

Pitt Tech Plus Semi 
Gloss 4216 Series 1 Gal 20.80$        5 Gal 104.00$      

Pro Industrial Water-
based Alkyd 
Urethane Enamel 
Gloss 1 Gal 24.00$        5 Gal 119.00$      

A 16
Waterborne Acrylic 
Dryfall Flat

McCormick Dry Fall 
Waterborne Acrylic 
01219 1 Gal N/A 5 Gal 48.75$        

Super Tech WB Dry 
Fog Flat 6-725XI 1 Gal -$            5 Gal 33.95$        

Waterbourne Dryfall 
Flat 1 Gal No Bid 5 Gal 35.33$        

PRIMARY = YELLOW

SECONDARY = BLUE

PPG Paints Sherwin Williams
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BID 20M2, PAINT AND SUPPLIES GROUPS A - D
BID TAB

PRIMARY = YELLOW

SECONDARY = BLUE

PPG Paints Sherwin WilliamsMcCormick Paints

A 17
Waterborne Acrylic 
Dry Fall Semi-Gloss

McCormick Dry Fall 
Waterborne Acrylic 
Semi-Gloss 01310 1 Gal N/A 5 Gal 59.90$        

Suer Tech WB Dry 
Fog Semi Gloss 6-
724XI 1 Gal -$            5 Gal 54.25$        

Waterbourne Dryfall 
Semi-Gloss 1 Gal No Bid 5 Gal 59.30$        

B 1
Drywall Primer Vinyl 
Latex Sealer

McCormick Vinyl 
Primer Sealer 
06431 1 Gal 9.10$          5 Gal 41.80$        

Speedhide Pro EV 
Zero Primer 12-
900XI 1 Gal 7.35$          5 Gal 36.75$        

Pro Mar 200 0 VOC 
primer 1 Gal 7.67$          5 Gal 33.65$        

B 2
Acrylic Enamel 
Undercoater

McCormick Latex 
Enamel 
Undercoater 06441 1 Gal 12.10$        5 Gal 55.90$        

Speedhide Primer 6-
2 1 Gal 8.80$          5 Gal 44.00$        Premium Wall and W 1 Gal 10.38$        5 Gal 46.60$        

B 3 Vinyl Primer Sealer

McCormick Vinyl 
Primer Sealer 
06431 1 Gal 9.10$          5 Gal 41.80$        

Speedhide Pro EV 
Zero Primer 12-
900XI 1 Gal 7.35$          5 Gal 36.75$        Drywall Primer 1 Gal 7.12$          5 Gal 31.45$        

B 4 Stain Killer

Zinsser High Hide 
Cover Stain 
6103551 1 Gal 20.70$        5 Gal 99.41$        

Seal Grip Int/Ext 
Acrylic Sealer 17-
921 1 Gal 14.05$        5 Gal 70.25$        Preprite Pro Block 1 Gal 11.31$        5 Gal 56.50$        

B 5
Water-based Primer-
Sealer/Stain Killer

McCormick uniX 
Multi-Purpose Stain 
Blocking Primer 
06460 1 Gal 17.90$        5 Gal 87.20$        

Seal Grip Int/Ext 
Acrylic Sealer 17-
921 1 Gal 14.05$        5 Gal 70.25$        

Multipurpose 
Primer 1 Gal 11.17$        5 Gal 55.85$        

B 6

Interior/Exterior 
Acrylic Latex Multi-
Purpose Primer

McCormick uniX 
Multi-Purpose Stain 
Blocking Primer 
06460 1 Gal 17.90$        5 Gal 87.20$        

Seal Grip Int/Ext 
Acrylic Sealer 17-
921 1 Gal 14.05$        5 Gal 70.25$        

Multipurpose 
Primer 1 Gal 11.17$        5 Gal 55.85$        

B 7
Universal Acrylic 
Metal Primer

McCormick Interlok 
DTM Eggshell 43 
Series 1 Gal 26.55$        5 Gal 129.50$      

Pitt Tech Primer 
4020 Series 1 Gal 21.45$        5 Gal 107.25$      

Pro Industrial DTM 
Primer/ Finish 1 Gal 19.05$        5 Gal $94.50

C 1

Interior Penetrating 
Oil Wood Stain Clear 
Tint

McCormick 
Interior 
Penetrating Wood 
Stain 01061 1 Qt 8.95$          1 Gal N/A

Deft Oil Stain DFT 
400 1 Qt 7.20$          1 Gal N/A

Minwax 
Performance 
Interior Stain 1 Qt 7.49$          1 Gal 21.26$        

C 2
Water-Based Wood 
Stain Clear Tint Base

Old Masters 
Masters Armor 1 Qt 17.00$        1 Gal 55.00$        N/A 1 Qt N/A 1 Gal N/A

Minwax 
Waterbased Wood 
Stain Clear Tint 
Base 1 Qt 7.20$          1 Gal 28.80$        

C 3

Interior Waterborne 
Latex Polyurethane - 
Satin

McCormick Clear 
Polyurethane Satin 
Finish 01199 1 Qt 9.80$          1 Gal N/A

Deft WB 
Polyurethane Satin 
DFT259 1 Qt 11.25$        1 Gal 39.00$        

Minwax Water-
based Polyurethane 
Satin 1 Qt 19.94$        1 Gal 49.96$        

C 4

Interior Waterborne 
Latex Polyurethane - 
Gloss

McCormick Clear 
Polyurethane Gloss 
Finish 01198 1 Qt 9.80$          1 Gal N/A

Deft WB 
Polyurethane Gloss 
DFT257 1 Qt 11.25$        1 Gal 41.00$        

Minwax Water-
based Polyurethane 
Gloss 1 Qt 19.94$        1 Gal 49.96$        

C 5

Wood and Concrete 
Textured Resurfacer 
Deck Coating 1 Gal $ 5 Gal $ N/A 1 Gal N/A 5 Gal N/A 1 Gal No Bid 5 Gal No Bid

C 6

Latex Traffic Paint 
with Titanium Dioxide 
and High Solids - 
White

McCormick Traffic 
Paint Waterborne 
Vinyl Acrylic White 
01705 1 Gal 11.20$        5 Gal 52.80$        

Zone Mark White 
11-53 1 Gal 13.60$        5 Gal 68.00$        

Pro Park Latex 
Traffic Marking 
Paint White 1 Gal 13.95$        5 Gal 63.65$        
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BID 20M2, PAINT AND SUPPLIES GROUPS A - D
BID TAB

PRIMARY = YELLOW

SECONDARY = BLUE

PPG Paints Sherwin WilliamsMcCormick Paints

C 7

Latex Traffic Paint 
with Titanium Dioxide 
and High Solids - 
Yellow

McCormick Traffic 
Paint Waterborne 
Vinyl Acrylic Yellow 
01715 1 Gal 15.20$        5 Gal 78.65$        

Zone Mark Yellow 
11-54 1 Gal 15.05$        5 Gal 75.25$        

Pro Park Latex 
Traffic Marking 
Paint Yellow 1 Gal 13.95$        5 Gal 63.65$        

C 8

Latex Traffic Paint 
with Titanium Dioxide 
and High Solids - Blue 1 Gal $ 5 Gal $

Zone Mark Blue 11-
55 1 Gal 19.70$        5 Gal 98.50$        

Pro Park Latex 
Traffic Marking 
Paint Blue 1 Gal 13.95$        5 Gal 63.65$        

C 9

Latex Traffic Paint 
with Titanium Dioxide 
and High Solids - 
Grey 1 Gal $ 5 Gal $ N/A 1 Gal N/A 5 Gal N/A

Pro Park Latex 
Traffic Marking 
Paint White 1 Gal 13.95$        5 Gal 63.65$        

C 10

Latex Traffic Paint 
with Titanium Dioxide 
and High Solids - 
Black 1 Gal $ 5 Gal $ N/A 1 Gal N/A 5 Gal N/A

Pro Park Latex 
Traffic Marking 
Paint Black 1 Gal 13.95$        5 Gal 63.65$        

C 11
Epoxy Wall Paint - 
Latex - Gloss 1 Gal $ 5 Gal $

Pitt Glaze WB 16-
551 Series 1 Gal 37.90$        5 Gal 189.50$      

Sherwin Williams 
Epoxy B70 1 Gal 22.62$        5 Gal 113.10$      

C 12
Epoxy Modified 
Enamel 1 Gal $ 5 Gal $ N/A 1 Gal N/A 5 Gal N/A

Pro Industrial Water-
based Alkyd 
Urethane Enamel 
Gloss 1 Gal 79.37$        5 Gal 386.35$      

C 13

Pre-catalyzed 
waterborne acrylic 
epoxy 1 Gal $ 5 Gal $

Pitt Glaze Pre Cat 
Epoxy Eggshell 16-
310; SG 16-510 1 Gal 22.00$        5 Gal 110.00$      

Pro Industrial Pre-
Catalized Epoxy 1 Gal 14.29$        5 Gal 68.75$        

C 14

Anti-slip Epoxy Floor 
Paint - with Multiple 
Color Choices

Seal Krete Floor 
Tex 1 Gal 29.35$        5 Gal 131.07$      

SFT610 PPG Anti 
Slip Safety Floor 
System 1 Gal 60.00$        5 Gal 300.00$      AS-175 1 Gal 181.55$      5 Gal $899.95

C 15
Interior/Exterior Latex 
Block Filler

McCormick 
Interior/Exterior 
Latex Block Filler 
01015 1 Gal N/A 5 Gal 41.72$        

Speedhide Block 
Filler 6-15XI 1 Gal -$            5 Gal 26.45$        Preprite Block Filler 1 Gal 5.83$          5 Gal 34.98$        

C 16

 Interior/Exterior 
Acrylic Masonry 
Primer/Sealer 

McCormick 
Permalok Int/Ext 
Acrylic Masonry 
Primer 06451 1 Gal N/A 5 Gal 75.25$        

Seal Grip Int/Ext 
Acrylic Sealer 17-
921 1 Gal 14.05$        5 Gal 70.25$        Loxon 1 Gal 10.94$        5 Gal 54.20$        

C 17
Interior/Exterior 
ACRYLIC Block Coat

McCormick 
Interior/Exterior 
Latex Block Filler 
01015 1 Gal N/A 5 Gal 41.72$        

Speedhide Block 
Filler 6-15XI 1 Gal -$            5 Gal 26.45$        

Preprite Block 
Filler 1 Gal $5.83 5 Gal 34.98$        

D 1
Rust Preventative 
spray enamel 1 Can No Bid Case No Bid

Pitt Bull 55-672 
(Case of Six) 1 Can 3.05$          Case 18.30$        

Krylon Professional 
Enamel 1 Can 4.09$          Case 24.54$        

D 2
All Surface protective 
enamels

Rustoleum 2X 
Spray Enamels - All 
Colors 591877 1 Can 3.45$          Case 20.70$        

Pitt Bull 55-672 
(Case of six) 1 Can 3.05$          Case 18.30$        Krylon All Surface 1 Can 3.77$          Case 22.62$        

D 3
Multi-Purpose Latex 
Primer Aerosol

Zinsser Bulls Eye 1-
2-3 1 Can 4.72$          Case 28.32$        

Zinnzer Bulls Eye 
WMZ02008/ea 
(Case of six) 1 Can 4.80$          Case 28.80$        1 Can No Bid Case No Bid

D 4

Multi-Purpose Oil-
based Spray Primer, 
Sealer and Stain-
Blocker

Kilz Oil Based 
Spray Primer, 
Sealer, Stain 
Blocker 5910004 1 Can 3.97$          Case 47.64$        

Seal Grip Int/Ext 
Alkyd Sealer 55-
315/54 1 Can 3.05$          Case 18.30$        

Multipurpose Oil 
Based Primer 1 Can 3.38$          Case 20.28$        
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BID 20M2, PAINT AND SUPPLIES GROUPS A - D
BID TAB

PRIMARY = YELLOW

SECONDARY = BLUE

PPG Paints Sherwin WilliamsMcCormick Paints

D 5
Stain Sealer - Vertical 
Spray Can

Zinsser B-I-N Spray 
Stain Sealer, 
Shellac Based 
5901008 1 Can 7.12$          Case 42.72$        

Zinnzer Bulls Eye 
WMZ02008/each 
(Case of six) 1 Can 4.80$          Case 28.80$        SF-1 1 Can 3.46$          Case 20.76$        

D 6
Striping Paint 18oz 
white

Rustoleum Spray 
Marking Paint, 18 
oz. White 5925938 1 Can 5.28$          Case 63.36$        

Rustolium 
RUS1618/ea 1 Can 4.95$          Case 29.70$        

Sherliner Traffic 
Marking Paint 
White 1 Can 5.03$          Case 30.18$        

D 7
Striping Paint 18oz 
yellow

Rustoleum Spray 
Marking Paint, 18 
oz. Yellow 5925488 1 Can 5.28$          Case 63.36$        

Rustolium 
RUS16488/ea 1 Can 4.95$          Case 29.70$        

Sherliner Traffic 
Marking Paint 
Yellow 1 Can 5.03$          Case 30.18$        

50%DISCOUNT OFF RETAIL
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BID 20M2, PAINT AND SUPPLIES - GROUP E
BID TAB

GRP ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT BRAND   UNIT PRICE  BRAND   UNIT PRICE  MISC BRAND   UNIT PRICE  MISC

E 1 Deep Trays - 7" - Metal 1
Arroworthy 7" Tray - 
5840012 2.60$  N/A N/A Pro 1 Deep Tray 7.07$  

E 2 Deep Trays - 9" Metal 1
Wooster 58RTL 9" 
Deep Well Metal Tray 7.89$  

Wooster 
WBC66348/EA 7.30$  Deep Tray Pro 1 Deep Tray 7.07$  

E 3 Tray Liners for Metal 9" Tray, 50/Box 1

Wooster 58PTLL 
Plastic Paint Tray Liner 
(50) 52.50$  

Wooster WBC 
13229/ea 0.89$  24 Pack Jumbo Tray Liner 0.64$  

$32 per 
case of 50

E 4 Roller Frames - 4" 1
Wooster 4" Roller 
Frame 5814840 1.69$  

Wooster 
WBC66294/ea 2.97$  Heavy Duty 4 wire cage 0.85$  

E 5 Roller Frames - 7" 1
Wooster 7" Roller 
Frame R-016 5866277 3.89$  

Wooster 
WBC66277/ea 3.99$  

Roller Frame - Heavy 
Duty 5 Wire Cage 7 
Inch 3.79$  

E 6 Roller Frames - 9" 1
Wooster 9" roller 
Frame R-016 5866279 3.95$  ARR20912/ea 1.96$  

Roller Frame - Heavy 
Duty 5 Wire Cage 9 
Inch 1.48$  

E 7 Roller Covers - 4" - 3/8" NAP 1

Arroworthy  4 x 3/8 
Lintless Cover 
5801242 1.30$  Wooster PPG59308/ea 1.65$  

Roller Cover - 
Contractor Series® 
Polyester Knit 4 Inch 
3/8 Inch Nap 1.63$  

E 8 Roller Covers - 4" - 1/4" NAP 1

Arroworhty 4 x 1/4 
Lintless Cover 
5801241 1.23$  

Wooster 
WBC13721/ea 2.05$  

Roller Cover - Mohair 4 
inch Trim 3/16 inch nap 1.39$  

E 9 Roller Covers - 4" - 1/2" NAP 1
Arroworthy 4 x 1/2 
Tradesman 5810010 1.19$  Wooster PPGX063/ea 1.89$  

Roller Cover - 
Contractor Series® 
Polyester Knit 4 Inch 
1/2 Inch Nap 1.80$  

E 10 Roller Covers - 4" - 3/4" NAP 1
Arroworthy 4 x 3/4 
Tradesman 5810014 1.24$  N/A N/A

Roller Cover - 
Contractor Series® 
Polyester Knit 4 Inch 
3/4 Inch Nap 1.82$  

E 11 Roller Covers - 7" - 3/8" NAP 1
Arroworthy 7 x 3/8 
Lintless 5801243 2.12$  

Wooster 
WBC64207/ea 2.68$  

Roller Cover - 
Contractor Series® 
Polyester Knit 7 Inch 
3/8 Inch Nap 1.94$  

E 12 Roller Covers - 7" - 1/4" NAP 1

Arroworthy 7 x 1/4 
Lintless Cover 
5810067 1.90$  

Wooster 
WBC64337/ea 3.10$  

Roller Cover - Mohair 7 
Inch Trim 3/16 Inch 
Nap 2.44$  

E 13 Roller Covers - 7" - 1/2" NAP 1

Arroworthy 7 x 1/2 
Lintless Cover 
5801244 1.86$  

Wooster 
WBC66027/ea 3.10$  

Roller Cover - 
Contractor Series® 
Polyester Knit 7 Inch 
1/2 Inch Nap 1.92$  

E 14 Roller Covers - 7" - 3/4" NAP 1

Arroworthy 7 x 3/4 
Lintless Cover 
5810079 3.25$  

Wooster 
WBC66037/ea 3.10$  

Roller Cover - 
Contractor Series® 
Polyester Knit 7 Inch 
3/4 Inch Nap 2.33$  

E 15 Roller Covers - 9" - 3/8" NAP 1

Wooster 9 x 3/8 
American Contr 
5817217 1.99$  Wooser PPGX0062/ea 2.93$  

Roller Cover - 
Contractor Series® 
High Solvent 3/8 Inch 
Nap 2.17$  

E 16 Roller Covers - 9" - 1/4" NAP 1

Arroworthy 9 x 1/4 
Lintless Cover 
5801245 2.13$  

Wooster 
WBC17692/ea 2.70$  Mohair $2.56

E 17 Roller Covers - 9" - 1/2" NAP 1

Wooster 9 x 1/2 
American Cont 
5817220 2.09$  

Wooster 
PPGX00634/ea 3.20$  

Roller Cover - 
Contractor Series® 
High Solvent 1/2 Inch 
Nap $2.33

McCormick Paints PPG Paints Sherwin Williams

PRIMARY = YELLOW

SECONDARY = BLUE
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BID 20M2, PAINT AND SUPPLIES - GROUP E
BID TAB

GRP ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT BRAND   UNIT PRICE  BRAND   UNIT PRICE  MISC BRAND   UNIT PRICE  MISC
McCormick Paints PPG Paints Sherwin Williams

PRIMARY = YELLOW

SECONDARY = BLUE

E 18 Roller Covers - 9" - 3/4" NAP 1

Wooster 9 x 3/4 
American Cont 
5817222 2.36$  Wooster PPGX0065/ea 3.40$  

Roller Cover - 
Contractor Series® 
High Solvent 3/4 Inch 
Nap $2.71

E 19
Roller Covers - 4" - 1/2" NAP, 
Professional Grade 1

Wooster 4 x 1/2 Super 
Fab 1.99$  Wooster PPGX0063/ea 1.89$  

Roller Cover - 
Contractor Series® 
Polyester Knit 4 Inch 
1/2 Inch Nap $1.81

E 20
Roller Covers - 4" - 3/4" NAP, 
Professional Grade 1

Wooster 4 x 3/4 Super 
Fab 2.07$  

Wooster 
WBC66034/ea 21.70$  

Roller Cover - 
Contractor Series® 
Polyester Knit 4 Inch 
3/4 Inch Nap 1.80$  

E 21
Roller Covers - 7" - 1/2" NAP, 
Professional Grade 1

Wooster 7 x 1/2 Super 
Fab 5866027 2.57$  

Wooster 
WBC66027/ea 2.80$  

Roller Cover - 
Contractor Series® 
Polyester Knit 7 Inch 
1/2 Inch Nap 1.90$  

E 22
Roller Covers - 7" - 3/4" NAP, 
Professional Grade 1

Wooster 7 x 3/4 Super 
Fab 58W7075 2.83$  

Wooster 
WBC66037/ea 3.15$  

Roller Cover - 
Contractor Series® 
Polyester Knit 7 Inch 
3/4 Inch Nap 2.39$  

E 23
Roller Covers - 9" - 1/2" NAP, 
Professional Grade 1

Wooster 9 x 1/2 Super 
Fab 58W9050 2.35$  Wooser WBC17723/ea 3.50$  

Roller Cover - Sher-
Fab Nylon Polyester 
Knit 9 Inch 1/2 Inch 
Nap 5.94$  

E 24
Roller Covers - 9" - 3/8" NAP, 
Professional Grade 1

Wooster 9 x 3/8 Super 
Fab 58W9038 2.28$  Wooster WBC1722/ea 2.85$  

Roller Cover - Sher-
Fab Nylon Polyester 
Knit 9 Inch 3/8 Inch 
Nap 2.14$  

E 25
Roller Covers - 9" - 3/4" NAP, 
Professional Grade 1

Wooster 9 x 3/4 Super 
Fab 58W9075 2.59$  

Wooster 
WBC17724/ea 3.45$  

Roller Cover - Sher-
Fab Nylon Polyester 
Knit 9 Inch 3/4 Inch 
Nap 6.42$  

E 26
Roller Covers - 9" - 1 1/4" NAP, 
Professional Grade 1

Wooster 9 x 1 1/4 
Super Fab 5863279 4.11$  

Wooster 
WBC17725/ea 4.15$  

Roller Cover - 
Contractor Series® 
High Solvent 1-1/4 Inch 
Nap 3.29$  

E 27

Roller Frame - 7" - Quick Clip Locking 
Handle (Wooster Sherlock or Approved 
Equal) 1

Wooster Sherlock 7" 
Frame 5812534 5.57$  

Wooster 
WBC12534/ea 6.10$  

Roller Frame - Kwik 
Release® 7 Inch 5.02$  

E 28

Roller Frame - 9" - Quick Clip Locking 
Handle (Wooster Sherlock or Approved 
Equal) 1

Wooster Sherlock 9" 
Frame 58WH9 4.94$  PPR01000/ea 4.90$  

Roller Frame - Kwik 
Release® 9 Inch 5.37$  

E 29
Brushes/Oil-Straight Type-2"-Bristle-
Lwst Cntrctr Grd. 1

Arroworthy 2" Oil Brush 
Straight 5101030 3.13$  PPG28498/ea 3.50$  

Brush - Commodore 
Plus White China 
Bristle Angle Sash 2 
Inch 5.12$  

E 30
Brushes-Latex-Straight Type-3"-
Synthetic-Lwst Cntrctr Grd 1

Merit Pro 3" Brush 
00293 2.41$  

Wooster 
WBC15541/ea 5.70$  

Brush - Premium XL 
100% Polyester Trim 
Brush 3 Inch 3.83$  

E 31
Brushes-Latex-Straight Type-2 1/2"- 
Synthetic-Lwst Cntrctr Grd 1

Merit Pro 2 1/2" Brush 
00292 2.07$  

Wooster 
WBC16127/ea 5.10$  

Brush - ProVal® Nylon 
Polyester Latex Trim 2-
1/2 Inch 5.39$  

E 32
Brushes-Latex-Straight Type 2" - 
Synthetic-Lwst. Cntrctr Grd 1

Merit Pro 2" Brush 
00290 1.64$  

Wooster 
WBC16121/ea 5.20$  

Brush - Premium XL 
100% Polyester Trim 
Brush 2 Inch 5.41$  

E 33
Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - 
Straight Type - 2" Mid-grade 1

Wooster 2" Silver Tip 
Straight 5116121 4.85$  PPG59277/ea 5.95$  

Brush - ProVal® Nylon 
Polyester Latex Trim 2 
Inch 4.08$  

BM/sg
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BID 20M2, PAINT AND SUPPLIES - GROUP E
BID TAB

GRP ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT BRAND   UNIT PRICE  BRAND   UNIT PRICE  MISC BRAND   UNIT PRICE  MISC
McCormick Paints PPG Paints Sherwin Williams

PRIMARY = YELLOW

SECONDARY = BLUE

E 34
Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - 
Straight Type - 2 1/2 " Mid-grade 1

Wooster 2 1/2" Silver 
Tip Straight 5116127 5.80$  PPG59278/ea 7.85$  

Brush - ProVal® Nylon 
Polyester Latex Trim 2-
1/2 Inch 5.39$  

E 35
Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - 
Straight Type - 3" Mid-grade 1

Wooster 3" Silver Tip 
Straight 5116129 6.53$  PPG59279/ea 10.00$  

Brush - ProVal® Nylon 
Polyester Latex Trim 3 
Inch 6.73$  

E 36
Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - 
Angle Type - 2" Mid-grade 1

Wooster 2" Silver Tip 
Angle 5115534 3.99$  PPG27491/ea 2.25$  

Brush - ProVal® Angle 
Sash 2 Inch 3.79$  

E 37
Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - 
Angle Type - 2 1/2" Mid-grade 1

Wooster 2 1/2" Silver 
Tip Angle 5115535 4.69$  PPG27492/ea 2.85$  

Brush - ProVal® Angle 
Sash 2-1/2 Inch 4.78$  

E 38
Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - 
Angle Type - 3" Mid-grade 1

Wooster 3" Silver Tip 
Angle 5116118 5.93$  

Wooster 
WBC16118/ea 6.80$  

Brush - ProVal® Angle 
Sash 3 Inch 6.31$  

E 39

Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - 
Straight Type - 2"-Prof grade (Purdy 
XLGlide or equal) 1

Wooster 4175 Mink 
Flat 5115054 7.03$  

Wooster 
WBC16121/ea 4.70$  

Brushes-Multipurpose-
nylon Bristle-straight 2" 
XL-Elasco 3.97$  

E 40

Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - 
Straight Type - 2 1/2"-Prof grade (Purdy 
XLGlide or equal) 1

Wooster 4175 Mink 
Flat 5115055 7.95$  

Wooster 
WBC16127/ea 5.15$  

Brushes-Multipurpose-
nylon Bristle-straight 2 
1/2" XL Bow 10.48$  

E 41

Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle - 
Straight Type - 3"-Prof grade (Purdy 
XLGlide or equal) 1

Wooster 4175 Mink 
Flat 5115056 10.05$  

Wooster 
WBC15542/ea 8.30$  

Brushes-Multipurpose-
nylon Bristle-straight 3" 
XL Bow 12.51$  

E 42

Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle-
Angel 2" Prof grade (Purdy, XLGlide, or 
equal) 1

Wooster 4174 
Lindbeck 5115004 7.31$  

Wooster 
WBC15534/ea 4.50$  

Brushes-Multipurpose-
nylon Bristle-angle 2" 
XL-Glide 9.36$  

E 43

Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle-
Angel 2 1 /2" Prof grade (Purdy, 
XLGlide, or equal) 1

Wooster 4174 
Lindbeck 5115005 8.61$  

Wooster 
WBC15535/ea 5.25$  

Brushes-Multipurpose-
nylon Bristle-angle 2 
1/2" XL Glide 10.99$  

E 44

Brushes - Multipurpose - Nylon Bristle-
Angel 3" Prof grade (Purdy, XLGlide, or 
equal) 1

Wooster 4174 
Lindbeck 5115006 11.32$  

Wooster 
WBC16118/ea 6.80$  

Brushes-Multipurpose-
nylon Bristle-angle 3" 
XL Glide 13.45$  

E 45 Rags-Painters Grade - 5 lb / box 1 A&B Wipers 70R5 8.95$  PPG26743/ea 11.75$  

Rags - Brick Of 
Washed White Rags 5 
Lb. 9.36$  

E 46 Drop Cloths - 9' X 12' - Plastic 2 Mil 1 Merit Pro 00387 3.96$  ZRP00704/ea 2.00$  
Dropcloth - 2 Mil Plastic 
9 Ft. x 12 Ft. 2.17$  

E 47 Drop Cloths - 4' X 15' - Canvas 10 oz. 1 Merit Pro 02045 13.75$  PPG28727/ea 12.45$  
Drop Cloth - 10 Oz. 
Canvas 4 Ft. x 15 Ft. 10.49$  

E 48 Drop Cloths - 9' X 12' - Canvas 10 oz. 1
Trimaco Canvas Drop 
53HDC9X12 15.10$  PPG59326/ea 17.50$  

Drop Cloth - 10 Oz. 
Canvas 9 Ft. x 12 Ft. 18.39$  

E 49 Drop Cloths -12' X 15' - Canvas 10 oz. 1
Trimaco Canvas Drop 
53HDC12X15 25.98$  PPG59324/ea 25.00$  

Drop Cloth - 10 Oz. 
Canvas 12 Feet x 15 
Feet 30.81$  

E 50
Drop Cloths - 4' X 15' - Butyl Rubber 
Backed Leak Proof 1

Trimaco Butyl Backed 
4 x 15 5380428 11.31$  PPG59322/ea 12.50$  

Dropcloth - Butyl Drop 
Cloth 4 Ft. x 15 Ft. 13.14$  

E 51
Drop Cloths - 9' X 12' - Butyl Rubber 
Backed Leak Proof 1

Trimaco Butyl Backed 
9 x 12 53BRC9X12 19.27$  PPG59323/ea 21.25$  

Dropcloth - Butyl Drop 
Cloth 9 Ft. x 12 Ft. 20.40$  

E 52
5 in 1 Heavy Duty Putty Knife (Purty or 
Approved Equal) 1

All Pro 5 in 1 Painters 
Tool 6680390 3.98$  PPG57600/ea 2.50$  

Joint Knife - Contractor 
5-In-1 Tool With Plastic 
Handle 1.90$  

BM/sg
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BID 20M2, PAINT AND SUPPLIES - GROUP E
BID TAB

GRP ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT BRAND   UNIT PRICE  BRAND   UNIT PRICE  MISC BRAND   UNIT PRICE  MISC
McCormick Paints PPG Paints Sherwin Williams

PRIMARY = YELLOW

SECONDARY = BLUE

E 53 Sealant - 100 % Silicone Rubber 1

DuPont 100% Silicone 
5207632/30 
White/Clear Caulk 3.85$  Top Gun 1419/ea 3.70$  

White Lightning® 
Silicone Rubber Clear 3.14$  

E 54
Interior/Exterior Latex Speed Dry Caulk 
(Dupont or Approved Equal) 1

McCormick Speed Dry 
Caulk 5200608 Tube 1.81$  Top Gun 1414X 1.35$  

Caulk - Acrylic Latex 10 
Year C950 11 Oz. 
White 1.31$  

E 55
Interior/Exterior Acrylic Elastomeric 
Caulk, Paint Grade 1

McCormick Flexseal 
500 Caulk 5200601 1.99$  Top Gun 1416/ea 2.05$  

Caulk - Megalastic 
Super Elastic 10 Oz. 
White 2.93$  

E 56
lightweight Setting-Type Joint 
Compound – Easy Sand 5 18LB 1 USG Easy Sand 5 - 18 l 10.65$  USG00467/ea 10.35$  

Joint Compound - 
Sheetrock® Easy Sand 
5 Lightweight 18 Lb. 
Bag 10.24$  

E 57
lightweight Setting-Type Joint 
Compound – Easy Sand 20 18LB 1

USG Easy Sand 20 - 
18 lbs. 56UES2018 10.65$  USG00029/ea 10.35$  

Joint Compound - Easy 
Sand 20 Lightweight 
Setting Type 18 Lb. 
Bag 9.68$  

E 58
lightweight Setting-Type Joint 
Compound – Easy Sand 45 18LB 1

USG Esey Sand 45 - 
18 lbs. 56UES4518 10.65$  USG00016/ea 10.35$  

Joint Compound -  
Easy Sand 45 
Lightweight Setting 
Type 18 Lb. Bag 10.14$  

E 59
lightweight Setting-Type Joint 
Compound – Easy Sand 90 18LB 1

USG Easy Sand 90 - 
18 lbs. 5600017 10.65$  USG00017/ea 10.35$  

Joint Compound - Easy 
Sand 90 Lightweight 
Setting Type 18 Lb. 
Bag 9.60$  

E 60
Lightweight Ready Mixed All Purpose 
Joint Compound – Plus 3™ 4 1/2 Gal 1

USG Pre-Mixed Joint 
Cmpd. Plus 
56UJCP35G 16.89$  USG20458/ea 18.00$  

Joint Compound - 
Lightweight Plus 3.47 
Lb. 4.5 Gallon Pail 19.60$  

E 61
 Midweight Ready Mixed Joint 
Compound – Ready Mixed 4 1/2 Gal 1

USG Pre-Mixed Joint 
Cmpd. 5600496 20.15$  USG20360/ea 18.00$  

Joint Compound - All 
Purpose Midweight 4.5 
Gallon Carton 15.20$  

E 62
Plastic pail high density polythylene with 
steel handle and plastic grip 1 Gal 1

Leaktite 1 Gal Plastic 
Pail 1456466 2.57$  PPG37151/ea 2.00$  

Plastic Pail High 
Density w/ steel handle 
1 gal 1.97$  

E 63
Plastic pail high density polythylene with 
steel handle and plastic grip 2 Gal 1

Letica 2 gal pail 
69MT2G 1.91$  PPG37152/ea 2.85$  

Plastic Pail High 
Density w/ steel handle 
2 gal 2.58$  

E 64
Painters Tape - Blue - 36mm x 60 yard" 
(Blue Shur or Approved equal) 1

Shur Tape 1 1/2" Blue 
Tape 55SPMT150 4.58$  PPG58501/pl 3.95$  

4 Pack 
$3.95 = 
$15.80

Masking Tape - 3M 
2993 Blue Masking 
Tape With Edge Lock 1-
1/2 Inch 5.60$  

30%DISCOUNT OFF RETAIL:

BM/sg
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