BID 21MISC11
ADAPTIVE EQUIPMENT FOR ROCK CREEK SCHOOL

FACT SHEET

A. Overview: Bids for Adaptive Equipment for Rock Creek School were opened on March 19, 2021.

1. Bid participation:

5 proposals downloaded
3 companies submitted a bid

2. Bids were received from:

Medicaleshop Inc. (New Milford, CT)
National Seating & Mobility (LaVale, MD)
T.F. Herceg, Inc., dba Surehands Lift & Care Systems (Pine Island, NY)

3. Other Facts:

The intent of this bid solicitation is to establish a contract for the purchase of adaptive equipment for the
students at the new Rock Creek School. This new school will open in July, 2021.

Bid prices are “net” inclusive of all charges for FOB destination inside delivery, uncrating, assembly,
setting in place, and removal of cartons and other debris.

To ensure safe adjustment, applications and maintenance of equipment the following additional
services were part of the bid specifications:

0 In-person Assistive Technology Professional (ATP) support the week of school opening to ensure
that all equipment is adjusted to student specific needs.

0 One full day per month ATP support for staff trainings on equipment and adjustments to equipment
due to student growth

o Tech support for identified repairs of equipment to be provided within 48 hours to limit impact on
student support and services.

o0 Vendor to support and maintain manufacturer warranties without additional cost.

The delivery, assembly, and installation schedule specified in the bid is no later than May 28, 2021.
Bidders were advised that these dates are tentative and subject to change based on the progress of
construction. Late deliveries are subject to liquidated damages.

The bid received from Medicaleshop, Inc. was considered non-responsive as they were not able to
provide the additional services specified in the bid which required in-person support and assembly and
installation.

The contract will be administered by Katie Buckley, Principal of Rock Creek School.,

4. Source of Funding: FY21 Capital Improvement Projects Budget

B. Recommendation: Staff recommends that Bid 21MISC11, Adaptive Equipment for Rock Creek School, be
awarded to National seating & Mobility (LaVale, MD) and T.F. Herceg, Inc. (Pine Island, NY), per the attached
Bid Tabulation.

C. Action taken by the Board (Purchasing use only):

KM/mg Approved Denied Deferred Other KM/mg

4.14.21

Date Date Date Date BOE Meeting: 04.14.21
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21MISC11, ADAPTIVE EQUIPMENT FOR ROCK CREEK SCHOOL

BID TABULATION

X' REQUIRES
ASSEMBLY
AND/OR SET IN
ITEM # ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY RECOMMENDED MAKE/MODEL PLACE MAKE/MODEL/PART #BID UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE [VENDOR
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX12, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDURA, 5- BUNDLE INCLUDES: 902845, 902847,
POINT HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, (2) FOOT POSITIONERS - SMALL 7-10, (2) 12.5" REAR SOLID KNOBBY 902863, 903683, (2) 903415, (2)904117,
1 TIRE AND CALF PANEL 1 |904580 X Same as RECOMMENDED MAKE/MODEL $  1,835.00 | $ 1,835.00 |Medicaleshop Inc.
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX12, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDURA, 5- BUNDLE INCLUDES: 902845, 902847,
POINT HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, (2) FOOT POSITIONERS - SMALL 7-10, (2) 12.5" REAR SOLID KNOBBY 902863, 903683, (2) 903415, (2)904117,
1 TIRE AND CALF PANEL 1 |904580 X Convaid Cruiser CX12 $  2,236.80 | $ 2,236.80 |National Seating & Mobility
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX12, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDURA, 5- BUNDLE INCLUDES: 902845, 902847,
POINT HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, (2) FOOT POSITIONERS - SMALL 7-10, (2) 12.5" REAR SOLID KNOBBY 902863, 903683, (2) 903415, (2)904117,
1 TIRE AND CALF PANEL 1 |904580 X No Bid | SureHands Lift & Care Systems
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX12, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDURA, 5- BUNDLE INCLUDES: 902845, 902848,
POINT HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, FOOT POSITIONERS, SMALL 7-10, PADDED HEADWINGS, 12.5" REAR 902863, 903683, (2) 903415, 902862,
2 SOLID KNOBBY TIRE AND CALF PANEL 1 |904117, 904580 X Same as RECOMMENDED MAKE/MODEL $ 197500 [ $ 1,975.00 [Medicaleshop Inc.
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX12, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDURA, 5- BUNDLE INCLUDES: 902845, 902848,
POINT HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, FOOT POSITIONERS, SMALL 7-10, PADDED HEADWINGS, 12.5" REAR 902863, 903683, (2) 903415, 902862,
2 SOLID KNOBBY TIRE AND CALF PANEL 1 [904117, 904580 X Convaid Cruiser CX12 $ 244400 |$ 2,444.00 |National Seating & Mobility
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX12, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDURA, 5- BUNDLE INCLUDES: 902845, 902848,
POINT HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, FOOT POSITIONERS, SMALL 7-10, PADDED HEADWINGS, 12.5" REAR 902863, 903683, (2) 903415, 902862,
2 SOLID KNOBBY TIRE AND CALF PANEL 1 |904117, 904580 X No Bid |SureHands Lift & Care Systems
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX14, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDURA, (2) BUNDLE INCLUDES: 900490, 400491,
H-HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPTH ADJ. STRAP, (2) FOOT POSITIONERS - 900484, (2) 903988, 904017, (2) 903416,
3 MEDIUM 8-11, CALF PANEL, (2) 12.5" REAR SOLID KNOBBY TIRE 1 904580, (2) 904117 X Same as RECOMMENDED MAKE/MODEL $ 194500 | $ 1,945.00 | Medicaleshop Inc.
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX14, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDURA, (2) BUNDLE INCLUDES: 900490, 400491,
H-HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPTH ADJ. STRAP, (2) FOOT POSITIONERS - 900484, (2) 903988, 904017, (2) 903416,
3 MEDIUM 8-11, CALF PANEL, (2) 12.5" REAR SOLID KNOBBY TIRE 1 |904580, (2) 904117 X Convaid Cruiser CX14 $ 245360 | $ 2,453.60 |National Seating & Mobility
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX14, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDURA, (2) BUNDLE INCLUDES: 900490, 400491,
H-HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPTH ADJ. STRAP, (2) FOOT POSITIONERS - 900484, (2) 903988, 904017, (2) 903416,
3 MEDIUM 8-11, CALF PANEL, (2) 12.5" REAR SOLID KNOBBY TIRE 1 [904580, (2) 904117 X No Bid | SureHands Lift & Care Systems
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX16, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDUA, H- BUNDLE INCLUDES: 900145, 900173,
HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPTH ADJ. STRAP, (2) FOOT POSITIONERS - 900138, 903988, 904017, (2) 903416,
4 MEDIUM 8-11, CALF PANEL, AND 125" REAR SOLID KNOBBY TIRE 2 |904580, 904117 X Same as RECOMMENDED MAKE/MODEL $ 181000 | $ 3,620.00 [Medicaleshop Inc.
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX16, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDUA, H- BUNDLE INCLUDES: 900145, 900173,
HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPTH ADJ. STRAP, (2) FOOT POSITIONERS - 900138, 903988, 904017, (2) 903416,
4 MEDIUM 8-11, CALF PANEL, AND 12.5" REAR SOLID KNOBBY TIRE 2 [904580, 904117 X Convaid Cruiser CX16 $ 225840 [$ 4,516.80 |National Seating & Mobility
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX16, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDUA, H- BUNDLE INCLUDES: 900145, 900173,
HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPTH ADJ. STRAP, (2) FOOT POSITIONERS - 900138, 903988, 904017, (2) 903416,
4 MEDIUM 8-11, CALF PANEL, AND 12.5" REAR SOLID KNOBBY TIRE 2 [904580, 904117 X No Bid | SureHands Lift & Care Systems
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX16, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDUA, H- BUNDLE INCLUDES: 900145, 900173,
HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPTH ADJ. STRAP, (2) FOOT POSITIONERS - 900138, 903988, 904017, (2) 903416,
5 MEDIUM 8-11, CALF PANEL, PADDED HEADWINGS AND 12.5" REAR SOLID KNOBBY TIRE 1 |904580, 900142, 904117 X Same as RECOMMENDED MAKE/MODEL $  1,990.00 | $ 1,990.00 | Medicaleshop Inc.
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX16, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDUA, H- BUNDLE INCLUDES: 900145, 900173,
HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPTH ADJ. STRAP, (2) FOOT POSITIONERS - 900138, 903988, 904017, (2) 903416,
5 MEDIUM 8-11, CALF PANEL, PADDED HEADWINGS AND 12.5" REAR SOLID KNOBBY TIRE 1 |904580, 900142, 904117 X Convaid Cruiser CX16 $  2453.60 | $ 2,453.60 |National Seating & Mobility
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX16, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDUA, H- BUNDLE INCLUDES: 900145, 900173,
HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPTH ADJ. STRAP, (2) FOOT POSITIONERS - 900138, 903988, 904017, (2) 903416,
5 MEDIUM 8-11, CALF PANEL, PADDED HEADWINGS AND 12.5" REAR SOLID KNOBBY TIRE 1 |904580, 900142, 904117 X No Bid [SureHands Lift & Care Systems
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX18, PANTHER BLACK, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION BUNDLE INCLUDES: 902594, 903854,
CURVED CORDURA, H-HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPT ADJ. STRAP, (2) 902596, 902619, 903988, 904017, (2)
6 FOOT POSITIONERS - LARGE 9-12, CALF PANEL, AND 8X2" FRONT RIBBED 12.5" REAR KNOBBY TIRE 1 |903417, 904580, 903084 X Same as RECOMMENDED MAKE/MODEL $  1,899.00 [ $ 1,899.00 [Medicaleshop Inc.
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX18, PANTHER BLACK, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION BUNDLE INCLUDES: 902594, 903854,
CURVED CORDURA, H-HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPT ADJ. STRAP, (2) 902596, 902619, 903988, 904017, (2)
6 FOOT POSITIONERS - LARGE 9-12, CALF PANEL, AND 8X2" FRONT RIBBED 12.5" REAR KNOBBY TIRE 1 |903417, 904580, 903084 X Convaid Cruiser CX18 $ 233840 [$ 2,338.40 |National Seating & Mobility
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX18, PANTHER BLACK, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION BUNDLE INCLUDES: 902594, 903854,
CURVED CORDURA, H-HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPT ADJ. STRAP, (2) 902596, 902619, 903988, 904017, (2)
6 FOOT POSITIONERS - LARGE 9-12, CALF PANEL, AND 8X2" FRONT RIBBED 12.5" REAR KNOBBY TIRE 1 |903417, 904580, 903084 X No Bid [SureHands Lift & Care Systems
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX18, PANTHER BLACK, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION
CURVED CORDURA, H-HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPT ADJ. STRAP, (2) BUNDLE INCLUDES: 902594, 903854,
FOOT POSITIONERS - LARGE 9-12, CALF PANEL, PADDED HEADWINGS AND 8X2" FRONT RIBBED 12.5" 902596, 902619, 903988, 904017, (2)
7 REAR KNOBBY TIRE 1 |903417, 904580, 902618, 903084 X Same as RECOMMENDED MAKE/MODEL $  2,050.00 | $ 2,050.00 |Medicaleshop Inc.
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21MISC11, ADAPTIVE EQUIPMENT FOR ROCK CREEK SCHOOL

BID TABULATION

X' REQUIRES
ASSEMBLY
AND/OR SET IN
ITEM # ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY RECOMMENDED MAKE/MODEL PLACE MAKE/MODEL/PART #BID UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE [VENDOR
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX18, PANTHER BLACK, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION
CURVED CORDURA, H-HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPT ADJ. STRAP, (2) BUNDLE INCLUDES: 902594, 903854,
FOOT POSITIONERS - LARGE 9-12, CALF PANEL, PADDED HEADWINGS AND 8X2" FRONT RIBBED 12.5" 902596, 902619, 903988, 904017, (2)
7 REAR KNOBBY TIRE 1 |903417, 904580, 902618, 903084 X Convaid Cruiser CX18 $ 254160 | $ 2,541.60 |National Seating & Mobility
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX18, PANTHER BLACK, TRANSIT OPTION, HEADREST EXTENSION
CURVED CORDURA, H-HARNESS W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPT ADJ. STRAP, (2) BUNDLE INCLUDES: 902594, 903854,
FOOT POSITIONERS - LARGE 9-12, CALF PANEL, PADDED HEADWINGS AND 8X2" FRONT RIBBED 12.5" 902596, 902619, 903988, 904017, (2)
7 REAR KNOBBY TIRE 1 [903417, 904580, 902618, 903084 X No Bid [SureHands Lift & Care Systems
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX14, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDURA, (2) H-HARNESS BUNDLE INCLUDES: 900490, 900484, (2)
W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPTH ADJ. STRAP, (2) FOOT POSITIONERS - MEDIUM 8- 903988, 904017, (2) 903416, 904580,
8 |11, CALF PANEL, PADDED HEADWINGS, (2) 12.5 REAR SOLID KNOBBY TIRE 1 |900681, (2) 904117 X Same as RECOMMENDED MAKE/MODEL $ 198500 [$ 1,985.00 | Medicaleshop Inc.
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX14, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDURA, (2) H-HARNESS BUNDLE INCLUDES: 900490, 900484, (2)
W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPTH ADJ. STRAP, (2) FOOT POSITIONERS - MEDIUM 8- 903988, 904017, (2) 903416, 904580,
8 11, CALF PANEL, PADDED HEADWINGS, (2) 12.5 REAR SOLID KNOBBY TIRE 1 |900681, (2) 904117 X Convaid Cruiser CX14 $  2,384.80 | $ 2,384.80 |National Seating & Mobility
CONVAID R82: CONVAID CRUISER CX14, HEADREST EXTENSION CURVED CORDURA, (2) H-HARNESS BUNDLE INCLUDES: 900490, 900484, (2)
W/PADDED COVERS, 3-PT POSITIONING BELT W/DEPTH ADJ. STRAP, (2) FOOT POSITIONERS - MEDIUM 8- 903988, 904017, (2) 903416, 904580,
8 11, CALF PANEL, PADDED HEADWINGS, (2) 12.5 REAR SOLID KNOBBY TIRE 1 [900681, (2) 904117 X No Bid | SureHands Lift & Care Systems
EASY STAND BANTAM MEDIUM RIGHT SIDE WITH SUPINE POSITIONING, EASY ADJUST SEAT DEPT, FRONT BUNDLE INCLUDES: PY5500-1, PY5554,
SWIVEL CASTERS, ADJUSTABLE/REMOVABLE ACUATOR HANDLE, BLACK MOLDED SWING AWAY TRAY PY5645, PY5568, PY5632, PY5656,
21X24" ELBOW PAD 13" CUTOUT, (2) SWING-AWAY KNEE PADS, (2) MULTI-ADJ. FOOTPLATES AND (2) PY5582, (2) PY5596-1, (2) PY5586, (2)
SECURE FOOT STRAPS 15"; (2) HIP SUPPORTS; 16" PLANAR BACK; VELCRO POSITIONING BELT; X-STYLE PY5368, (2) PY5560, PY5530, PY3008,
9 |CHEST VEST, 14.5X10.5"; (2) LATERAL SUPPORTS 9-14.5"; AND HEAD SUPPORT, 7X14" 1 |PNG30056, PY5562 AND PY5630 X Same as RECOMMENDED MAKE/MODEL $ 477500 | $ 4,775.00 |Medicaleshop Inc.
EASY STAND BANTAM MEDIUM RIGHT SIDE WITH SUPINE POSITIONING, EASY ADJUST SEAT DEPT, FRONT BUNDLE INCLUDES: PY5500-1, PY5554,
SWIVEL CASTERS, ADJUSTABLE/REMOVABLE ACUATOR HANDLE, BLACK MOLDED SWING AWAY TRAY PY5645, PY5568, PY5632, PY5656,
21X24" ELBOW PAD 13" CUTOUT, (2) SWING-AWAY KNEE PADS, (2) MULTI-ADJ. FOOTPLATES AND (2) PY5582, (2) PY5596-1, (2) PY5586, (2)
SECURE FOOT STRAPS 15"; (2) HIP SUPPORTS; 16" PLANAR BACK; VELCRO POSITIONING BELT; X-STYLE PY5368, (2) PY5560, PY5530, PY3008,
9 CHEST VEST, 14.5X10.5"; (2) LATERAL SUPPORTS 9-14.5"; AND HEAD SUPPORT, 7X14" 1 |PNG30056, PY5562 AND PY5630 X Easy Stand Bantam $ 572400 |$ 5,724.00 |National Seating & Mobility
EASY STAND BANTAM MEDIUM RIGHT SIDE WITH SUPINE POSITIONING, EASY ADJUST SEAT DEPT, FRONT BUNDLE INCLUDES: PY5500-1, PY5554,
SWIVEL CASTERS, ADJUSTABLE/REMOVABLE ACUATOR HANDLE, BLACK MOLDED SWING AWAY TRAY PY5645, PY5568, PY5632, PY5656,
21X24" ELBOW PAD 13" CUTOUT, (2) SWING-AWAY KNEE PADS, (2) MULTI-ADJ. FOOTPLATES AND (2) PY5582, (2) PY5596-1, (2) PY5586, (2)
SECURE FOOT STRAPS 15"; (2) HIP SUPPORTS; 16" PLANAR BACK; VELCRO POSITIONING BELT; X-STYLE PY5368, (2) PY5560, PY5530, PY3008,
9 |CHEST VEST, 14.5X10.5"; (2) LATERAL SUPPORTS 9-14.5"; AND HEAD SUPPORT, 7X14" 1 |PNG30056, PY5562 AND PY5630 X No Bid [SureHands Lift & Care Systems
BUNDLE INCLUDES: PNG50162-1,
EASY STAND EVOLV MEDIUM WITH RIGHT SIDE ACTUATOR HANDLE LOCATION, EASY-ADJUST SEAT PNG50499, PNG50483, PNG50428,
DEPTH, FRONT SWIVEL CASTERS FOR SWING AWAY FRONT, SWING AWAY FRONT FOR SHADOW TRAY, PNG50328, PNG50471-1, (2) PNG50425-
ADJ/REMOVABLE ACTUATOR HANDLE, SHADOW TRAY 7:, INDEPENDENT KNEE PADS FOR SWING AWAY, 1, (2) PNG50506, (2) PNG50198,
SECURE FOOT STRAPS 21", HIP SUPPORT 11-17", CONTOURED BACK 19", VELCRO POSITIONING BELT 26- PNG50068, PNG30029, PNG50034,
55" X-STYLE CHEST VEST 14.5X10.5"; LATERAL SUPPORTS 8-16.5"; LARGE HEAD POSITION, ADJUST-A- PNG30056, PNG50224, LINX-AP2V AND
10 |PLUSH PADS; LINX MOUNTING BRACKET, DETACHABLE 1 |M2300 X Same as RECOMMENDED MAKE/MODEL $ 473000 [ $ 4,730.00 | Medicaleshop Inc.
BUNDLE INCLUDES: PNG50162-1,
EASY STAND EVOLV MEDIUM WITH RIGHT SIDE ACTUATOR HANDLE LOCATION, EASY-ADJUST SEAT PNG50499, PNG50483, PNG50428,
DEPTH, FRONT SWIVEL CASTERS FOR SWING AWAY FRONT, SWING AWAY FRONT FOR SHADOW TRAY, PNG50328, PNG50471-1, (2) PNG50425-
ADJ/REMOVABLE ACTUATOR HANDLE, SHADOW TRAY 7:, INDEPENDENT KNEE PADS FOR SWING AWAY, 1, (2) PNG50506, (2) PNG50198,
SECURE FOOT STRAPS 21", HIP SUPPORT 11-17", CONTOURED BACK 19", VELCRO POSITIONING BELT 26- PNG50068, PNG30029, PNG50034,
55" X-STYLE CHEST VEST 14.5X10.5"; LATERAL SUPPORTS 8-16.5"; LARGE HEAD POSITION, ADJUST-A- PNG30056, PNG50224, LINX-AP2V AND
10 |PLUSH PADS; LINX MOUNTING BRACKET, DETACHABLE 1 |M2300 X Easy Stand Evolv Medium $ 588640 | $ 5,886.40 |National Seating & Mobility
BUNDLE INCLUDES: PNG50162-1,
EASY STAND EVOLV MEDIUM WITH RIGHT SIDE ACTUATOR HANDLE LOCATION, EASY-ADJUST SEAT PNG50499, PNG50483, PNG50428,
DEPTH, FRONT SWIVEL CASTERS FOR SWING AWAY FRONT, SWING AWAY FRONT FOR SHADOW TRAY, PNG50328, PNG50471-1, (2) PNG50425-
ADJ/REMOVABLE ACTUATOR HANDLE, SHADOW TRAY 7:, INDEPENDENT KNEE PADS FOR SWING AWAY, 1, (2) PNG50506, (2) PNG50198,
SECURE FOOT STRAPS 21", HIP SUPPORT 11-17", CONTOURED BACK 19", VELCRO POSITIONING BELT 26- PNG50068, PNG30029, PNG50034,
55" X-STYLE CHEST VEST 14.5X10.5"; LATERAL SUPPORTS 8-16.5"; LARGE HEAD POSITION, ADJUST-A- PNG30056, PNG50224, LINX-AP2V AND
10  |PLUSH PADS; LINX MOUNTING BRACKET, DETACHABLE 1 |M2300 X No Bid [SureHands Lift & Care Systems
EASY STAND EVOLVE MEDIUM WITH RIGHT SIDE ACTUATOR HANDLE LOCATION, EASY-ADJUST SEAT
DEPTH, FRONT SWIVEL CASTERS FOR SWING AWAY FRONT, SWING-AWAY FRONT FOR SHADOW TRAY, BUNDLE INCLUDES: PNG50162-1,
ADJ/REMOVABLE ACTUATOR HANDLE, SHADOW TRAY 7", (2) INDEPENDENT KNEE PADS FOR SWING PNG50499, PNG50483, PNG50428,
AWAY, (2) SECURE FOOT STRAPS, 21", (2) HIP SUPPORTS 11-17", CONTOURED BACK 19", VELCRO PNG50328, PNG50471-1,(2) PNG50425-
POSITIONING BELT 26-55" ACCESSORIES MOUNTING BRACKET - POSITION & UPPER BODY SUPPORT; X- 1,(2) PNG50506, (2) PNG50198,
STYLE CHEST VEST 14.5X10.5" POSITIONING & UPPER BODY SUPPORTS; LATERAL SUPPORTS 8-16.5" PNG50068, PNG30029, PNG50034,
POSITIONING & UPPER BODY SUPPORTS; LARGE HEAD POSITION, ADJUST-A-PLUSH PADS,LINX, DARTEX; PNG30056, PNG50224, LINX-AP2V AND
11 |AND LINX MOUNTING BRACKET, DETACHABLE 1 |M2300 X Same as RECOMMENDED MAKE/MODEL $ 473000 | $ 4,730.00 | Medicaleshop Inc.
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21MISC11, ADAPTIVE EQUIPMENT FOR ROCK CREEK SCHOOL

BID TABULATION

X' REQUIRES
ASSEMBLY
AND/OR SET IN
ITEM # ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY RECOMMENDED MAKE/MODEL PLACE MAKE/MODEL/PART #BID UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE [VENDOR
EASY STAND EVOLVE MEDIUM WITH RIGHT SIDE ACTUATOR HANDLE LOCATION, EASY-ADJUST SEAT
DEPTH, FRONT SWIVEL CASTERS FOR SWING AWAY FRONT, SWING-AWAY FRONT FOR SHADOW TRAY, BUNDLE INCLUDES: PNG50162-1,
ADJ/REMOVABLE ACTUATOR HANDLE, SHADOW TRAY 7", (2) INDEPENDENT KNEE PADS FOR SWING PNG50499, PNG50483, PNG50428,
AWAY, (2) SECURE FOOT STRAPS, 21", (2) HIP SUPPORTS 11-17", CONTOURED BACK 19", VELCRO PNG50328, PNG50471-1,(2) PNG50425-
POSITIONING BELT 26-55" ACCESSORIES MOUNTING BRACKET - POSITION & UPPER BODY SUPPORT; X- 1,(2) PNG50506, (2) PNG50198,
STYLE CHEST VEST 14.5X10.5" POSITIONING & UPPER BODY SUPPORTS; LATERAL SUPPORTS 8-16.5" PNG50068, PNG30029, PNG50034,
POSITIONING & UPPER BODY SUPPORTS; LARGE HEAD POSITION, ADJUST-A-PLUSH PADS,LINX, DARTEX; PNG30056, PNG50224, LINX-AP2V AND
11 |AND LINX MOUNTING BRACKET, DETACHABLE 1 |M2300 X Easy Stand Evolv Medium $ 5886.40 | $ 5,886.40 |National Seating & Mobility
EASY STAND EVOLVE MEDIUM WITH RIGHT SIDE ACTUATOR HANDLE LOCATION, EASY-ADJUST SEAT
DEPTH, FRONT SWIVEL CASTERS FOR SWING AWAY FRONT, SWING-AWAY FRONT FOR SHADOW TRAY, BUNDLE INCLUDES: PNG50162-1,
ADJ/REMOVABLE ACTUATOR HANDLE, SHADOW TRAY 7", (2) INDEPENDENT KNEE PADS FOR SWING PNG50499, PNG50483, PNG50428,
AWAY, (2) SECURE FOOT STRAPS, 21", (2) HIP SUPPORTS 11-17", CONTOURED BACK 19", VELCRO PNG50328, PNG50471-1,(2) PNG50425-
POSITIONING BELT 26-55" ACCESSORIES MOUNTING BRACKET - POSITION & UPPER BODY SUPPORT; X- 1,(2) PNG50506, (2) PNG50198,
STYLE CHEST VEST 14.5X10.5" POSITIONING & UPPER BODY SUPPORTS; LATERAL SUPPORTS 8-16.5" PNG50068, PNG30029, PNG50034,
POSITIONING & UPPER BODY SUPPORTS; LARGE HEAD POSITION, ADJUST-A-PLUSH PADS,LINX, DARTEX; PNG30056, PNG50224, LINX-AP2V AND
11 AND LINX MOUNTING BRACKET, DETACHABLE 1 M2300 X No Bid | SureHands Lift & Care Systems
BUNDLE INCLUDES: AS2000, REAR
FREEDOM CONCEPTS AS2000 TRICYCLE, REAR STEER, GREY, RATCHETING FOOTPLATE ASMY RIGID STEER, CUSTOM COLOR, (2) 2012054,
12 |PAIR, FOOT PLATE FRONT PULLEY, ABS ENCLOSED CHAINGUARD AND BACKREST KIT ADULT HIGH BACK 1 |2115020, ABS ENCLOSED AND 2114020 X No Bid [Medicaleshop Inc.
BUNDLE INCLUDES: AS2000, REAR
FREEDOM CONCEPTS AS2000 TRICYCLE, REAR STEER, GREY, RATCHETING FOOTPLATE ASMY RIGID STEER, CUSTOM COLOR, (2) 2012054,
12 |PAIR, FOOT PLATE FRONT PULLEY, ABS ENCLOSED CHAINGUARD AND BACKREST KIT ADULT HIGH BACK 1 |2115020, ABS ENCLOSED AND 2114020 X AS2000 $ 482400 [ $ 4,824.00 |National Seating & Mobility
BUNDLE INCLUDES: AS2000, REAR
FREEDOM CONCEPTS AS2000 TRICYCLE, REAR STEER, GREY, RATCHETING FOOTPLATE ASMY RIGID STEER, CUSTOM COLOR, (2) 2012054,
12 |PAIR, FOOT PLATE FRONT PULLEY, ABS ENCLOSED CHAINGUARD AND BACKREST KIT ADULT HIGH BACK 1 |2115020, ABS ENCLOSED AND 2114020 X No Bid [SureHands Lift & Care Systems
FREEDOM CONCEPTS DCP 12 TRICYCLE, REAR STEER, BLACK, ON/OFF PIN RECIPROCATOR GEAR KIT, BUNDLE INCLUDES DCP12, REAR
FORK-ADJUSTABLE TILT DCP 12 FORK KIT, RATCHETING FOOTPLT ASMY-RIGID SMALL, FOOTPLATE STEER, BLACK, 2012289, 211261,
FRONT PULLEY SYSTEM KIT CHAINGUARD KIT DCP ENCLOSED BACKREST KIT CHILD HIGH BACK AND FC1 2012052, 2115020, 2112109, 2114010
13 |ADJUSTABLED REMOVABLE HEADREST 1 |AND HEADREST X No Bid [Medicaleshop Inc.
FREEDOM CONCEPTS DCP 12 TRICYCLE, REAR STEER, BLACK, ON/OFF PIN RECIPROCATOR GEAR KIT, BUNDLE INCLUDES DCP12, REAR
FORK-ADJUSTABLE TILT DCP 12 FORK KIT, RATCHETING FOOTPLT ASMY-RIGID SMALL, FOOTPLATE STEER, BLACK, 2012289, 211261,
FRONT PULLEY SYSTEM KIT CHAINGUARD KIT DCP ENCLOSED BACKREST KIT CHILD HIGH BACK AND FC1 2012052, 2115020, 2112109, 2114010
13 |ADJUSTABLED REMOVABLE HEADREST 1 |AND HEADREST X DCP12 Black $  4,404.00 | $ 4,404.00 |National Seating & Mobility
FREEDOM CONCEPTS DCP 12 TRICYCLE, REAR STEER, BLACK, ON/OFF PIN RECIPROCATOR GEAR KIT, BUNDLE INCLUDES DCP12, REAR
FORK-ADJUSTABLE TILT DCP 12 FORK KIT, RATCHETING FOOTPLT ASMY-RIGID SMALL, FOOTPLATE STEER, BLACK, 2012289, 211261,
FRONT PULLEY SYSTEM KIT CHAINGUARD KIT DCP ENCLOSED BACKREST KIT CHILD HIGH BACK AND FC1 2012052, 2115020, 2112109, 2114010
13 |ADJUSTABLED REMOVABLE HEADREST 1 |AND HEADREST X No Bid | SureHands Lift & Care Systems
FREEDOM CONCEPTS DCP 12 TRICYCLE, REAR STEER, METALLIC GREEN, RATCHETING FOOTPLATE BUNDLE INCLUDES: DCP12, REAR
ASMY RIGID SMALL PAIR, FOOTPLATE FRONT PULLEY SYSTEM, CHAINGUARD KIT DCP ENCLOSED AND STEER, METALLIC GREEN, 2012052,
14 |BACKREST KIT CHILD HIGH BACK 1 |2115020, 2112109 AND 2114010 X No Bid [Medicaleshop Inc.
FREEDOM CONCEPTS DCP 12 TRICYCLE, REAR STEER, METALLIC GREEN, RATCHETING FOOTPLATE BUNDLE INCLUDES: DCP12, REAR
ASMY RIGID SMALL PAIR, FOOTPLATE FRONT PULLEY SYSTEM, CHAINGUARD KIT DCP ENCLOSED AND STEER, METALLIC GREEN, 2012052,
14 |BACKREST KIT CHILD HIGH BACK 1 |2115020, 2112109 AND 2114010 X DCP12 Green $  3448.00 | $ 3,448.00 |National Seating & Mobility
FREEDOM CONCEPTS DCP 12 TRICYCLE, REAR STEER, METALLIC GREEN, RATCHETING FOOTPLATE BUNDLE INCLUDES: DCP12, REAR
ASMY RIGID SMALL PAIR, FOOTPLATE FRONT PULLEY SYSTEM, CHAINGUARD KIT DCP ENCLOSED AND STEER, METALLIC GREEN, 2012052,
14  |BACKREST KIT CHILD HIGH BACK 1 |2115020, 2112109 AND 2114010 X No Bid SureHands Lift & Care Systems
FREEDOM CONCEPTS DCP 16 TRICYCLE, REAR STEER, METALLIC ORANGE, ON/OFF PIN RECIPROCATOR BUNDLE INCLUDES: DCP16, REAR
GEAR KIT, FORK ADJUSTABLE TILT, (2) ATCHETING FOOTPLTE ASSY RIGID MEDIUM, FOOTPLATE FRONT STEER, METALLIC ORANGE, 2012289,
PULLEY SYSTEM, CHAINGUARD KIT DCP ENCLOSED, BACKREST KIT CHILD HIGH BACK AND FCI 211260, (2) 2012053, 2115020, 2112109,
15 |ADJUSTABLE REMOVABLE HEADREST OPTION 1 |2114010 AND HEADREST X No Bid [Medicaleshop Inc.
FREEDOM CONCEPTS DCP 16 TRICYCLE, REAR STEER, METALLIC ORANGE, ON/OFF PIN RECIPROCATOR BUNDLE INCLUDES: DCP16, REAR
GEAR KIT, FORK ADJUSTABLE TILT, (2) ATCHETING FOOTPLTE ASSY RIGID MEDIUM, FOOTPLATE FRONT STEER, METALLIC ORANGE, 2012289,
PULLEY SYSTEM, CHAINGUARD KIT DCP ENCLOSED, BACKREST KIT CHILD HIGH BACK AND FCI 211260, (2) 2012053, 2115020, 2112109,
15 |ADJUSTABLE REMOVABLE HEADREST OPTION 1 2114010 AND HEADREST X DCP16 Orange $  3,864.00 | $ 3,864.00 |National Seating & Mobility
FREEDOM CONCEPTS DCP 16 TRICYCLE, REAR STEER, METALLIC ORANGE, ON/OFF PIN RECIPROCATOR BUNDLE INCLUDES: DCP16, REAR
GEAR KIT, FORK ADJUSTABLE TILT, (2) ATCHETING FOOTPLTE ASSY RIGID MEDIUM, FOOTPLATE FRONT STEER, METALLIC ORANGE, 2012289,
PULLEY SYSTEM, CHAINGUARD KIT DCP ENCLOSED, BACKREST KIT CHILD HIGH BACK AND FCI 211260, (2) 2012053, 2115020, 2112109,
15 |ADJUSTABLE REMOVABLE HEADREST OPTION 1 2114010 AND HEADREST X No Bid | SureHands Lift & Care Systems
BUNDLE INCLUDES: DCP16, REAR
FREEDOM CONCEPTS DCP 16 TRICYCLE, REAR STEER, RED, (2) RATCHETING FOOTPLAT ASMY RIGID STEER, RED, (2) 2012053, 2115020 AND
16 |MEDIUM PAIR, FOOTPLATE FRONT PULLEY SYSTEM AND BACKREST KIT CHILD HIGH BACK 1 |2114010 X No Bid [Medicaleshop Inc.
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BUNDLE INCLUDES: DCP16, REAR
FREEDOM CONCEPTS DCP 16 TRICYCLE, REAR STEER, RED, (2) RATCHETING FOOTPLAT ASMY RIGID STEER, RED, (2) 2012053, 2115020 AND
16 |MEDIUM PAIR, FOOTPLATE FRONT PULLEY SYSTEM AND BACKREST KIT CHILD HIGH BACK 1 |2114010 X DCP16 Red $  3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 |National Seating & Mobility
BUNDLE INCLUDES: DCP16, REAR
FREEDOM CONCEPTS DCP 16 TRICYCLE, REAR STEER, RED, (2) RATCHETING FOOTPLAT ASMY RIGID STEER, RED, (2) 2012053, 2115020 AND
16  |MEDIUM PAIR, FOOTPLATE FRONT PULLEY SYSTEM AND BACKREST KIT CHILD HIGH BACK 1 |2114010 X No Bid [SureHands Lift & Care Systems
KIDWALK El, KIDWALK El UPPER BODY
SUPPORT OPTIONS, KIDWALK EI
PRIME ENG KIDWALK EI DYNAMIC MOBILITY SYSTEM, El SOFT LATERAL CHEST SYSTEM, CONTOURED SUPPORT OPTIONS, KIDWALK EI
17 |MEDIUM HEADREST, CRUISER WHEELS, DIRECTIONAL LOCKS AND ANTI-ROLLBACK DEVICE 1 |LOWER EXTREMITY OPTIONS X No Bid [Medicaleshop Inc.
KIDWALK El, KIDWALK El UPPER BODY
SUPPORT OPTIONS, KIDWALK EI
PRIME ENG KIDWALK EI DYNAMIC MOBILITY SYSTEM, El SOFT LATERAL CHEST SYSTEM, CONTOURED SUPPORT OPTIONS, KIDWALK EI
17 |[MEDIUM HEADREST, CRUISER WHEELS, DIRECTIONAL LOCKS AND ANTI-ROLLBACK DEVICE 1 |LOWER EXTREMITY OPTIONS X Kidwalk EI $ 387840 (S 3,878.40 |National Seating & Mobility
KIDWALK El, KIDWALK El UPPER BODY
SUPPORT OPTIONS, KIDWALK EI
PRIME ENG KIDWALK EI DYNAMIC MOBILITY SYSTEM, El SOFT LATERAL CHEST SYSTEM, CONTOURED SUPPORT OPTIONS, KIDWALK EI
17 |MEDIUM HEADREST, CRUISER WHEELS, DIRECTIONAL LOCKS AND ANTI-ROLLBACK DEVICE 1 |LOWER EXTREMITY OPTIONS X No Bid [SureHands Lift & Care Systems
KIDWALK & KIDWALK I, KIDWALK &
KIDWALK Il UPPER BODY SUPPORT
PRIME ENG KIDWALK Il DYNAMIC MOBILITY SYSTEM, LATERAL CHEST SYSTEM, CONTOURED MEDIUM OPTION, KIDWALK & KIDWALK Il
18 |HEADREST, DIRECTIONL LOCKS AND ANTI-ROLLBACK DEVICE 1 |SUPPORT OPTIONS X No Bid [Medicaleshop Inc.
KIDWALK & KIDWALK I, KIDWALK &
KIDWALK Il UPPER BODY SUPPORT
PRIME ENG KIDWALK Il DYNAMIC MOBILITY SYSTEM, LATERAL CHEST SYSTEM, CONTOURED MEDIUM OPTION, KIDWALK & KIDWALK Il
18 |HEADREST, DIRECTIONL LOCKS AND ANTI-ROLLBACK DEVICE 1 |SUPPORT OPTIONS X Kidwalk Il $ 419920 [ $ 4,199.20 |National Seating & Mobility
KIDWALK & KIDWALK I, KIDWALK &
KIDWALK Il UPPER BODY SUPPORT
PRIME ENG KIDWALK Il DYNAMIC MOBILITY SYSTEM, LATERAL CHEST SYSTEM, CONTOURED MEDIUM OPTION, KIDWALK & KIDWALK Il
18 HEADREST, DIRECTIONL LOCKS AND ANTI-ROLLBACK DEVICE 1 |SUPPORT OPTIONS X No Bid [SureHands Lift & Care Systems
KIDWALK & KIDWALK I, KIDWALK &
KIDWALK Il UPPER BODY SUPPORT
PRINE ENG KIDWALK DYNAMIC MOBILITY SYSTEM, LATERAL CHEST SYSTEM, CONTOURED MEDIUM OPTIONS, KIDWALK & KIDWALK Il
19  |HEADREST, CRUISER WHEELS, DIRECTIONAL LOCKS AND ANTI-ROLLBACK DEVICE 1 |SuPPORT oPTIONS X No Bid [Medicaleshop Inc.
KIDWALK & KIDWALK I, KIDWALK &
KIDWALK Il UPPER BODY SUPPORT
PRINE ENG KIDWALK DYNAMIC MOBILITY SYSTEM, LATERAL CHEST SYSTEM, CONTOURED MEDIUM OPTIONS, KIDWALK & KIDWALK Il
19 HEADREST, CRUISER WHEELS, DIRECTIONAL LOCKS AND ANTI-ROLLBACK DEVICE 1 |SUPPORT OPTIONS X Kidwalk $ 399840 |$ 3,998.40 |National Seating & Mobility
KIDWALK & KIDWALK I, KIDWALK &
KIDWALK Il UPPER BODY SUPPORT
PRINE ENG KIDWALK DYNAMIC MOBILITY SYSTEM, LATERAL CHEST SYSTEM, CONTOURED MEDIUM OPTIONS, KIDWALK & KIDWALK Il
19  |HEADREST, CRUISER WHEELS, DIRECTIONAL LOCKS AND ANTI-ROLLBACK DEVICE 1 |SuPPORT OPTIONS X No Bid [SureHands Lift & Care Systems
ADDITIONAL SERIVCE: IN PERSON ASSISTIVE TECHNOLOGY PROFESSIONAL (ATP) (NOT TECH) SUPPORT We are out of state bidder and we are not able to provide the services which requires physical presence and in-house assembly and installation of the
20 |FOR THE FIRST WEEK OF SCHOOL. 1 product. Medicaleshop Inc.
ADDITIONAL SERIVCE: IN PERSON ASSISTIVE TECHNOLOGY PROFESSIONAL (ATP) (NOT TECH) SUPPORT
20  |FOR THE FIRST WEEK OF SCHOOL. 1 Supporting @n/c $ - |s - [National Seating & Mobility
ADDITIONAL SERIVCE: IN PERSON ASSISTIVE TECHNOLOGY PROFESSIONAL (ATP) (NOT TECH) SUPPORT
20 |FOR THE FIRST WEEK OF SCHOOL. 1 No Bid [SureHands Lift & Care Systems
ADDITIONAL SERVICE: IN PERSON ASSISTIVE TECHNOLOGY PROFESSIONAL (ATP) FOR ONE FULL DAY We are out of state bidder and we are not able to provide the services which requires physical presence and in-house assembly and installation of the
21 |PER MONTH FOR THE FIRST YEAR. 1 product. Medicaleshop Inc.
ADDITIONAL SERVICE: IN PERSON ASSISTIVE TECHNOLOGY PROFESSIONAL (ATP) FOR ONE FULL DAY
21 |PER MONTH FOR THE FIRST YEAR. 1 Supporting @n/c $ - |s - [National Seating & Mobility
ADDITIONAL SERVICE: IN PERSON ASSISTIVE TECHNOLOGY PROFESSIONAL (ATP) FOR ONE FULL DAY
21 PER MONTH FOR THE FIRST YEAR. 1 No Bid [SureHands Lift & Care Systems
22 [CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, DAYLITE FABRIC 30 |SUREHANDS #3445M (MEDIUM) No Bid [Medicaleshop Inc.
22 |CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, DAYLITE FABRIC 30 |SUREHANDS #3445M (MEDIUM) No Bid [National Seating & Mobility
22 |CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, DAYLITE FABRIC 30 |SUREHANDS #3445M (MEDIUM) Part #3445M $ 548.07 [ $  16,442.10 |SureHands Lift & Care Systems
23 [CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, DAYLITE FABRIC 20 |SUREHANDS #3445L (LARGE) No Bid [Medicaleshop Inc.
23 |CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, DAYLITE FABRIC 20 |SUREHANDS #3445L (LARGE) No Bid [National Seating & Mobility
23 |CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, DAYLITE FABRIC 20 |SUREHANDS #3445L (LARGE) Part #3445L $ 548.07 [ $  10,961.40 |SureHands Lift & Care Systems
24 |CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, DAYLITE FABRIC 2 |SUREHANDS #3455XL (EXTRA LARGE) No Bid [Medicaleshop Inc.
24 |CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, DAYLITE FABRIC 2 |SUREHANDS #3455XL (EXTRA LARGE) No Bid [National Seating & Mobility
24 |CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, DAYLITE FABRIC 2 |SUREHANDS #3455XL (EXTRA LARGE) Part #34455XL $ 548.07 | $ 1,096.14 |SureHands Lift & Care Systems
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25 |CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, MESH FABRIC 15 |SUREHANDS #3431M (MEDIUM) No Bid |Medicaleshop Inc.
25 |CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, MESH FABRIC 15 |SUREHANDS #3431M (MEDIUM) No Bid [National Seating & Mobility
25 |CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, MESH FABRIC 15 |SUREHANDS #3431M (MEDIUM) Part #3431M $ 479.04 | $ 7,185.60 |SureHands Lift & Care Systems
26 |CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, MESH FABRIC 10 |SUREHANDS #3431L (LARGE) No Bid |Medicaleshop Inc.
26 |CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, MESH FABRIC 10 [SUREHANDS #3431L (LARGE) No Bid National Seating & Mobility
26 |CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, MESH FABRIC 10 |SUREHANDS #3431L (LARGE) Part #3431L $ 479.04 | $ 4,790.40 | SureHands Lift & Care Systems
27 |CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, MESH FABRIC 2 |SUREHANDS #3431XL (EXTRA LARGE) No Bid [Medicaleshop Inc.
27 |CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, MESH FABRIC 2 |SUREHANDS #3431XL (EXTRA LARGE) No Bid |National Seating & Mobility
27 |CONTOUR SLING (STANDARD) PADDED LEGS, 4 STRAPS, MESH FABRIC 2 |SUREHANDS #3431XL (EXTRA LARGE) Part #3431XL $ 479.04 | $ 958.08 [SureHands Lift & Care Systems
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