
BID 19FS2 
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT 

(RENEWAL) 
 

FACT SHEET 
 
A. Overview:  This recommendation is to renew the contract for the purchase of kitchen equipment for 

use by the Food and Nutrition Services Department.  
 
  

 1. Other facts: 
 

• The renewal period will be effective from December 1, 2020 through November 30, 2021, with 
one one-year renewal option remaining.    
 

• Line items 1A and 13A were added to the market basket during the first contract period via 
quotation.  

 
• Approximately $55,000 was spent during FY20. 

 
• This contract will be administrated by Robert Kelly, Director, Food and Nutrition Services. 

 
2. Source of funding:  FY21 Approved Capital and Food and Nutrition Services Budgets and 

contingent upon Board approval of the FY22 Capital and Food and Nutrition Services Budgets.  
 

 
B.  Recommendation:  Staff recommends that Bid 19FS2, Kitchen Equipment be renewed to various 

vendors, per the attached Summary of Renewal. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
C. Action taken by the Board (Purchasing use only): 
   
 _____Approved          _____Denied       _____Deferred          _____Other       SR/kl 
 
 _____Date                  _____Date    _____Date                _____Date        BOE Mtg.:  11.11.20 
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BID 19FS2, KITCHEN EQUIPMENT
SUMMARY OF RENEWAL

DESCRIPTION Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

Make Groen Bid Price $8,858.00 Bid Price $12,539.23 Bid Price $6,608.75 Bid Price $28,958.36 Bid Price $7,914.00
Model # XS-480-12-3 Installation Price NO BID Installation Price $500.00 Installation Price $1,100.00 Installation Price $2,350.00 Installation Price Included

Total Price $8,858.00 Total Price $13,039.23 Total Price $7,708.75 Total Price $31,308.36 Total Price $15,828.00
Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) 14-21 Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45
Warranty 1 yr parts & labor, 5 yr cavity

Warranty 1 year parts and labor Warranty
see manufacturers warranty

Warranty
1 year parts & labor; 5 yr cavity

Warranty 2 yrs parts & labor

Make Groen Bid Price $12,200.00
Model # XS-208-12-3 Installation Price $500.00

Total Price $12,700.00
Additional Item Price: $735.00
Lead Time (Business Days) 14-21

Warranty 1 year parts and labor, 5 year 
cavity warranty

Make Garland Bid Price $4,869.00 Bid Price Bid Price $4,567.18 Bid Price $4,673.13 Bid Price $5,286.47
Model # SCO-ES-20S Installation Price NO BID Installation Price Installation Price $1,430.00 Installation Price $1,920.00 Installation Price Included

Total Price $4,869.00 Total Price $0.00 Total Price $5,997.18 Total Price $6,593.13 Total Price $5,286.47
Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 25 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Warranty

1 yr limited parts warranty & 1 yr labor , 
door warranty 3 yr. Limited parts exept 

window, covers products purchased 
and installed in USA

Warranty Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty 1 year limited parts and labor door; 
3 yr limited parts except window Warranty 1 yr limited

Make Southbend Bid Price $6,680.00 Bid Price $7,468.54 Bid Price $9,275.50 Bid Price $7,958.94 Bid Price $8,648.41
Model # SLES-20SC Installation Price NO BID Installation Price $500.00 Installation Price $1,580.00 Installation Price $1,920.00 Installation Price Included

Total Price $6,680.00 Total Price $7,968.54 Total Price $10,855.50 Total Price $9,878.94 Total Price $8,648.41
Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) 14-21 Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Warranty 2 yr parts & labor, 5 yr on door Warranty 2 years parts and labor Warranty
see manufacturers warranty

Warranty 2 year parts & labor; 5 year on door Warranty 2 yr parts & labor; 5 yr on door 
parts excluding glass

Make Garland Bid Price $2,460.00 Bid Price Bid Price $2,611.07 Bid Price $3,320.42 Bid Price $2,811.24
Model # SCO-ES-10S Installation Price NO BID Installation Price Installation Price $1,320.00 Installation Price $1,800.00 Installation Price Included

Total Price $2,460.00 Total Price Total Price $3,931.07 Total Price $5,120.42 Total Price $2,811.24
Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Warranty
1 yr limited parts, 1 yr labor. Door 
warranty 3 yr limited parts except 

window
Warranty Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty

1 year limited parts warranty & 
labor door warranty. 3 year limited 

parts except window
Warranty 1 yr limited

Bid Price Bid Price $4,043.79 Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
Make Southbend Installation Price Installation Price $500.00 Installation Price Installation Price Installation Price
Model # SLES/10SC Total Price Total Price $4,543.79 Total Price Total Price Total Price

Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 14-21 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days)
Warranty Warranty 2 yr parts and labor Warranty Warranty Warranty

Make Vulcan Bid Price $15,413.00 Bid Price Bid Price $13,499.70 Bid Price $16,609.41 Bid Price $17,088.61
Model # ABC7E-480 Installation Price NO BID Installation Price Installation Price $2,175.00 Installation Price $3,100.00 Installation Price Included

Total Price $15,413.00 Total Price $0.00 Total Price $15,674.70 Total Price $19,709.41 Total Price $17,088.61
Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45
Warranty 1 yr limited parts & labor Warranty Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty 1 year limited parts & labor Warranty 2 yrs limited

Make Vulcan Bid Price $15,935.00 Bid Price Bid Price $13,802.56 Bid Price $16,976.75 Bid Price $17,466.55
Model # ABC7G Installation Price NO BID Installation Price Installation Price $1,825.00 Installation Price $3,100.00 Installation Price Included

Total Price $15,935.00 Total Price $0.00 Total Price $15,627.56 Total Price $20,076.75 Total Price $17,466.55
Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45
Warranty 1 yr limited parts & labor Warranty Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty 1 year limited parts & labor Warranty 2 yrs limited

Make Blodgett Bid Price $19,040.00 Bid Price $17,851.67 Bid Price $20,019.63 Bid Price $21,050.26 Bid Price $22,449.60
Model # HV-100E Double Installation Price NO BID Installation Price $500.00 Installation Price $1,430.00 Installation Price $2,500.00 Installation Price Included

Total Price $19,040.00 Total Price $18,351.67 Total Price $21,449.63 Total Price $23,550.26 Total Price $22,449.60
Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) 14-21 Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 35 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45
Warranty 1 yr parts and labor Warranty 1 year parts and labor Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty 1 year parts & labor Warranty 1 yr 

Make Master-bilt Bid Price $965.00 Bid Price Bid Price $986.90 Bid Price $1,985.20 Bid Price $908.91
Model # MSF-43AN Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 25 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Warranty
1 yr parts 7 labor. 5yr compressor

Warranty Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty 1 year parts & labor; 5 year 
compressor Warranty 1 yr parts & labor; 5 yr 

compressor parts
Model # Hoshizaki Bid Price $3,605.00 Bid Price $4,320.62 Bid Price $4,761.80 Bid Price $5,085.40 Bid Price $4,008.12
Make CF2S-FS Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) 1 Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Warranty 3 yr parts & labor. 5 yr parts on 
compressor Warranty 3 year parts and labor / 5 year 

compressor Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty 3 year parts & labor machine; 5 
year compressor Warranty 3 yr parts & labor; 5 yr 

compressor parts

Make Hoshizaki Bid Price $2,737.00 Bid Price $3,425.66 Bid Price $3,700.11 Bid Price $4,131.14 Bid Price $3,043.53

Model # CR2S-FS Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) 1 Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Warranty
3 yr parts & labor. 5 yr parts on 

compressor Warranty
3 year parts and labor / 5 year 

compressor Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty 3 year parts & labor machine; 5 
year compressor Warranty 3 yr parts & labor; 5 yr 

compressor parts

Make Hoshizaki Bid Price $2,056.00 Bid Price $2,521.77 Bid Price $2,865.93 Bid Price $3,366.36 Bid Price $2,285.72
Model # CR1S-FS Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) 1 Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Warranty
3 yr parts & labor. 5 yr parts on 

compressor Warranty
3 year parts and labor / 5 year 

compressor Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty 3 year parts & labor machine; 5 
year compressor Warranty 3 yr parts & labor; 5 yr 

compressor parts

Make Regency Bid Price NO BID Bid Price Bid Price $254.50 Bid Price $948.05 Bid Price $262.80
Model # 600PR203W Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 12 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Warranty Warranty Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty Warranty see bid

Make Beverage Air Bid Price $3,143.00 Bid Price $3,014.60 Bid Price $2,447.03 Bid Price $3,358.44 Bid Price $3,026.32
Model # ST34N-S Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) 7-14 Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 25 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Warranty
3ys parts & labor. Add'l 2 yr compressor

Warranty
3 years parts and labor, 5 year 

compressor Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty 3 year parts & labor  Warranty 3 yr parts & labor; 5 yr 
compressor parts

Make Beverage Air Bid Price $2,564.26
Model # SMF49HC-1-S Installation Price Dock Deliery Included

Total Price $2,564.26
Lead Time (Business Days) 30

Warranty

3 year parts & labor warranty 
(exludes maintenance items) 4 

years compressor warranty (part 
only)

23,550.26$        

1,985.20$          

5,085.40$          

3,366.36$          

948.05$             

2,564.26$          

4,131.14$          

3,358.44$          

DOUGLAS FOOD STORES, INC. dba:  DOUGLAS EQUIPMENT

31,308.36$        

6,593.13$          

9,878.94$          

19,709.41$        

20,076.75$        

5,120.42$          

CLARK ASSOCIATES dba:  CLARK FOOD SERVICE EQUIPMENT

7,708.75$         

5,997.18$         

10,855.50$       

15,674.70$       

3,931.07$         

15,627.56$       

4,320.62$         

3,425.66$         

2,521.77$         

NO BID

3,014.60$         

CAREY SALES AND SERVICES, INC.

13,039.23$       

NO BID

7,968.54$         

NO BID

NO BID

18,351.67$       

NO BID

4,543.79$         

21,449.63$       

986.90$             

4,761.80$         

3,700.11$         

2,865.93$         

254.50$             

2,447.03$         

$12,700.00

Milk Cooler - Dual Access, Cold Wall, 8 case 
capacity 

2,056.00$         

9 3,605.00$         

3,143.00$         13

Reach-in-Freezer - Two Door, Self-Contained

Reach-in-Refrigerator - Two Door, Self-
Contained

Reach-in-Refrigerator - One door, Self-
Contained

13A Milk Cooler - Dual Access, Cold Wall, 12 case 
capacity 

 NO BID12 Mobible Transport Pan Rack - Fully Assembled

10 2,737.00$         

11

SPECIFICATION INFORMATION ASHLAND EQUIPMENT, A DIVISION OF SINGER MD, LLC

4 Convection Oven – Single, Electric

3 Convection Oven – Double, Electric 6,680.00$         

2 Convection Oven - Double, Electric 4,869.00$         

FCPS Approved Alternate Make and 
Model #: 

2,460.00$         

1A. Convection Steamer - Electric, Boilerless, 2 
Double Stacked Unit - 208V

ADDITIONAL ITEMS: 170944 Stand 27" X 
32.5" D, with bullet feet, for single or 

double stacked

1 Convection Steamer - Electric, Boilerless, 2 
Double Stacked Unit- 480v

8,858.00$         

8 Self-Serve Freezer - Glass Top 965.00$            

7 Hydrovection Oven - Full-size, Mobile, Electric 19,040.00$       

5 Combi Oven Steamer - Electric, Boilerless 15,413.00$       

6 Combi Oven Steamer - Natural Gas, Boilerless 15,935.00$       

SAM TELL AND SON, INC.

15,828.00$      

5,286.47$        

8,648.41$        

2,811.24$        

17,088.61$      

17,466.55$      

22,449.60$      

908.91$            

4,008.12$        

3,043.53$        

2,285.72$        

262.80$            

3,026.32$        

BOE Meeting:  11.11.20
SR/kl
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https://www.jesrestaurantequipment.com/convection-steamer-intek-electric-countertop-great-for-steam-p-1141501.html
https://www.jesrestaurantequipment.com/convection-steamer-intek-electric-countertop-great-for-steam-p-1141501.html
https://www.webstaurantstore.com/garland-sunfire-series-sco-es-20s-double-deck-full-size-electric-convection-oven-with-single-speed-fan-240v-1-phase-20-8-kw/372SCOES20SD.html
https://www.katom.com/348-SLES20SC2083.html
https://www.restaurantsupply.com/garland-sunfire-series-sco-es-10s-single-deck-full-size-electric-convection-oven-with-single-speed-fan-10-4-kw
https://www.restaurantsupply.com/southbend-sles-10sc-38-single-deck-full-size-electric-convection-oven-11-kw
https://www.webstaurantstore.com/vulcan-abc7e-480-half-size-electric-combi-oven-480v-3-phase-24-kw/901ABC7EG.html
https://www.webstaurantstore.com/vulcan-abc7g-nat-natural-gas-half-size-gas-combi-oven-80-000-btu/901ABC7GN.html
https://www.kitchenrestock.com/Blodgett-Oven-HV-100E-DBL-HydroVection-Oven_p_27925.html?gclid=EAIaIQobChMI2rDjuIr-3AIV1FuGCh3dyAVCEAQYASABEgJpx_D_BwE
http://www.master-bilt.com/products/merchandisers/dipping-display-merchandisers/coldin-3-flat-lid-novelty-freezers/msf-43an
http://hoshizakiamerica.com/product/cf2s-fs/
http://hoshizakiamerica.com/product/cr2s-fs/
http://hoshizakiamerica.com/product/cr1s-fs/
https://www.webstaurantstore.com/regency-20-pan-end-load-bun-sheet-pan-rack-assembled/600PR203W.html
https://beverage-air.com/product/st34n-s-milk-cooler/


BID 19FS2, KITCHEN EQUIPMENT
SUMMARY OF RENEWAL

DESCRIPTION Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
DOUGLAS FOOD STORES, INC. dba:  DOUGLAS EQUIPMENT

        

CLARK ASSOCIATES dba:  CLARK FOOD SERVICE EQUIPMENT

         

CAREY SALES AND SERVICES, INC.

       

SPECIFICATION INFORMATION ASHLAND EQUIPMENT, A DIVISION OF SINGER MD, LLC

      
   

         

SAM TELL AND SON, INC.

      

Make Vulcan Bid Price $14,101.00 Bid Price Bid Price $12,448.75 Bid Price $15,177.08 Bid Price $15,616.23
Model # C24ET6 Installation Price NO BID Installation Price Installation Price $1,875.00 Installation Price $2,500.00 Installation Price Included

Total Price $14,101.00 Total Price $0.00 Total Price $14,323.75 Total Price $17,677.08 Total Price $15,616.23
Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Warranty 1 yr limited parts & labor Warranty Warranty
see manufacturers warranty

Warranty
1 year limited parts & labor; 2 year 

limited water related parts only & 
labor

Warranty 2 yrs limited

Make Southbend Bid Price $15,151.00 Bid Price $16,200.43 Bid Price $15,993.84 Bid Price $14,217.41 Bid Price $15,797.12
Model # GSX-10HE Installation Price NO BID Installation Price $600.00 Installation Price $1,775.00 Installation Price $2,500.00 Installation Price Included

Total Price $15,151.00 Total Price $16,800.43 Total Price $17,768.84 Total Price $16,717.41 Total Price $15,797.12
Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) 14-21 Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45
Warranty 1 yr limited parts & labor Warranty 1 year parts and labor Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty 1 yr limited Warranty 1 yr

Make Vulcan Bid Price $14,219.00 Bid Price Bid Price $12,320.48 Bid Price $15,307.02 Bid Price $15,748.64
Model # C24ET10-BSC Installation Price NO BID Installation Price Installation Price $1,875.00 Installation Price $2,500.00 Installation Price Included

Total Price $14,219.00 Total Price Total Price $14,195.48 Total Price $17,807.02 Total Price $15,748.64
Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Warranty 1 yr limited parts & labor Warranty Warranty
see manufacturers warranty

Warranty
1 year limited parts & labor 2nd 

year limited water related parts only 
& labor

Warranty 2 yr limited

Make Vulcan Bid Price $14,738.00 Bid Price Bid Price $12,787.20 Bid Price $15,873.10 Bid Price $16,331.05
Model # C24ET10-BSC Installation Price NO BID Installation Price Installation Price $1,875.00 Installation Price $2,500.00 Installation Price Included

Total Price $14,738.00 Total Price $0.00 Total Price $14,662.20 Total Price $18,373.10 Total Price $16,331.05
Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Warranty
1 yr limited parts & labor

Warranty Warranty
see manufacturers warranty

Warranty
1 year llimited parts & labor 2nd 

year limited water related parts only 
& labor

Warranty 2 yr limited

Make Blodgett Bid Price $6,113.00 Bid Price $6,100.00 Bid Price $5,320.47 Bid Price $5,664.16 Bid Price $6,126.00
Model # SHO-100-G-DBL Installation Price NO BID Installation Price $600.00 Installation Price $1,210.00 Installation Price $1,920.00 Installation Price Included

Total Price $6,113.00 Total Price $6,700.00 Total Price $6,530.47 Total Price $7,584.16 Total Price $6,126.00
Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) 7-14 Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45
Warranty 1 yr limited parts & labor Warranty 1 year parts and labor Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty 1 year parts & labor Warranty 1 yr

Make Ice-O-Matic Bid Price $3,980.00 Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price $6,274.00 Bid Price $4,628.34
Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 10 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Warranty 3 yrs parts & labor. 5 yr evaporator. 5 yr 
compressor

Warranty Warranty Warranty
3 year parts & labor; 5 year 
evaporator; 5 year parts on 

compressor
Warranty 3 yr parts & labor; 5 yr 

evaporator,  compressor parts

Bid Price Bid Price $3,788.30 Bid Price $3,424.47 Bid Price Bid Price
Make Hoshizaki Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 1 Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days)
Model #

KML-325/500M_J Warranty Warranty
3 years parts and labor; 5 years 

compressor Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty Warranty

Make Continental Bid Price $4,733.00 Bid Price $5,098.61 Bid Price $4,351.33 Bid Price $5,548.92 Bid Price $5,071.22
Model # 1RE-PT-HD Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) 7-21 Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Warranty
3 yr parts & labor; 5 yr compressor

Warranty
3 years parts and labor

Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty
3 year parts & labor; 5 year 

compressor Warranty
3 yr parts & labor; 5 yr 

compressor parts

Make Traulsen Bid Price $4,759.00 Bid Price Bid Price $3,921.65 Bid Price $5,415.25 Bid Price $5,098.84
Model # G14312P Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Warranty 3 yr parts & labor Warranty Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty 3 year parts & labor Warranty 3 yr parts & labor
Make Continental Bid Price $5,355.00 Bid Price $5,709.66 Bid Price $4,877.29 Bid Price $6,123.86 Bid Price $5,737.81
Model # DL1W-SA-PT Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) 7-21 Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Warranty 3 yr parts & labor Warranty 3 years parts and labor Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty 3 year parts & labor Warranty 3 yr parts & labor; 5 yr 
compressor parts

Make Delfield Bid Price $3,034.00 Bid Price Bid Price $3,330.56 Bid Price $3,875.16 Bid Price $3,329.88
Model # SCFT-50-NU Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 50 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Warranty 1 yr compressor Warranty Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty 1 year parts & labor; 1 year 
compressor Warranty 1 yr parts & labor 

Make
Delfield

Bid Price $2,333.00 Bid Price Bid Price $195.46 Bid Price $995.00 Bid Price $50.79

Model # DCFSFS Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 50 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Make Delfield Bid Price $1,938.00 Bid Price Bid Price $2,030.77 Bid Price $2,662.09 Bid Price $2,045.33

Model # SCS-30 Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 40 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Make Delfield Total Price $2,126.00 Total Price Total Price $2,233.93 Total Price $2,838.44 Total Price $2,244.88

Model # SCS-36 Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 40 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Make Delfield Bid Price $2,270.00 Bid Price Bid Price $2,394.85 Bid Price $2,997.97 Bid Price $2,244.38

Model # SCS-50 Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 40 Lead Time (Business Days) 30-45

Make Delfield Bid Price $7,267.00 Bid Price Bid Price $5,109.90 Bid Price $5,961.35 Bid Price
Model # SH-5-HU Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 40 Lead Time (Business Days)

Warranty Warranty Warranty see manufacturers warranty Warranty 1 year parts & labor Warranty

Make Delfield Bid Price $1,196.00 Bid Price Bid Price $1,146.22 Bid Price $2,038.10 Bid Price

Model # SC-28-NU Lead Time (Business Days) 28 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 40 Lead Time (Business Days)

Make Avantco Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price $602.38 Bid Price $1,280.06 Bid Price $360.00

Model # CLM52 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 4-6 weeks apprx. Lead Time (Business Days) 10 Lead Time (Business Days)

1,146.22$         

602.38$             

195.46$             

2,030.77$         

2,233.93$         

2,394.85$         

5,548.92$          

5,415.25$          

6,123.86$          

2,038.10$          

1,280.06$          

3,875.16$          

995.00$             

2,662.09$          

2,838.44$          

2,997.97$          

5,961.35$          

14,323.75$       

5,109.90$         

17,677.08$        

16,717.41$        

17,807.02$        

18,373.10$        

7,584.16$          

4,877.29$         

3,330.56$         

6,530.47$         

17,768.84$       

14,195.48$       

14,662.20$       

3,424.47$         

4,351.33$         

3,921.65$         

6,274.00$          

NO BID

16,800.43$       

NO BID

NO BID

6,700.00$         

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

5,098.61$         

NO BID

5,709.66$         

NO BID

NO BID

3,788.30$         

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

2,333.00$         23 a FlexiShield Food Shield - Flexible

20 Refrigerated Cabinet - Pass Thru

NO BID

18 Convection Oven - Double Deck, Gas 6,113.00$         

Heated Cabinet - Pass-Thru

17 Convection Steamer - Electric, Two 
Compartment, Pressure-less

14,738.00$       

16 Convection Steamer - Electric, Two 
Compartment, Pressure-less

14,219.00$       

15

24 Mobile Cashier's Counter, 30 inches

25

3,034.00$         Mobile Self-Contained Frost Top Serving 
Counter

5,355.00$         22

4,759.00$         21

4,733.00$         

Self-Contained Solid Door Heated Pass-Thru

19
Ice Maker w/Ice Storage Bin - Low Profile, 
Compact, Cube Style                                                                                       

23

FCPS Approved Alternate Make and 
Model #: 

3,980.00$         
CIM0430HA/B40PSModel #

1,196.00$         28 Mobile All Purpose Counters (Includes tray 
serving line)

29 Countertop Cooler - Lighted Sign

7,267.00$         

2,270.00$         

2,126.00$         

1,938.00$         

Mobile Cashier's Counter, 36 inches

26 Mobile Cashier's Counter, 50 inches

27 Mobile Heated Serving Counters (Includes tray 
serving line)

Convection Steamer - Gas, Two  Compartment, 
Pressure-less

15,151.00$       

14 Convection Steamer - Electric, Two  
Compartment, Pressure-less

14,101.00$       15,616.23$      

15,797.12$      

15,748.64$      

2,045.33$        

2,244.88$        

2,244.88$        

NO BID

NO BID

360.00$            

16,331.05$      

6,126.00$        

4,628.34$        

5,071.22$        

5,098.84$        

5,737.81$        

3,329.88$        

50.79$              

BOE Meeting:  11.11.20
SR/kl

Page 3

https://www.centralrestaurant.com/Vulcan-C24ET6-Electric-Convection-Steamer-2-Compartments-c108p541391.html
https://www.katom.com/348-GSX10HELP.html
https://www.centralrestaurant.com/Vulcan-Convection-Steamers---Two-Compartment-Steamers---C24EA10-BSC-c108p15453.html
https://www.centralrestaurant.com/Vulcan-Convection-Steamers---Two-Compartment-Steamers---C24EA10-BSC-c108p15453.html
https://www.webstaurantstore.com/blodgett-sho-100-g-natural-gas-double-deck-full-size-convection-oven-100-000-btu/195SHO100G2N.html
https://www.icemachinesplus.com/ice-o-matic-elevation-cim0430ha.html
http://hoshizakiamerica.com/product/kml-500maj/
https://www.webstaurantstore.com/continental-refrigerator-1re-pt-hd-29-half-door-extra-wide-pass-through-refrigerator-21-cu-ft/2701REPTHD.html
https://www.webstaurantstore.com/traulsen-g14312p-1-section-pass-through-solid-door-hot-food-holding-cabinet-with-right-hinged-doors/882G14312P.html
https://www.webstaurantstore.com/continental-dl1w-sa-pt-26-solid-door-pass-through-heated-holding-cabinet-1500w/270DL1WSAPT.html
https://www.ckitchen.com/p/delfield-scft-50-nu-shelleysteel-frost-top-serving-counter.html
https://www.acitydiscount.com/Delfield-FlexiShield-Food-Shield-flexible-DCFSFS.0.190403.1.1.htm
https://www.jesrestaurantequipment.com/delfield-scs-30-cashier-counter-30-deep-stainless-steel-top-body.html
https://www.jesrestaurantequipment.com/delfield-scs-36-cashier-counter-36-deep-stainless-steel-top-body.html
https://www.jesrestaurantequipment.com/delfield-scs-50-cashier-counter-50-deep-stainless-steel-top-body.html
https://www.jesrestaurantequipment.com/delfield-sh-5-nu-hot-food-serving-counter-5-pan-capacity-enclosed-base.html
https://www.jesrestaurantequipment.com/delfield-sc-28-nu-solid-top-serving-counter-28-long-enclosed-base.html
https://www.webstaurantstore.com/avantco-clm52-black-countertop-display-refrigerator-with-swing-door-and-merchandising-panel/360CLM52.html
https://www.icemachinesplus.com/ice-o-matic-elevation-cim0430ha.html
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