
BID 16M7, PAINT AND SUPPLIES GROUPS A - D
BID TAB

GRP
SPEC 

NO ITEM DESCRIPTION
BRAND PRODUCT 
NAME

1 GAL/ 
UNIT 

 1 GAL 
PRICE   

5 GAL/ 
UNIT

5 GAL 
PRICE  

BRAND PRODUCT 
NAME

1 GAL/ 
UNIT 

  1 GAL 
PRICE   

5 GAL/ 
UNIT

5 GAL 
PRICE  

BRAND PRODUCT 
NAME

1 GAL/ 
UNIT 

  1 GAL 
PRICE   

5 GAL/ 
UNIT

  5 GAL 
PRICE   

A 1
Vinyl Acrylic Latex 
Flat

McCormick Advantage 
Latex Flat 12 Series 1 Gal 11.89$        5 Gal 55.80$       

Speedhide Flat 6-
70 Series 1 Gal 7.90$        5 Gal 39.50$      

Pro Mar 200 0 VOC 
Flat 1 Gal 8.75$        5 Gal 41.75$      

A 2
Vinyl Acrylic Latex 
Semi Gloss

McCormick Advantage 
Latex Semi-Gloss 25 
Series 1 Gal 14.75$        5 Gal 69.90$       

Sppedhide SG 6-
500 Series 1 Gal 10.15$      5 Gal 50.76$      

Pro Mar 200 0 VOC 
S/G 1 Gal 9.95$        5 Gal 52.50$      

A 3
Vinyl Acrylic Latex 
Flat Zero VOC

McCormick Total 
Advantage Latex Flat 
08 Series 1 Gal 11.89$        5 Gal 55.80$       

Sppedhide Zero 
Flat 6-4110XI 
Series 1 Gal 7.90$        5 Gal 39.50$      

Pro Mar 200 0 VOC 
Flat 1 Gal 8.75$        5 Gal 41.75$      

A 4

Vinyl Acrylic Latex  
Semi Gloss Zero 
VOC 

McCormick Total 
Advantage Latex Semi-
Gloss 10 Series 1 Gal  $        14.75 5 Gal  $       69.90 

Speedhide Zero SG 
6-4510XI Series 1 Gal  $     10.15 5 Gal  $     50.76 

Pro Mar 200 0 VOC 
S/G 1 Gal 9.95$        5 Gal 52.50$      

A 5
Latex Paint + Primer 
in One Flat

McCormick Revo Paint 
& Primer in One Flat 
15 Series 1 Gal  $        15.35 5 Gal  $       68.80 

Pure Performance 
Flat 9-100 Series 1 Gal  $     10.59 5 Gal  $     52.95 SuperPaint A86 1 Gal 12.99$      5 Gal 62.45$      

A 6
Latex Paint + Primer 
in OneSemi-Gloss 

McCormick Revo Paint 
& Primer in One Semi-
Gloss 17 Series 1 Gal  $        16.15 5 Gal  $       75.90 

Pure Performance 
SG 9-500 1 Gal  $     11.80 5 Gal  $     59.00 SuperPaint A88 1 Gal 12.99$      5 Gal 62.45$      

A 7 Odorless  Latex Flat

McCormick Total 
Advantage Latex Flat 
08 Series 1 Gal 11.89$        5 Gal 55.80$       

Pure Performance 
Flat 9-100 Series 1 Gal 10.59$      5 Gal 52.95$      Harmony Flat 1 Gal 13.55$      5 Gal 65.25$      

A 8
Odorless Latex Semi 
Gloss  

McCormick Total 
Advantage Latex Semi-
Gloss 10 Series 1 Gal 14.75$        5 Gal 69.90$       

Pure Performance 
SG 9-500 Series 1 Gal 11.80$      5 Gal 59.00$      Harmony S/G 1 Gal 13.99$      5 Gal 67.45$      

A 9
Acrylic Semi Gloss 
Enamel

McCormick Union 
Semi-Gloss Enamel 28 
Series 1 Gal 19.60$        5 Gal 94.55$       No Bid 1 Gal No Bid 5 Gal No Bid 1 Gal 5 Gal (2.50)$      

A 10
Acrylic Latex House 
Paint-Flat

McCormick State 
House Flat 19 Series 1 Gal 15.60$        5 Gal 75.95$       

Speedhide Ext. 6-
650XI Series 1 Gal 9.66$        5 Gal 48.30$      A-100 Flat 1 Gal 11.11$      5 Gal 53.05$      

A 11
Acrylic Latex House 
Paint-Semi-Gloss

McCormick State 
House Semi Gloss 27 
Series 1 Gal 16.35$        5 Gal 78.75$       

Speedhide Ext. 6-
900XI Series 1 Gal 12.50$      5 Gal 62.50$      A-100 Gloss 1 Gal 12.02$      5 Gal 57.60$      

A 12

Direct To Metal - 
Latex - Gloss - to 
Include Safety Colors

McCormick Interlock 
Gloss 42 Series 1 Gal 24.90$        5 Gal

 Not 
Available 

Pitt Tech Plus SFT 
Orange 90-1313 
&SFT Yellow 90-
3333/SFT Red 90-
1306 1 Gal

$25.75/  
$48.15 5 Gal N/A

P/I DTM Safety 
Colors 1 Gal  $     21.21 5 Gal  $   103.55 

A 13

Direct To Metal - 
Latex - Gloss - to 
exclude Safety Colors

McCormick Interlok 
Gloss 42 Series 1 Gal 21.80$        5 Gal 105.40$     

Pitt-Tech Plus DTM 
Gloss 90-1310 
Series 1 Gal 19.31$      5 Gal 96.55$      P/I DTM B66W105x 1 Gal 13.41$      5 Gal 64.55$      

A 14
Waterbased Acrylic 
Urethane DTM Gloss

McCormick Interlok 
Gloss 42 Series 1 Gal 21.80$        5 Gal 105.40$     

Devflex QD 4208 
Series 1 Gal 21.59$      5 Gal 107.95$    P/I DTM B66W105x 1 Gal 13.41$      5 Gal 64.55$      

A 15

Waterbased Acrylic 
Urethane DTM Semi 
Gloss

McCormick Interlok 
Semi-Gloss 45 Series 1 Gal 21.80$        5 Gal 105.40$     

Devflex HP 4216 
Series 1 Gal 21.59$      5 Gal 107.95$    

P/I DTM B66 
W115X 1 Gal 13.41$      5 Gal 64.55$      

A 16
Waterborne Acrylic 
Dryfall Flat

McCormick White or 
Black Dryfall Flat 
01219 1 Gal

 Not 
Available 5 Gal 44.90$       

Speedhide Super 
Tech WB Int Dry-
Fog Flat 6-725XI 
Series 1 Gal N/A 5 Gal 30.40$      

Pro Industrial 
Waterborne Acrylic 
Dryfall White Flat 1 Gal 5 Gal 32.15$      

PRIMARY = GRAY

SECONDARY = BLUE
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BID 16M7, PAINT AND SUPPLIES GROUPS A - D
BID TAB

PRIMARY = GRAY

SECONDARY = BLUE

PPG Architect Sherwin Williams CompanyMcCormick Paints

A 17
Waterborne Acrylic 
Dry Fall Semi-Gloss

McCormick White Dry 
Fall Semi-Gloss 01310 1 Gal

 Not 
Available 5 Gal  $       55.20 

Speedhide Super 
Tech WB Int. Dry-
Fog SG-6-724XI 
Series 1 Gal  N/A 5 Gal  $     39.33 

Pro Industrial 
Waterborne Acrylic 
Dryfall White Semi-
Gloss 1 Gal 5 Gal 52.75$      

B 1
Drywall Primer Vinyl 
Latex Sealer

McCormick 1st Step 
Vinyl Primer Sealer 
06431 1 Gal 8.12$          5 Gal 39.55$       

Speedhide Pro-EV 
Int. Latex Sealer 12-
900 1 Gal 6.50$        5 Gal 32.50$      

Pro Mar 400 0 VOC 
Primer 1 Gal 6.66$        5 Gal 30.80$      

B 2
Acrylic Enamel 
Undercoater

McCormick 1st Step 
Latex Enamel 
Undercoater 06441 1 Gal 11.33$        5 Gal 55.65$       

Speedhide Int. 
Latex Sealer 6-2 1 Gal 7.47$        5 Gal 37.35$      

Pro Mar 200 0 VOC 
Primer 1 Gal 7.09$        5 Gal 32.95$      

B 3 Vinyl Primer Sealer

McCormick 1st Step 
Vinyl Primer Sealer 
06431 1 Gal 8.12$          5 Gal 39.55$       

Speedhide Pro-EV 
Int. Latex Sealer 12-
900 1 Gal 6.50$        5 Gal 32.50$      

Pro Mar 400 0 VOC 
Primer 1 Gal 6.66$        5 Gal 30.80$      

B 4 Stain Killer

McCormick Solvent 
Odorless Primer 
06448 1 Gal 30.40$        5 Gal

 Not 
Available 

Seal Grip Int/Ext 
Alkyd Universal 
Primer Sealer 17-
941NF 1 Gal 17.99$      5 Gal 89.95$      

Preprite Pro Block 
Primer 1 Gal 10.46$      5 Gal 49.80$      

B 5
Water-based Primer-
Sealer/Stain Killer

Zinnser Bulls Eye 1-2-
3;  61Z123G 1 Gal 18.45$        5 Gal 92.25$       

Seal Grip Int/Ext 
Acrylic Universal 
Primer 17-921 1 Gal 12.50$      5 Gal 62.50$      

Preprite Pro Block 
Primer 1 Gal 10.46$      5 Gal 49.80$      

B 6

Interior/Exterior 
Acrylic Latex Multi-
Purpose Primer

McCormick Unix 
Interior/Exterior Latex 
Primer 06460 1 Gal 15.90$        5 Gal 77.00$       

Zinsser Bulls Eye 
123 WMZ02001 1 Gal 22.50$      5 Gal 112.50$    

Preprite Pro Block 
Primer 1 Gal 10.46$      5 Gal 49.80$      

B 7
Universal Acrylic 
Metal Primer

McCormick Interlok 43 
Series 1 Gal 21.80$        5 Gal 105.40$     

Pitt-Tech Int/Ext 
Primer/Finish DTM 
90-712 1 Gal 18.60$      5 Gal 93.00$      

DTM Acrylic Primer 
Finish 1 Gal 12.51$      5 Gal 60.05$      

C 1

Interior Penetrating 
Oil Wood Stain Clear 
Tint

McCormick Wood 
Stains 01061 1 Qt 7.95$          1 Gal

 Not 
Available 

Deft Wood Stain 
Int. Alkyd DFT400 1 Qt 10.59$      1 Gal N/A

Wood Classics 250 
VOC Stain 1 Qt 7.13$        1 Gal 23.55$      

C 2
Water-Based Wood 
Stain Clear Tint Base

Old Masters Water 
Based Wood Stain - 
Clear Tint Base 1 Qt  $          9.40 1 Gal  $       30.55 

Deft Wood Stain IT 
WB 1 Qt  $       7.80 1 Gal  $     25.49 MinWax 1 Qt 9.03$        1 Gal 25.61$      

C 3

Interior Waterborne 
Latex Polyurethane - 
Satin

McPolythane Latex 
Polyurthance Satin 
01199 1 Qt 8.49$          1 Gal

 Not 
Available 

Deft WB 
Polyurethane Satin 
DFT 109 1 Qt 10.50$      1 Gal 29.40$      

WoodClassics 
Latex Polyurethane 1 Qt 6.93$        1 Gal 22.21$      

C 4

Interior Waterborne 
Latex Polyurethane - 
Gloss

McPolythane Latex 
Polyurthance - Gloss 
01198 1 Qt 8.49$          1 Gal

 Not 
Available 

Deft WB 
Polyurethane Gloss 
DFT107 1 Qt 10.50$      1 Gal 29.40$      

WoodClassics 
Latex Polyurethane 1 Qt 6.93$        1 Gal 22.21$      

C 5

Wood and Concrete 
Textured Resurfacer 
Deck Coating No Bid 1 Gal No Bid 5 Gal No Bid 1 Gal N/A 5 Gal N/A

Thompsons 
waterSeal Multi 
Surface 1 Gal 10.42$      5 Gal $

C 6

Latex Traffic Paint 
with Titanium Dioxide 
and High Solids - 
White

McCormick Latex 
Traffic Paint - White 
01705 1 Gal 10.88$        5 Gal 51.50$       

Zoneline Traffic & 
Zone Marking Paint 
11-53 1 Gal 11.84$      5 Gal 59.20$      Pro Park White 1 Gal 12.31$      5 Gal 59.05$      

C 7

Latex Traffic Paint 
with Titanium Dioxide 
and High Solids - 
Yellow

McCormick Latex 
Traffic Paint - Yellow 
01715 1 Gal 14.49$        5 Gal 68.65$       

Zoneline Traffic & 
Zone Marking Paint 
11-54 1 Gal 12.50$      5 Gal 62.50$      Pro Park Yellow 1 Gal 12.31$      5 Gal 59.05$      
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BID 16M7, PAINT AND SUPPLIES GROUPS A - D
BID TAB

PRIMARY = GRAY

SECONDARY = BLUE

PPG Architect Sherwin Williams CompanyMcCormick Paints

C 8
Epoxy Wall Paint - 
Latex - Gloss No Bid 1 Gal No Bid 5 Gal No Bid

Pitt-Glaze WB 
Waterborne Acrylic 
Epoxy 16-551/U 
Series 1 Gal 21.50$      5 Gal 107.50$    

Water based 
catalized epoxy B70 1 Gal 21.54$      5 Gal 105.20$    

C 9
Epoxy Modified 
Enamel

Cote-All Alkyd Gloss 
Enamel 91 Series 1 Gal 24.92$        5 Gal

 Not 
Available 

7 Line Int/Ext 
Industrial Oil Gloss 
7-282 Series 1 Gal 21.51$      5 Gal 107.55$    

Industrial Enamel 
H/S 1 Gal 12.56$      5 Gal 60.30$      

C 10

Pre-catalyzed 
waterborne acrylic 
epoxy

McCormick Pre-
Cataliyzed Waterbone 
Acrylic Epoxy 04500 1 Gal  $        26.30 5 Gal

 Not 
Available 

Pitt-Glaze Pre-
Catalyzed Acrylic 
Epoxy 16-510 1 Gal  $     21.29 5 Gal  $   106.45 

P/I Precatalized 
Water based Epoxy 1 Gal 13.21$      5 Gal 63.55$      

C 11

Anti-slip Epoxy Floor 
Paint - with Multiple 
Color Choices

Valspar Epoxy Floor 
Coating 5024131 1 Gal 77.75$        5 Gal

 Not 
Available 

PPG Anti-Slip 
Safety Flooring 
Systems SFT 610 1 Gal 94.40$      5 Gal AS175 Anti-Slip 1 Gal 5 Gal (2.50)$      

C 12
Interior/Exterior Latex 
Block Filler

McCormick 
Interior/Exterior Latex 
Block Filler 01015 1 Gal

 Not 
Available 5 Gal 38.10$       

Speedhide Int/Ext 
Masonry Hi Fill 
Latex Block Filler 6-
7 1 Gal N/A 5 Gal 29.36$      

PrepRite Block 
Filler 1 Gal 5.55$        5 Gal 25.25$      

C 13

 Interior/Exterior 
Acrylic Masonry 
Primer/Sealer 

McCormick Acrylok 
Interior/Exterior 
Masonry Primer 06451 1 Gal

 Not 
Available 5 Gal 74.20$       

Seal Grip Int/Ext 
Acrylic Universal 
Primer 17-921 1 Gal 12.50$      5 Gal 62.50$      Loxon 1 Gal 10.42$      5 Gal 49.60$      

C 14
Interior/Exterior 
ACRYLIC Block Coat

McCormick 
Interior/Exterior 
Latex Block Filler 
01015 1 Gal

 Not 
Available 5 Gal 38.10$       

Speedhide Int/Ext 
Masonry Hi Fill 
Latex Block Filler 6-
15 1 Gal N/A 5 Gal 32.00$      

PrepRite Block 
Filler 1 Gal 5.55$        5 Gal 25.25$      

D 1 spray enamel No Bid 1 Can No Bid Case No Bid Spray Enamels 12 1 Can  $       2.66 Case Controls Rust 1 Can $       3.07 Case 18.42$      

D 2
All Surface protective 
enamels

Rustoleum 2X Spray 
Enamels - All Colors 
591877 1 Can  $          2.98 Case  $       17.70 

Pitt Bull Quick Dry 
Spray Enamels 12 
oz 1 Can  $       2.66 Case Krylon Int/ Ext 1 Can  $       3.07 Case 18.42$      

D 3
Multi-Purpose Latex 
Primer Aerosol No Bid 1 Can  No Bid Case  No Bid 

Zinnser Bulls Eye 
123/WMZ02008/ ea 1 Can  $       4.55 Case

Multi-purpose latex 
spray primer 1 Can  $       4.31 Case 25.86$      

D 4

Multi-Purpose Oil-
based Spray Primer, 
Sealer and Stain-
Blocker

Kilz Oil Based Spray 
Primer, Sealer, Stain 
Blocker 5910004 1 Can  $          3.97 Case  $       47.64 

Seal Grip Int/Ext 
Alkyd Stain Block 
55-31S/54 1 Can  $       3.84 Case

Multi-Purpose Oil-
Based Primer 12 
Oz. White 1 Can  $       3.89 Case 23.34$      

D 5
Stain Sealer - Vertical 
Spray Can

Zinnser BIN Spray 
Stain Sealer, Shellac 
Based 5901008 1 Can  $          5.99 Case  $       35.94 

Zinnser Bulls Eye 
123/WMZ02008/ ea 1 Can  $       4.55 Case SF-1 1 Can  $       3.27 Case 19.62$      

D 6
Striping Paint 18oz 
white

Rustoleum Spray 
Marking Paint, 18 oz. 
White 5925938 1 Can  $          4.96 Case  $       59.52 

Rustolium RUS 
169181/ea 1 Can  $       4.58 Case

Spray Aerosol - 
Sherliner® Striping 
Paint 18 Oz. 
Highway White 1 Can  $       4.79 Case 28.74$      

D 7
Striping Paint 18oz 
yellow

Rustoleum Spray 
Marking Paint, 18 oz, 
Yellow 5925488 1 Can  $          4.96 Case  $       59.52 

Rustolium RUM 
16488/ea 1 Can  $       4.58 Case

Spray Aerosol - 
Sherliner® Striping 
Paint 18 Oz. 
Highway Yellow 1 Can  $       4.79 Case 28.74$      

50% 50% 25%DISCOUNT OFF RETAIL:  
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