
BID 16FS1, KITCHEN EQUIPMENT

BID TABULATION

DESCRIPTION Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Manufacturer Accutemp Manufacturer Cleveland Manufacturer Accutemp Manufacturer GROEN Manufacturer Accutemp

Manufacturer Item # E64803E140DBL Manufacturer Item # 22CET66.1 Manufacturer Item # E64803E140DBL Manufacturer Item # XS-480-12-3 Manufacturer Item # E64803E140DBL

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Garland/US Range Manufacturer Garland/US Range Manufacturer Garland Manufacturer BLODGETT Manufacturer Garland/US Range

Manufacturer Item # SCO-ES-20S Manufacturer Item # SCO-ES-20S Manufacturer Item # SCO-ES-20S Manufacturer Item # SHO-100-E DBL Manufacturer Item # SCO-ES-20S

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Garland/US Range Manufacturer Garland Manufacturer Garland Manufacturer BLODGETT Manufacturer Garland/US Range 

Manufacturer Item # SCO-ES-10S Manufacturer Item # SCO-ES-10S Manufacturer Item # SCO-ES-10S Manufacturer Item # SHO-100-E-SGL Manufacturer Item # SCO-ES-10S

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Vulcan Manufacturer Rational Manufacturer Vulcan Manufacturer BLODGETT Manufacturer Vulcan

Manufacturer Item # ABC7E-480 Manufacturer Item # A629106.43.202 Manufacturer Item # ABC7E-480 Manufacturer Item # BX-14E SGL Manufacturer Item # ABC7E-480

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Blodgett Manufacturer Garland Manufacturer Blodgett Manufacturer BLODGETT Manufacturer Blodgett

Manufacturer Item # HV-100E Double Manufacturer Item # MP-ES-20-S Manufacturer Item # HV-100E Double Manufacturer Item # HV-100E DOUBLE Manufacturer Item # HV-100E Double 

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days) 25 Lead Time (Business Days) 10

Manufacturer True Manufacturer True Manufacturer True Manufacturer TRUE Manufacturer True 

Manufacturer Item # TFM-41FL Manufacturer Item # TFM-41FL Manufacturer Item # TFM-41FL Manufacturer Item # TFM-41FL Manufacturer Item # TFM-41FL

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) 5 Lead Time (Business Days) 25 Lead Time (Business Days) 10

Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator Manufacturer CONTINENTAL Manufacturer Turbo Air

Manufacturer Item # DL2F-SS Manufacturer Item # GBSF2-S Manufacturer Item # DL2F-SS Manufacturer Item # DL2F-SS Manufacturer Item # M3F47-2

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator Manufacturer CONTINENTAL Manufacturer Turbo Air

Manufacturer Item # DL2R-SS Manufacturer Item # GBSR2-S Manufacturer Item # DL2R-SS Manufacturer Item # DL2R-SS Manufacturer Item # M3R47-2

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator Manufacturer CONTINENTAL Manufacturer Turbo Air

Manufacturer Item # DL1R-SS Manufacturer Item # GBSR1-S Manufacturer Item # DL1R-SS Manufacturer Item # DL1R-SS Manufacturer Item # M3R24-1

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Mobile Pan Rack Manufacturer Regency Manufacturer Regency Manufacturer Channel Man. Manufacturer JOHN BOOS Manufacturer Regency

Manufacturer Item # 600PR203W (Fully Assembled) Manufacturer Item # 600PR203W Manufacturer Item # 411S Manufacturer Item # ABPR-1820-RKD Manufacturer Item # 600PR203W

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days) 25 Lead Time (Business Days) 10

Manufacturer Beverage - Air Manufacturer Beverage - Air Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator Manufacturer CONTINENTAL Manufacturer Beverage - Air

Manufacturer Item # ST34N - S Manufacturer Item # ST34N - S Manufacturer Item # MC3-SS-DCW Manufacturer Item # MC3-SS-DCW Manufacturer Item # ST34N - S

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Beverage - Air Manufacturer Beverage - Air Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator Manufacturer CONTINENTAL Manufacturer Beverage - Air

Manufacturer Item # ST49N - S Manufacturer Item # ST49N - S Manufacturer Item # MC4-SS-DCW Manufacturer Item # MC4-SS-DCW Manufacturer Item # ST49N - S

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Beverage - Air Manufacturer Beverage - Air Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator Manufacturer CONTINENTAL Manufacturer Beverage - Air

Manufacturer Item # ST58N - S Manufacturer Item # ST58N - S Manufacturer Item # MC5-SS-DCW Manufacturer Item # MC5-SS-DCW Manufacturer Item # ST58N - S

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Cleveland Ultra 10 Manufacturer Cleveland Ultra 10 Manufacturer Cleveland Ultra 10 Manufacturer SOUTHBEND Manufacturer Cleveland Ultra 10

Manufacturer Item # 24-CGA-10 Manufacturer Item # 24-CGA-10 Manufacturer Item # 24-CGA-10 Manufacturer Item # GSX-10HE Manufacturer Item # 24-CGA-10 

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

SPECIFICATION INFORMATION

1
Convection Steamer - Electric, 

Boilerless, 2 Double Stacked Unit
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Groen - Item: XS-480-12-3

Manufacturer: Cleveland - Item: 22CET66.1

14,500.00$          

4
Combi Oven Steamer - Electric, 

Boilerless
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Rational - Item: A629106.43.202

Manufacturer: Convotherm - Item: C4 ET 6.20ES

VENDOR NAME:  

5
Hydrovection Oven - Full-Size, 

Mobile, Electric FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Garland/US Range - Item: MP-ES-20-S

2 Convection Oven - Double FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Southbend - Item: SLES/20SC

Manufacturer: Vulcan - Item: VC44ED

3
Convection Oven – Single, 

Electric
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Southbend - Item: SLES/10SC

Manufacturer: Vulcan - Item: VC4ED

8
Reach-In Refrigerator -  One 

Door, Self Contained
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Turbo Air - Item: PRO-50R

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: DL2R-SS

9
Reach-In Refrigerator -  One 

Door, Self Contained
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Turbo Air - Item: PRO-26R

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: DL1R-SS

6 Self-Service Freezer - Glass Top 
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

7
Reach-In Freezer -  Two Door, 

Self Contained
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Turbo Air - Item: PRO-50F

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: DL2F-SS

12
Milk Cooler - Dual Access, Cold 

Wall, 12 case capacity 
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: MC4-SS-DCW

Manufacturer: Traulsen - Item: RMC49D4

13
Milk Cooler - Dual Access, Cold 

Wall, 16 case capacity 
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: MC5-SS-DCW

Manufacturer: Traulsen - Item: RMC58D4

10
Mobile Transport Pan Rack - 

Fully Assembled FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: John Boos - Item: ABPR-1820-RKD-X

11
Milk Cooler - Dual Access, Cold 

Wall, 8 case capacity 
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: MC3-SS-DCW

Manufacturer: Traulsen - Item: RMC34D4

14
Convection Steamer - Gas, Two  

Compartment, Pressure-less
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Southbend - Item: GSX-10HE

Manufacturer: Southbend - Item: GCX-10S

VENDOR NAME:  VENDOR NAME:

11400, Inc. Acme Paper and Supply Co. Ashland Equipment, Inc.

14,420.70$          13,441.00$          

Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) 16 Lead Time (Business Days) 25

4,800.00$            4,266.55$            5,300.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days) 25

2,750.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) 15 25

3,000.00$            2,155.52$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 40 Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days) 25

11,500.00$          16,870.55$          

Lead Time (Business Days) 30

17,000.00$          20,168.40$          

1,500.00$            1,306.73$            1,395.00$            

3,300.00$            6,060.86$            4,420.00$            

492.00$               

Lead Time (Business Days) 20

2,500.00$            2,821.86$            

2,750.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 20

Lead Time (Business Days)

Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) 20

2,600.00$            4,733.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) 20

Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days) 20

350.00$               562.25$               

2,250.00$            2,508.32$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days)

12,456.00$          

VENDOR NAME:

Big Plate Tech, LLC

19,043.75$           

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

25

Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days) 25

3,172.60$            2,880.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days)

13,778.21$          

Lead Time (Business Days)

8,295.75$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

25

25

Lead Time (Business Days) 25

3,450.00$            

4,026.65$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

Lead Time (Business Days) 25

2,275.00$            

25,646.67$           

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

2,550.00$            

33,560.22$           

11,305.00$          

7,550.42$            5,330.00$            

16,690.00$          

Lead Time (Business Days) 25

2,117.85$            

6,656.17$            4,300.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 20

4,416.85$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

4,498.00$            

12,850.00$          

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

6,656.17$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

Lead Time (Business Days)

10

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

344.05$               

3,682.50$            

10

4,111.85$            

Lead Time (Business Days)

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

23,262.85$           

BOE Mtg.:  10.14.15

http://www.accutemp.net/_service/downloadFile.ashx?fileid=fa85e9b7-5686-4947-83cf-f7b588a08216
http://www.garland-group.com/asset/?id=nffje
http://www.garland-group.com/asset/?id=nffje
https://my.vulcanfeg.com/resourcecenter/vulcanwolfberkel/ProductDocumentation/F47103.pdf
http://www.blodgett.com/wp-content/uploads/HV-100E-spec.pdf
http://www.truemfg.com/catalog.aspx?language_id=1&event_id=401&from=food&criteria=TFM-41FL
http://www.continentalrefrigerator.com/specsheets/DL2F,070915.pdf
http://www.continentalrefrigerator.com/specsheets/DL2R,100814.pdf
http://www.continentalrefrigerator.com/specsheets/DL1R,082713.pdf
http://cdnimg.webstaurantstore.com/documents/specsheets/regency_bunpanracks.pdf
http://www.beverage-air.com/uploadedFiles/docs/ST Series.pdf
http://www.beverage-air.com/uploadedFiles/docs/ST Series.pdf
http://www.beverage-air.com/uploadedFiles/docs/ST Series.pdf
http://www.clevelandrange.com/products/cook/steamers/convection/convection-10-pan-models/gas/24cga10-steamcraft-ultra-10-with-gas-generator


BID 16FS1, KITCHEN EQUIPMENT

BID TABULATION

DESCRIPTION Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit PriceSPECIFICATION INFORMATION

1
Convection Steamer - Electric, 

Boilerless, 2 Double Stacked Unit
14,500.00$          

VENDOR NAME:  VENDOR NAME:  VENDOR NAME:

11400, Inc. Acme Paper and Supply Co. Ashland Equipment, Inc.

14,420.70$          13,441.00$          

VENDOR NAME:

Big Plate Tech, LLC

19,043.75$           

Manufacturer Cleveland Ultra 10 Manufacturer Cleveland Ultra 10 Manufacturer Cleveland Ultra 10 Manufacturer SOUTHBEND Manufacturer Cleveland Ultra 10

Manufacturer Item # 24-CEA-10 Manufacturer Item # 24-CEA-10 Manufacturer Item # 24-CEA-10 Manufacturer Item # ECX-10S Manufacturer Item # 24-CEA-10 

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Vulcan Manufacturer Garland Manufacturer Vulcan Manufacturer BLODGETT Manufacturer Vulcan

Manufacturer Item # VC44GD Manufacturer Item # SUMG-200 Manufacturer Item # VC44GD Manufacturer Item # SHO-100-G-DBL Manufacturer Item # VC44GD 

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Manitowoc Manufacturer MANITOWOC Manufacturer Ice-O-Matic Manufacturer MANITOWOC Manufacturer Manitowoc

Manufacturer Item #  IY-0304 Manufacturer Item # IY-0304/B-570 Manufacturer Item # ICE0400HA & Ice Bin B55PS Manufacturer Item # IY-0304/B-570 Manufacturer Item #  IY-0304 & B-570

Manufacturer Item #  B-570 

Manufacturer True Food Service Equipment Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator Manufacturer CONTINENTAL Manufacturer True Food Service Equipment 

Manufacturer Item # STA1RPT-1S-1S Manufacturer Item # 1R-SA-PT Manufacturer Item # 1RE-SA-PT Manufacturer Item # 1RE-PT Manufacturer Item # STA1RPT-1S-1S

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer DELFIELD Manufacturer Delfield 

Manufacturer Item # SMHPT1-S Manufacturer Item # SMHPT1-S Manufacturer Item # SMHPT1-S Manufacturer Item # SMHPT1-S Manufacturer Item # SMHPT1-S

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer True Food Service Equipment Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator Manufacturer CONTINENTAL Manufacturer True Food Service Equipment

Manufacturer Item # STA1HPT-1S-1S Manufacturer Item # DL1W-SA-PT Manufacturer Item # DL1W-SA-PT Manufacturer Item # DL1W-SA-PT Manufacturer Item # STA1HPT-1S-1S

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer DELFIELD Manufacturer Delfield

Manufacturer Item # SCFT-50- NU Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SCFT-50- NU Manufacturer Item # SCFT-50-NU Manufacturer Item # SCFT-50- NU

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer DELFIELD Manufacturer Delfield 

Manufacturer Item # SCS-30 Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SCS-30 Manufacturer Item # SCS-30 Manufacturer Item # SCS-30

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer DELFIELD Manufacturer Delfield

Manufacturer Item # SCS-36 Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SCS-36 Manufacturer Item # SCS-36 Manufacturer Item # SCS-36

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer DELFIELD Manufacturer Delfield 

Manufacturer Item # SCS-50 Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SCS-50 Manufacturer Item # SCS-50 Manufacturer Item # SCS-50 

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer DELFIELD Manufacturer Delfield

Manufacturer Item # SH-5-NU Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SH-5-NU Manufacturer Item # SH-5-NU Manufacturer Item # SH-5-NU

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer DELFIELD Manufacturer Delfield

Manufacturer Item # SC-28-NU Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SC-28-NU Manufacturer Item # SC-28-NU Manufacturer Item # SC-28-NU

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Manufacturer Excellence Manufacturer Manufacturer Beverage Air Manufacturer EXCELLENCE Manufacturer Excellence

Manufacturer Item # SC-52 Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # CTR3-1-B-LED Manufacturer Item # SC-52 Manufacturer Item # SC-52

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

16
Convection Oven - Double Deck, 

Gas
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Southbend - Item: KLGS/27SC

Manufacturer: Garland/US Range - Item: MCO-GS-20-S

17

Ice Maker with Ice Storage Bin 

– Low Profile, Compact, Cube 

Style
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Ice-O-Matic - Item: ICE0250HA & Ice Bin B55PS

Manufacturer: Ice-O-Matic - Item: ICE0400HA & Ice Bin B55PS

15
Convection Steamer - Electric, 

Two  Compartment, Pressure-less
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Southbend  - Item: ECX-10S

Manufacturer: Vulcan - Item: C24EA10-BSC

20 Heated Cabinet - Pass Thru FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Victory - Item: HAS-1D-S1-PT

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: DL1W-SA-PT

21
Mobile Self-Contained Frost 

Top Serving Counter
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

18
Refrigerated Cabinet - Pass 

Thru
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: 1R-SA-PT

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: 1RE-PT

19
Self-Contained Solid Door 

Heated Pass-Thru
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Traulsen - Item: G14312P

Manufacturer: Traulsen - Item: RHF132WP‐FHS

26 Mobile All Purpose Counters FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

27
Countertop Cooler - Lighted 

Sign
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

24
Mobile Cashier's Counter, 50 

inches
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

25
Mobile Heated Serving 

Counters
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

22
Mobile Cashier's Counter, 30 

inches
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

23
Mobile Cashier's Counter, 36 

inches
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Lead Time (Business Days)

Lead Time (Business Days)

Lead Time (Business Days)

Lead Time (Business Days)

Lead Time (Business Days)

Lead Time (Business Days) 30

Lead Time (Business Days)

Vender Item #

25

795.00$               

Lead Time (Business Days)

928.76$               

Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days)

No Bid

578.77$               650.00$               

Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days) 25

4,924.42$            4,200.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days) 25

2,499.54$            2,132.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days) 25

2,341.19$            1,998.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days)

No Bid

Lead Time (Business Days) 20

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

5,175.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days) 25

4,800.00$            

4,200.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 20

9,350.45$            

3,503.60$            

7,376.85$            

6,221.00$            

11,341.10$           

1,875.00$            

25

Lead Time (Business Days) 25

4,289.96$            

4,799.55$            4,285.00$            

6,537.23$            5,300.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days)

Lead Time (Business Days) 25

3,473.43$            2,963.00$            

2,197.61$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 25

Lead Time (Business Days) 25

Lead Time (Business Days) 25

Lead Time (Business Days) 20

Lead Time (Business Days) 15

Lead Time (Business Days) 20

Vender Item # Vender Item #

Lead Time (Business Days) 7

4,298.70$            3,552.00$            

3,250.31$            3,259.00$            

15 Lead Time (Business Days) 25

13,500.00$          14,529.92$          14,194.00$          

Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days)

8,000.00$            

23,860.45$           

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

5,379.00$            

6,757.00$            

8,323.00$            

15 Lead Time (Business Days) 25

10

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

10

Lead Time (Business Days) 30

30

Lead Time (Business Days)

Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days)

30 Lead Time (Business Days)

Lead Time (Business Days)

10

4,400.00$            

3,600.00$            

No Bid

No Bid

Vender Item #

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

10

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

7,833.50$            

Lead Time (Business Days)

15,339.35$           

10

10

8,287.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days)

Lead Time (Business Days)

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

585.00$               

BOE Mtg.:  10.14.15

http://www.clevelandrange.com/products/cook/steamers/convection/convection-10-pan-models/electric/24cea10-steamcraft-ultra-10-with-electric-generator
https://my.vulcanfeg.com/resourcecenter/vulcanwolfberkel/ProductDocumentation/F32434.pdf
http://www.manitowocice.com/products/ice-beverage/cubers/modular-air-and-water/air-cooled/indigo-series-0300-ice-cube-machine
http://www.manitowocice.com/asset/?id=ehaia
http://www.truemfg.com/catalog.aspx?language_id=1&event_id=401&categoryId=2017&productName=STA1RPT-1S-1S
http://www.delfield.com/products/hold-merchandise/warmers/cabinet-warming/sshpt-sahpt-smhpt-s-sh-specification-line
http://www.truemfg.com/catalog.aspx?language_id=1&event_id=401&categoryId=2224&productName=STA1HPT-1S-1S
http://www.delfield.com/products/hold-merchandise/buffet-equipment/scft-nu-shelleysteel
http://www.delfield.com/products/hold-merchandise/buffet-equipment/scs-shelleysteel
http://www.delfield.com/products/hold-merchandise/buffet-equipment/scs-shelleysteel
http://www.delfield.com/products/hold-merchandise/buffet-equipment/scs-shelleysteel
http://www.delfield.com/products/hold-merchandise/buffet-equipment/sh-sh-nu-shelleysteel
http://www.delfield.com/products/hold-merchandise/buffet-equipment/sc-sc-nu-shelleysteel
https://www.google.com/url?sa=t&rct=j&q=&esrc=s&source=web&cd=12&ved=0CCMQFjABOApqFQoTCJKqwsj2oMcCFUWTHgodWE4Hyg&url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.thepopcornmachine.com%2Fimage%2Fdata%2Fexcellence%2FSC.pdf&ei=hNzJVZLYDcWmeticndAM&usg=AFQjCNGf4_Ryt50YokCuwnskWGONIxEbBg


BID 16FS1, KITCHEN EQUIPMENT

BID TABULATION

DESCRIPTION Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit PriceSPECIFICATION INFORMATION

1
Convection Steamer - Electric, 

Boilerless, 2 Double Stacked Unit
14,500.00$          

VENDOR NAME:  VENDOR NAME:  VENDOR NAME:

11400, Inc. Acme Paper and Supply Co. Ashland Equipment, Inc.

14,420.70$          13,441.00$          

VENDOR NAME:

Big Plate Tech, LLC

19,043.75$           
DESCRIPTION Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Manufacturer Accutemp Manufacturer Groen Manufacturer Accutemp Manufacturer Groen Manufacturer Groen

Manufacturer Item # E64803E140DBL Manufacturer Item # 2SSB-SEF Manufacturer Item # E64803E140DBL Manufacturer Item # 2SSB-SEF Manufacturer Item # XS-480-12-3

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # XS-480-12-3

Manufacturer Garland/US Range Manufacturer Blodgett Manufacturer Garland Manufacturer Blodgett Manufacturer Garland/US Range

Manufacturer Item # SCO-ES-20S Manufacturer Item # SHO-100-E DBL Manufacturer Item # SCO-ES-20S Manufacturer Item # SHO-100-E DBL Manufacturer Item # SCO-ES-20S

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # SCO-ES-20S

Manufacturer Garland/US Range Manufacturer Blodgett Manufacturer Garland Manufacturer Blodgett Manufacturer Garland/US Range 

Manufacturer Item # SCO-ES-10S Manufacturer Item # SHO-100-E SGL Manufacturer Item # SCO-ES-10S Manufacturer Item # SHO-100-E SGL Manufacturer Item # SCO-ES-10S

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # SCO-ES-10S

Manufacturer Vulcan Manufacturer BLODGETT Manufacturer Vulcan Manufacturer Blodgett Manufacturer Rational

Manufacturer Item # ABC7E-480 Manufacturer Item # BX-14E SGL Manufacturer Item # ABC7E-480 Manufacturer Item # BX-14E SGL Manufacturer Item # A629106.43.202

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # A629106.43.202

Manufacturer Blodgett Manufacturer BLODGETT Manufacturer Blodgett Manufacturer BLODGETT Manufacturer Garland/US Range

Manufacturer Item # HV-100E Double Manufacturer Item # HV-100E DOUBLE Manufacturer Item # HV-100E Double Manufacturer Item # HV-100E DOUBLE Manufacturer Item # MP-ES-20-S

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # MP-ES-20-S

Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) 30

Manufacturer True Manufacturer Manufacturer True Manufacturer TRUE Manufacturer True 

Manufacturer Item # TFM-41FL Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # TFM-41FL Manufacturer Item # TFM-41FL Manufacturer Item # TFM-41FL

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # TFM-41FL

Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days) 30

Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator Manufacturer Manufacturer Turbo Air Manufacturer Hoshizaki Manufacturer Hoshizaki

Manufacturer Item # DL2F-SS Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # M3F47-2 Manufacturer Item # CF2S-FS Manufacturer Item # CF2S-FS

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # 01590CF2BFS

Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator Manufacturer Manufacturer Turbo Air Manufacturer Hoshizaki Manufacturer Hoshizaki

Manufacturer Item # DL2R-SS Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # M3R47-3 Manufacturer Item # CR2S-FS Manufacturer Item # CR2S-FS

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # 01580CR2BFS

Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator Manufacturer Manufacturer Turbo Air Manufacturer Hoshizaki Manufacturer Hoshizaki

Manufacturer Item # DL1R-SS Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # M2R24-1 Manufacturer Item # CRIS-FS Manufacturer Item # CRIS-FS

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # 01580CR1BFS

Mobile Pan Rack Manufacturer Regency Manufacturer Manufacturer John Boos Manufacturer Manufacturer John Boos

Manufacturer Item # 600PR203W (Fully Assembled) Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # ABPR-1820-RKD-X Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # ABPR-1820-RKD-X

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # ABPR-1820-RKD-X

Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 10 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 30

Manufacturer Beverage - Air Manufacturer Bev Air Manufacturer Beverage - Air Manufacturer Beverage - Air Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator

Manufacturer Item # ST34N - S Manufacturer Item # ST34N-S Manufacturer Item # ST34N - S Manufacturer Item # ST34N - S Manufacturer Item # MC3-SS-DCW

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # MC3-SS-DCW

Manufacturer Beverage - Air Manufacturer Bev Air Manufacturer Beverage - Air Manufacturer Beverage - Air Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator

Manufacturer Item # ST49N - S Manufacturer Item # ST49N-S Manufacturer Item # ST49N - S Manufacturer Item # ST49N - S Manufacturer Item # MC4-SS-DCW

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # MC4-SS-DCW

Manufacturer Beverage - Air Manufacturer Bev Air Manufacturer Beverage - Air Manufacturer Beverage - Air Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator

Manufacturer Item # ST58N - S Manufacturer Item # ST58N-S Manufacturer Item # ST58N - S Manufacturer Item # ST58N - S Manufacturer Item # MC5-SS-DCW

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # MC5-SS-DCW

Manufacturer Cleveland Ultra 10 Manufacturer Manufacturer Cleveland Ultra 10 Manufacturer Groen Manufacturer Southbend

Manufacturer Item # 24-CGA-10 Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # 24-CGA-10 Manufacturer Item # HY-5GF Manufacturer Item # GSX-10HE

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # GSX-10HE

VENDOR NAME:  VENDOR NAME:  VENDOR NAME: VENDOR NAME:

SPECIFICATION INFORMATION Carey Sales Douglas Food Stores, Inc. My Three Sons Inc. Singer Equipment Company Inc.

14,175.66$          

Lead Time (Business Days) 15

3,090.00$            

5,780.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 15

18,988.00$          

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

Lead Time (Business Days)

No Bid

No Bid

Lead Time (Business Days)

2,745.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

2,471.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

No Bid

Lead Time (Business Days)

No Bid

Lead Time (Business Days)

2,999.00$            

No Bid

2 Convection Oven - Double FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Southbend - Item: SLES/20SC

Manufacturer: Vulcan - Item: VC44ED

3
Convection Oven – Single, 

Electric
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Southbend - Item: SLES/10SC

Manufacturer: Vulcan - Item: VC4ED

1
Convection Steamer - Electric, 

Boilerless, 2 Double Stacked Unit
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Groen - Item: XS-480-12-3

Manufacturer: Cleveland - Item: 22CET66.1

6 Self-Service Freezer - Glass Top 
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

7
Reach-In Freezer -  Two Door, 

Self Contained
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Turbo Air - Item: PRO-50F

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: DL2F-SS

4
Combi Oven Steamer - Electric, 

Boilerless

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

12
Milk Cooler - Dual Access, Cold 

Wall, 12 case capacity 
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: MC4-SS-DCW

Manufacturer: Traulsen - Item: RMC49D4

13
Milk Cooler - Dual Access, Cold 

Wall, 16 case capacity 
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: MC5-SS-DCW

Manufacturer: Traulsen - Item: RMC58D4

FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Rational - Item: A629106.43.202

Manufacturer: Convotherm - Item: C4 ET 6.20ES

5
Hydrovection Oven - Full-Size, 

Mobile, Electric FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Garland/US Range - Item: MP-ES-20-S

10
Mobile Transport Pan Rack - 

Fully Assembled FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: John Boos - Item: ABPR-1820-RKD-X

11
Milk Cooler - Dual Access, Cold 

Wall, 8 case capacity 
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: MC3-SS-DCW

Manufacturer: Traulsen - Item: RMC34D4

8
Reach-In Refrigerator -  One 

Door, Self Contained
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Turbo Air - Item: PRO-50R

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: DL2R-SS

9
Reach-In Refrigerator -  One 

Door, Self Contained
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Turbo Air - Item: PRO-26R

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: DL1R-SS

14
Convection Steamer - Gas, Two  

Compartment, Pressure-less
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Southbend - Item: GSX-10HE

Manufacturer: Southbend - Item: GCX-10S

12,901.96$           

Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) 30

5,105.25$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days) 21 Lead Time (Business Days) 30

16,627.22$          14,840.00$          

2,826.63$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days) 21 Lead Time (Business Days) 30

5,170.80$            5,470.00$            

9,688.74$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) 30

2,981.36$            2,860.00$            

1,147.77$            

16,300.65$          12,400.00$          12,144.70$          

3,398.52$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 8 Lead Time (Business Days) 14 Lead Time (Business Days) 15

19,597.55$          19,200.00$          

Lead Time (Business Days) 25

18,567.82$           

1,618.16$            1,474.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 15

2,597.94$            2,840.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 15

3,174.75$            3,655.00$            

540.15$               No Bid 356.74$               

2,582.83$            2,275.00$            2,606.61$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 30

1,845.97$            2,175.00$            2,045.18$            

Lead Time (Business Days)

2,640.09$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 8

Lead Time (Business Days) 8

Lead Time (Business Days) 30

2,578.51$            2,535.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 7 Lead Time (Business Days) 20 Lead Time (Business Days) 30

Lead Time (Business Days) 7 Lead Time (Business Days) 20

11,348.94$           

Lead Time (Business Days) 25 Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) 30

2,815.23$            2,778.00$            3,230.70$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 7 Lead Time (Business Days) 20

2,901.18$            

14,370.00$          No Bid 13,999.78$          

BOE Mtg.:  10.14.15

http://www.accutemp.net/_service/downloadFile.ashx?fileid=fa85e9b7-5686-4947-83cf-f7b588a08216
http://www.garland-group.com/asset/?id=nffje
http://www.garland-group.com/asset/?id=nffje
https://my.vulcanfeg.com/resourcecenter/vulcanwolfberkel/ProductDocumentation/F47103.pdf
http://www.blodgett.com/wp-content/uploads/HV-100E-spec.pdf
http://www.truemfg.com/catalog.aspx?language_id=1&event_id=401&from=food&criteria=TFM-41FL
http://www.continentalrefrigerator.com/specsheets/DL2F,070915.pdf
http://www.continentalrefrigerator.com/specsheets/DL2R,100814.pdf
http://www.continentalrefrigerator.com/specsheets/DL1R,082713.pdf
http://cdnimg.webstaurantstore.com/documents/specsheets/regency_bunpanracks.pdf
http://www.beverage-air.com/uploadedFiles/docs/ST Series.pdf
http://www.beverage-air.com/uploadedFiles/docs/ST Series.pdf
http://www.beverage-air.com/uploadedFiles/docs/ST Series.pdf
http://www.clevelandrange.com/products/cook/steamers/convection/convection-10-pan-models/gas/24cga10-steamcraft-ultra-10-with-gas-generator


BID 16FS1, KITCHEN EQUIPMENT

BID TABULATION

DESCRIPTION Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit PriceSPECIFICATION INFORMATION

1
Convection Steamer - Electric, 

Boilerless, 2 Double Stacked Unit
14,500.00$          

VENDOR NAME:  VENDOR NAME:  VENDOR NAME:

11400, Inc. Acme Paper and Supply Co. Ashland Equipment, Inc.

14,420.70$          13,441.00$          

VENDOR NAME:

Big Plate Tech, LLC

19,043.75$           

Manufacturer Cleveland Ultra 10 Manufacturer Manufacturer Cleveland Ultra 10 Manufacturer Groen Manufacturer Vulcan

Manufacturer Item # 24-CEA-10 Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # 24-CEA-10 Manufacturer Item # HY-5EF Manufacturer Item # C24EA10-BSC

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # C24EA10-BSC

Manufacturer Vulcan Manufacturer Blodgett Manufacturer Vulcan Manufacturer Blodgett Manufacturer Vulcan

Manufacturer Item # VC44GD Manufacturer Item # SHO-100-G DBL Manufacturer Item # VC44GD Manufacturer Item # SHO-100-G DBL Manufacturer Item # VC44GD 

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # VC44GD 

Manufacturer Manitowoc Manufacturer Manufacturer Manitowoc Manufacturer Manitowoc Manufacturer Ice-O-Matic

Manufacturer Item #  IY-0304 Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item #  IY-0304 & B-570 Manufacturer Item #  IY-0304 & B-570 Manufacturer Item # ICE0250HA & Ice Bin B55PS

Manufacturer Item #  B-570 

Manufacturer True Food Service Equipment Manufacturer Manufacturer True Food Service Equipment Manufacturer True Food Service Equipment Manufacturer Continental Refrigerator

Manufacturer Item # STA1RPT-1S-1S Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # STA1RPT-1S-1S Manufacturer Item # STA1RPT-1S-1S Manufacturer Item # 1RE-PT

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # 1RE-PT

Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Traulsen

Manufacturer Item # SMHPT1-S Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SMHPT1-S Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # G14312P

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # G14312P

Manufacturer True Food Service Equipment Manufacturer Victory Manufacturer True Food Service Equipment Manufacturer True Food Service Equipment Manufacturer Victory

Manufacturer Item # STA1HPT-1S-1S Manufacturer Item # HAS-1D-S1-PT Manufacturer Item # STA1HPT-1S-1S Manufacturer Item # STA1HPT-1S-1S Manufacturer Item # HAS-1D-S1-PT

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # HAS-1D-S1-PT

Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield

Manufacturer Item # SCFT-50- NU Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SCFT-50- NU Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SCFT-50- NU

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # SCFT-50- NU

Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield 

Manufacturer Item # SCS-30 Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SCS-30 Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SCS-30

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # SCS-30

Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield

Manufacturer Item # SCS-36 Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SCS-36 Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SCS-36

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # SCS-36

Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield 

Manufacturer Item # SCS-50 Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SCS-50 Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SCS-50 

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # SCS-50 

Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield

Manufacturer Item # SH-5-NU Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SH-5-NU Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SH-5-NU

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # SH-5-NU

Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield Manufacturer Manufacturer Delfield

Manufacturer Item # SC-28-NU Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SC-28-NU Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SC-28-NU

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # SC-28-NU

Manufacturer Excellence Manufacturer Manufacturer Excellence Manufacturer Manufacturer

Manufacturer Item # SC-52 Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item # SC-52 Manufacturer Item # Manufacturer Item #

Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item # Vender Item #

Convection Oven - Double Deck, 

Gas
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Southbend - Item: KLGS/27SC

Manufacturer: Garland/US Range - Item: MCO-GS-20-S

17

Ice Maker with Ice Storage Bin 

– Low Profile, Compact, Cube 

Style
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Ice-O-Matic - Item: ICE0250HA & Ice Bin B55PS

Manufacturer: Ice-O-Matic - Item: ICE0400HA & Ice Bin B55PS

15
Convection Steamer - Electric, 

Two  Compartment, Pressure-less
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Southbend  - Item: ECX-10S

Manufacturer: Vulcan - Item: C24EA10-BSC

27
Countertop Cooler - Lighted 

Sign
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

24
Mobile Cashier's Counter, 50 

inches
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

25
Mobile Heated Serving 

Counters
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

26 Mobile All Purpose Counters FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

22
Mobile Cashier's Counter, 30 

inches
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

23
Mobile Cashier's Counter, 36 

inches
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

20 Heated Cabinet - Pass Thru FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Victory - Item: HAS-1D-S1-PT

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: DL1W-SA-PT

21
Mobile Self-Contained Frost 

Top Serving Counter
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

18
Refrigerated Cabinet - Pass 

Thru
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: 1R-SA-PT

Manufacturer: Continental Refrigerator - Item: 1RE-PT

19
Self-Contained Solid Door 

Heated Pass-Thru
FCPS Approved Alternate Manufacturer and Item #: 

Manufacturer: Traulsen - Item: G14312P

Manufacturer: Traulsen - Item: RHF132WP‐FHS

16

Lead Time (Business Days) 10 Lead Time (Business Days) 20

No Bid

Lead Time (Business Days)

6,014.90$            

Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 30

14,872.74$          13,885.00$          

5,280.00$            

Vender Item # ICE0250HA & Ice Bin B55PS

12,521.87$           

Lead Time (Business Days) 25 Lead Time (Business Days)

6,633.00$            5,460.00$            

30

Lead Time (Business Days) 30

4,692.11$            No Bid

Vender Item #
3,591.35$            3,670.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 30

4,442.57$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days) 21

3,761.35$            

Lead Time (Business Days)

15

Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 30

Vender Item #

Lead Time (Business Days) 7 Lead Time (Business Days)

3,956.62$            

30

5,072.47$            5,275.00$            

3,431.34$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 30

4,897.62$            5,072.00$            

14

30

2,971.03$            No Bid

Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 30

4,774.50$            No Bid

No Bid

Lead Time (Business Days)

Lead Time (Business Days) 30

3,099.12$            No Bid

No Bid

Lead Time (Business Days)

No Bid

Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days)

5,462.00$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 10

Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days) 21

No Bid

Lead Time (Business Days)

15

15

Lead Time (Business Days) 15 Lead Time (Business Days)

Lead Time (Business Days)

No Bid

Lead Time (Business Days)

No Bid

Lead Time (Business Days)

No Bid

Lead Time (Business Days)

Lead Time (Business Days)

Lead Time (Business Days)

No Bid
Vender Item #

No Bid

Lead Time (Business Days)

1,100.66$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days)

4,760.32$            

Lead Time (Business Days)

Lead Time (Business Days) 30

7,953.01$            No Bid

No Bid

Lead Time (Business Days)

755.51$               No Bid

30

No Bid

Lead Time (Business Days) 30 Lead Time (Business Days) Lead Time (Business Days)

1,754.49$            No Bid

2,539.35$            

3,287.25$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 30

3,315.62$            No Bid

2,394.32$            

Lead Time (Business Days) 30

Lead Time (Business Days)

2,262.81$            

Lead Time (Business Days)

BOE Mtg.:  10.14.15

http://www.clevelandrange.com/products/cook/steamers/convection/convection-10-pan-models/electric/24cea10-steamcraft-ultra-10-with-electric-generator
https://my.vulcanfeg.com/resourcecenter/vulcanwolfberkel/ProductDocumentation/F32434.pdf
http://www.manitowocice.com/products/ice-beverage/cubers/modular-air-and-water/air-cooled/indigo-series-0300-ice-cube-machine
http://www.manitowocice.com/asset/?id=ehaia
http://www.truemfg.com/catalog.aspx?language_id=1&event_id=401&categoryId=2017&productName=STA1RPT-1S-1S
http://www.delfield.com/products/hold-merchandise/warmers/cabinet-warming/sshpt-sahpt-smhpt-s-sh-specification-line
http://www.truemfg.com/catalog.aspx?language_id=1&event_id=401&categoryId=2224&productName=STA1HPT-1S-1S
http://www.delfield.com/products/hold-merchandise/buffet-equipment/scft-nu-shelleysteel
http://www.delfield.com/products/hold-merchandise/buffet-equipment/scs-shelleysteel
http://www.delfield.com/products/hold-merchandise/buffet-equipment/scs-shelleysteel
http://www.delfield.com/products/hold-merchandise/buffet-equipment/scs-shelleysteel
http://www.delfield.com/products/hold-merchandise/buffet-equipment/sh-sh-nu-shelleysteel
http://www.delfield.com/products/hold-merchandise/buffet-equipment/sc-sc-nu-shelleysteel
https://www.google.com/url?sa=t&rct=j&q=&esrc=s&source=web&cd=12&ved=0CCMQFjABOApqFQoTCJKqwsj2oMcCFUWTHgodWE4Hyg&url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.thepopcornmachine.com%2Fimage%2Fdata%2Fexcellence%2FSC.pdf&ei=hNzJVZLYDcWmeticndAM&usg=AFQjCNGf4_Ryt50YokCuwnskWGONIxEbBg

