
BID 14T1 
VEHICLE PARTS - MISCELLANEOUS 

 
FACT SHEET 

 
A. Overview:  This recommendation is to establish a contract for the purchase of vehicle parts for Bluebird 

buses and all transmissions to be utilized by the Transportation Department for Frederick County Public 
Schools.  Items from this bid will be purchased on an “as needed” basis.  Bids were opened on July 22, 
2013.    

 
1. Bid participation: 

 

  79 companies notified 
    5 companies submitted a bid 
    6 companies submitted a “no bid” response 

 
2. Bids were received from: 

 
Beltway Companies LLC (Baltimore, MD) 
I. G. Burton & Co., Inc. (Milford, DE) 

Jasper Engines Exchange Inc. (Jasper, IN) 
* K. Neal International Trucks Inc. (Hyattsville, MD) 
Transaxle LLC (Baltimore, MD) 

 
* Minority Business Enterprise Information 

  
 3. Other facts: 

 
 This contract shall be effective from date of award through May 31, 2014, with two additional 

two-year renewal options available. 
 

 These items were rebid from Bid 13T6, Vehicle Parts and Supplies per previous 
recommendation. 
 

 Multiple vendors are recommended for award to allow the Transportation Department flexibility 
when placing orders in a timely fashion. 
 

 This contract will be administered by Mark Maggitti, Fleet Maintenance Manager.  
 
4. Source of funding:  FY14 Approved Operating Budget. 
 

 
B.  Recommendation:  The Facilities and Finance Committee recommends that the Bid 14T1, Vehicle 

Parts – Miscellaneous, be awarded per the attached Summary of Award. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
C. Action taken by the Board (Purchasing use only): 

   
 _____ Approved          _____Denied       _____Deferred          _____Other       BM/kp 
 
 ___  _Date                  _____Date     _____Date                _____Date        BOE Mtg.:  08.14.13 
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BID 14T1
VEHICLE PARTS - MISCELLANEOUS

SECTION I
SUMMARY OF AWARD

I. G. 
BURTON & 
CO., INC. 

JASPER 
ENGINE 

EXCHANGE, 
INC.

TRANSAXLE 
LLC

1.3.1        ITEM 1:  OEM Parts and Accessories

 1.3.1.5  New OEM factory replacement parts and                      

accessories for Blue Bird school bus products

a.  Automotive parts and accessories
Percentage mark-up over vendor’s cost: 32% NO BID 20%

b.  Light-duty truck parts and accessories
Percentage mark-up over vendor’s cost: 32% NO BID 20%

c.  Medium-duty truck parts and accessories
Percentage mark-up over vendor’s cost: 32% NO BID 20%

d.  School bus parts and accessories
Percentage mark-up over vendor’s cost: 32% NO BID 20%

BOE Mtg.:  08.14.13
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BID 14T1
VEHICLE PARTS - MISCELLANEOUS

SECTION II
SUMMARY OF AWARD

ITEM DESCRIPTION MFG/PART#
MANUFACTURER 

NAME UNIT PRICE
MANUFACTURER 

NAME  UNIT PRICE 
MANUFACTURER 

NAME UNIT PRICE
MANUFACTURER 

NAME UNIT PRICE
TRANSMISSION A54XRPX29537852 Alma/Navistar 1,343.76$      ATR 955.80$                   Genuine Allison 1,311.72$      
TRANSMISSION A54XSPX29514624 Alma/Navistar 1,343.76$      ATR 955.80$                   Genuine Allison 1,311.72$      
TRANSMISSION ETX200029538980 Alma/Navistar 1,343.76$      ATR 1,853.19$                Genuine Allison 2,365.38$      
TRANSMISSION C29508634RMCR Alma/Navistar 1,343.76$      ATR 955.80$                   Genuine Allison 1,311.72$      
TRANSMISSION A20SXX29538001 Alma/Navistar 2,570.53$      ATR 1,853.19$                Genuine Allison 2,365.38$      
TRANSMISSION 29508634 Alma/Navistar 1,343.76$      JASPER  1,633.00$      ATR 955.80$                   Genuine Allison 1,311.72$      
TRANSMISSION 29514635 Alma/Navistar N/A ATR 955.80$                   Genuine Allison 1,311.72$      
TRANSMISSION 29537850 Alma/Navistar 1,343.76$      ATR 955.80$                   Genuine Allison 1,311.72$      
TRANSMISSION 29537832 Alma/Navistar 1,343.76$      ATR 955.80$                   Genuine Allison 1,311.72$      
TRANSMISSION 29538980 Alma/Navistar 1,343.76$      JASPER 2,243.00$      ATR 1,853.19$                Genuine Allison 2,365.38$      
TRANSMISSION C29508634RMCR Alma/Navistar 1,343.76$      ATR 955.80$                   Genuine Allison 1,311.72$      
TRANSMISSION A205XX29538980 Alma/Navistar 1,343.76$      ATR 1,853.19$                Genuine Allison 2,365.38$      
TRANSMISSION D29537844NP Alma/Navistar 1,343.76$      ATR 955.80$                   Genuine Allison 1,311.72$      
TRANSMISSION A54XSXX2951462 Alma/Navistar 1,343.76$      ATR 955.80$                   Genuine Allison 1,311.72$      
TRANSMISSION 29507181 Alma/Navistar 1,343.76$      JASPER 1,633.00$      ATR 955.80$                   Genuine Allison 1,311.72$      
TRANSMISSION 29514986 N/A JASPER 2,692.00$      ATR 1,486.80$                Genuine Allison 2,006.34$      
TRANSMISSION 29514623 Alma/Navistar 1,343.76$      JASPER 1,633.00$      ATR 955.80$                   Genuine Allison 1,311.72$      
TRANSMISSION 29542636 N/A JASPER 2,243.00$      ATR 1,938.15$                Genuine Allison 2,365.38$      
TRANSMISSION 29544740 N/A JASPER 2,243.00$      ATR 1,938.15$                Genuine Allison 2,365.38$      
TRANSMISSION 29537844 Alma/Navistar 1,343.76$      JASPER 1,633.00$      ATR 955.80$                   Genuine Allison 1,311.72$      
TRANSMISSION JE004647 N/A ATR 1,938.15$                Genuine Allison 1,311.72$      

TOTAL: 22,726.93$    TOTAL: 15,953.00$    TOTAL: 27,139.41$              TOTAL: 34,562.70$    

PERCENTAGE 

ABOVE COST: 20%
PERCENTAGE 

ABOVE COST: 13%
PERCENTAGE 

ABOVE COST: 18%
PERCENTAGE 

ABOVE COST: 20%
TOWING COST: 175.00$       TOWING COST: TOWING COST: NO CHARGE TOWING COST: 495.00$       

TRANSAXLE LLCBELTWAY COMPANIES LLC. JASPER ENGINE EXCHANGE, INC.

K. NEAL INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS, 

INC.
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